TITLE: Approve Vendor DATE: April 22, 2014
Recommendation for Awarding the
RFP for Weed Control and Fertilization

PROPOSAL RECOMMENDATION

BACKGROUND:

We request that the MISD Board of Trustees approve the recommendation as made by
the Purchasing Department, in conjunction with the Maintenance Department, for
awarding the proposal for Weed Control and Fertilization. Completed proposals were
received for RFP #14-035 prior to the RFP's closing on March 26, 2014.

CONSIDERATIONS:

The purpose of this RFP is to select a qualified vendor who can provide pre- and post-
emergent broadleaf weed control, grassy weed control and fertilization for the Mansfield
Independent School District. Weed control and fertilization shall be applied to the curb
appeal areas and irrigated areas of school campuses and other designated locations.
Pre- and post-emergent shall be applied once in the fall and once in the spring. Up to
two (2) applications of grassy weed control shall be applied in late spring. Fertilization
shall be done up to three times per year at the determination of the District.

Considerations include cost, overall experience, experience in servicing contracts of
similar size and scope, references, stability of company, past relationship with District,
guality and range of services proposed, and qualifications of assigned staff. The
recommended vendor has the highest rating based upon the factors specified in the
proposal.

Attached are the proposal tabulation and the rating schedule for this RFP. The contract
will be effective from May 1, 2014 through April 30, 2015, with the option to renew for
three additional one-year periods upon mutual consent of both the District and the
awarded contractor.

RECOMMENDATION:
The Purchasing Department, in conjunction with the Maintenance Department,

recommends that the RFP for Weed Control and Fertilization be awarded to Weed
Solutions, Inc., as shown on the tabulation and rating scale.



14-030 RFP 14-030
Rating Schedule

VENDORS>>>>> GCA Services Sports_ Field Truegreen LP Weed Solutions,

Group Solutions Inc.
POINT

EVALUATION CRITERIA VALUE

T(_)tal_ long-term cost to the 30 11.2 6.8 14.6 30

District

Overall experience, reputation,

expertise, stability and financial 20 20 20 20 20

responsibility

Quality and range of services 10 10 10 10 10

proposed to provide

Extent to which goods and/or

services meet the District's 10 10 10 10 10

needs

V(_ano_lor s past relationship with 5 3 0 5 0

District

Experience and qualifications of

staff assigned to service 5 5 5 5 5

District's account

Ab|||ty_to provide service in 10 10 10 10 10

expedient and efficient manner

Successfully completed a weed

control and f_ert_lllzat_lon service 10 10 10 10 5

contract of similar size and

scope to specs herein

Total Points 100 79.2 71.8 84.6 90




RFP #14-035
Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> GCA Services Group
L Spring Pre- Spring Post- Dry Grassy Weed Fall Pre-Emergent| Fall Post-Emergent
Description Emergent Weed Emergent Weed T Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Sixth Avenue Transportation $71.87 $71.87 $182.95 $372.44 $79.06 $71.87
Administration Building $60.50 $60.50 $154.00 $313.50 $66.55 $60.50
Alternative Education Complex $47.92 $47.92 $121.97 $248.29 $52.71 $47.92
Alice Ponder Elementary $25.94 $25.94 $66.04 $134.43 $28.54 $25.94
Anna Mae Daulton Elementary $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Annette Perry Elementary $287.50 $287.50 $731.81 $1,489.75 $316.25 $287.50
Asa Low Intermediate School $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Athletics Complex $143.00 $143.00 $364.00 $741.00 $157.30 $143.00
Ben Barber Career Tech $110.00 $110.00 $280.00 $570.00 $121.00 $110.00
Brooks Wester Middle School $91.42 $91.42 $232.69 $473.70 $100.56 $91.42
Carol Holt Elementary $271.26 $271.26 $690.48 $1,405.62 $298.39 $271.26
Charlotte Anderson Elementary $90.81 $90.81 $231.16 $470.57 $99.89 $90.81
Cora Spencer Elementary $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Cross Timbers Intermediate $100.89 $100.89 $256.82 $522.80 $110.98 $100.89
D.P. Morris Elementary $95.50 $95.50 $243.08 $494.85 $105.05 $95.50
Danny Jones Middle School $412.50 $412.50 $1,050.00 $2,137.50 $453.75 $412.50
Della Icenhower Intermediate $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Donna Shepard Intermediate $304.11 $304.11 $774.09 $1,575.83 $334.52 $304.11
Elizabeth Smith Elementary $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Erma Nash Elementary $239.58 $239.58 $609.84 $1,241.46 $263.54 $239.58
Glenn Harmon Elementary $74.36 $74.46 $189.55 $385.85 $81.91 $74.36
Imogene Gideon Elementary $162.45 $162.45 $413.51 $841.79 $178.70 $162.45
J.L. Boren Elementary $291.50 $291.50 $742.00 $1,510.50 $320.65 $291.50
James Coble Middle School $412.50 $412.50 $1,050.00 $2,137.50 $453.75 $412.50
Janet Brockett Elementary $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Kenneth Davis Elementary $229.37 $229.37 $583.84 $1,188.53 $252.30 $229.37
|Legacy High School $465.98 $465.98 $1,186.14 $2,414.63 $512.58 $465.98
Lake Ridge High School $466.40 $466.40 $1,187.20 $2,416.80 $513.04 $466.40
Linda Jobe Middle School $412.50 $412.50 $1,050.00 $2,137.50 $453.75 $412.50
Louise Cabaniss Elementary $222.51 $222.51 $556.39 $1,153.01 $244.76 $222.51
Maintenance Complex $110.00 $110.00 $280.00 $570.00 $121.00 $110.00
Mansfield High School $405.48 $405.48 $1,032.12 $2,101.10 $446.02 $405.48
Martha Reid Elementary $143.00 $143.00 $364.00 $741.00 $157.30 $143.00
Mary Jo Sheppard Elementary $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Mary Lillard Intermediate $220.00 $220.00 $560.00 $1,140.00 $242.00 $220.00
Mary Orr Intermediate $235.09 $235.09 $598.40 $1,218.18 $258.60 $235.09
Nancy Neal Elementary $291.50 $291.50 $742.00 $1,510.50 $320.65 $291.50
Roberta Tipps Elementary $287.50 $287.50 $731.81 $1,489.75 $316.25 $287.50
Rogene Worley Middle School $182.94 $182.94 $465.66 $947.94 $201.23 $182.94
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RFP

#14-035

Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> GCA Services Group
L Spring Pre- Spring Post- Dry Grassy Weed Fall Pre-Emergent| Fall Post-Emergent
Description Emergent Weed Emergent Weed T Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Summit High School $465.98 $465.98 $1,186.14 $2,414.63 $512.58 $465.98
T.A. Howard Middle School $261.34 $261.34 $665.24 $1,354.23 $287.48 $261.34
Tarver Rendon Elementary $291.50 $291.50 $742.00 $1,510.50 $320.65 $291.50
Timberview High School $429.00 $429.00 $1,092.00 $2,223.00 $471.90 $429.00
Center for the Performing Arts $192.50 $192.50 $490.00 $997.50 $211.75 $192.50
Thelma Jones Elementary $335.41 $335.41 $853.78 $1,738.04 $368.95 $335.41
Danny Griffin Complex $95.83 $95.83 $243.94 $496.58 $105.42 $95.83
Willie Brown Elementary $134.11 $134.11 $341.36 $694.92 $147.52 $134.11
lgﬁlcféoﬂ' locations based on one $10,711.55 $10,711.65 $27,256.01 $55,505.72 $11,782.83 $10,711.55
GRAND TOTAL $126,679.31
Prodiamine 65 . . Pendulum Aqua .

Brand WDG Triplet SF Lesco 24-5-11 Tribute Total Cap Triplet SF
Ratio 1#/acre 55 oz/acre 180#/acre 3.2 oz/acre 55 oz/acre 55 oz/acre

Additional Information

3 Applications

Equipment

LT-Rich Max Ride on Fertilizer Spreader (2)

Requested Documents and exceptions
to RFP

W-9 dated 1/1/2012; license; no insurance acord; apology for last bid

Will you accept p-card for payment?

Yes

Interlocal

Yes

Blank Cell = No Bid
Present at opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Mark Williamson, Director of Maintenance

Jerry Nash, Custodial Manager
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RFP #14-035
Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> Sports Field Colutions
_ Spring Pre- Spring Post Dry Grassy W_eed Fall Pre Emergent [ Fall Post Emergent
Description Emergent Weed | Emergent Weed o Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Sixth Avenue Transportation $190.00 $158.00 $325.00 $392.00 $183.00 $153.00
Administration Building $159.00 $133.00 $274.00 $330.00 $154.00 $129.00
Alternative Education Complex $127.00 $105.00 $217.00 $261.00 $122.00 $102.00
Alice Ponder Elementary $69.00 $57.00 $117.00 $141.00 $66.00 $55.00
Anna Mae Daulton Elementary $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Annette Perry Elementary $758.00 $630.00 $1,300.00 $1,566.00 $730.00 $612.00
Asa Low Intermediate School $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Athletics Complex $377.00 $313.00 $646.00 $779.00 $363.00 $304.00
Ben Barber Career Tech $290.00 $241.00 $497.00 $599.00 $279.00 $234.00
Brooks Wester Middle School $241.00 $200.00 $413.00 $498.00 $232.00 $195.00
Carol Holt Elementary $715.00 $595.00 $1,226.00 $1,477.00 $688.00 $577.00
Charlotte Anderson Elementary $240.00 $200.00 $411.00 $495.00 $231.00 $193.00
Cora Spencer Elementary $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Cross Timbers Intermediate $266.00 $221.00 $456.00 $550.00 $256.00 $215.00
D.P. Morris Elementary $252.00 $210.00 $432.00 $520.00 $243.00 $203.00
Danny Jones Middle School $1,088.00 $904.00 $1,864.00 $2,246.00 $1,047.00 $878.00
Della Icenhower Intermediate $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Donna Shepard Intermediate $802.00 $667.00 $1,374.00 $1,656.00 $772.00 $647.00
Elizabeth Smith Elementary $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Erma Nash Elementary $632.00 $525.00 $1,083.00 $1,305.00 $608.00 $510.00
Glenn Harmon Elementary $196.00 $164.00 $337.00 $406.00 $189.00 $159.00
Imogene Gideon Elementary $428.00 $356.00 $734.00 $885.00 $412.00 $346.00
J.L. Boren Elementary $769.00 $639.00 $1,317.00 $1,587.00 $740.00 $621.00
James Coble Middle School $1,088.00 $904.00 $1,864.00 $2,246.00 $1,047.00 $878.00
Janet Brockett Elementary $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Kenneth Davis Elementary $605.00 $503.00 $1,037.00 $1,250.00 $582.00 $488.00
|Legacy High School $1,229.00 $1,021.00 $2,106.00 $2,538.00 $1,182.00 $991.00
Lake Ridge High School $1,230.00 $1,022.00 $2,108.00 $2,540.00 $1,183.00 $992.00
Linda Jobe Middle School $1,088.00 $904.00 $1,864.00 $2,246.00 $1,047.00 $878.00
Louise Cabaniss Elementary $587.00 $488.00 $1,006.00 $1,212.00 $565.00 $474.00
Maintenance Complex $290.00 $241.00 $497.00 $599.00 $279.00 $234.00
Mansfield High School $1,070.00 $889.00 $1,832.00 $2,208.00 $1,029.00 $863.00
Martha Reid Elementary $377.00 $314.00 $646.00 $779.00 $363.00 $304.00
Mary Jo Sheppard Elementary $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Mary Lillard Intermediate $580.00 $482.00 $994.00 $1,198.00 $558.00 $468.00
Mary Orr Intermediate $620.00 $515.00 $1,062.00 $1,280.00 $597.00 $500.00
Nancy Neal Elementary $770.00 $639.00 $1,317.00 $1,588.00 $740.00 $620.00
Roberta Tipps Elementary $758.00 $630.00 $1,300.00 $1,566.00 $730.00 $612.00
Rogene Worley Middle School $483.00 $401.00 $827.00 $996.00 $464.00 $390.00
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RFP #14-035
Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> Sports Field Colutions
_ Spring Pre- Spring Post Dry Grassy W_eed Fall Pre Emergent [ Fall Post Emergent
Description Emergent Weed | Emergent Weed o Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Summit High School $1,230.00 $1,021.00 $2,106.00 $2,538.00 $1,182.00 $992.00
T.A. Howard Middle School $690.00 $573.00 $1,181.00 $1,423.00 $663.00 $556.00
Tarver Rendon Elementary $770.00 $639.00 $1,317.00 $1,588.00 $740.00 $620.00
Timberview High School $1,131.00 $940.00 $1,939.00 $2,336.00 $1,089.00 $913.00
Center for the Performing Arts $508.00 $422.00 $870.00 $1,050.00 $489.00 $410.00
Thelma Jones Elementary $885.00 $735.00 $1,516.00 $1,827.00 $851.00 $714.00
Danny Griffin Complex $253.00 $210.00 $433.00 $522.00 $243.00 $204.00
Willie Brown Elementary $354.00 $294.00 $606.00 $731.00 $340.00 $286.00
lgﬁlcféoﬂ' locations based on one $28,255.00 $23,479.00 | $48,409.00 $58,340.00 $27,184.00 $22,796.00
GRAND TOTAL $208,463.00
Brand Prodiamine 4L End-Run 3-wa 25-10-15W/ | o8 TE TOTAL | Pendulum 3.3EC | Trimec 992 3-wa
Y |509% UFLEXX : y
Ratio 1 quart/acre 3 pints/acre 200 #/acre 2 oz/acre 4.8 pints/acre 3 pints/acre
Additional Information 1 application 1 application 3 Applications| 2 applications 1 application 1 aplication

Equipment

John Deere Sprayer (Progator 2013; John Deere Gator (2013)

Requested Documents and exceptions
to RFP

License, no insurance, W-9 dated 3/26/2014

Will you accept p-card for payment?

No

Interlocal

Yes

Blank Cell = No Bid
Present at opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Mark Williamson, Director of Maintenan

Jerry Nash, Custodial Manager
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RFP #14-035
Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> Truegreen LP
. Spring pre Spring Post Dry Grassy W_eed Fall Pre Emergent [ Fall Post Emergent
Description Emergent Weed Emergent Weed T Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Sixth Avenue Transportation $121.00 $128.00 $281.00 $121.00
Administration Building $102.00 $108.00 $237.00 $102.00
Alternative Education Complex $81.00 $86.00 $188.00 $81.00
Alice Ponder Elementary $44.00 $46.00 $102.00 $44.00
Anna Mae Daulton Elementary $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Annette Perry Elementary $485.00 $513.00 $1,125.00 $485.00
Asa Low Intermediate School $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Athletics Complex $241.00 $255.00 $560.00 $241.00
Ben Barber Career Tech $185.00 $196.00 $431.00 $185.00
Brooks Wester Middle School $154.00 $163.00 $358.00 $154.00
Carol Holt Elementary $457.00 $484.00 $1,062.00 $457.00
Charlotte Anderson Elementary $153.00 $162.00 $355.00 $153.00
Cora Spencer Elementary $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Cross Timbers Intermediate $170.00 $180.00 $395.00 $170.00
D.P. Morris Elementary $161.00 $170.00 $374.00 $161.00
Danny Jones Middle School $695.00 $736.00 $1,614.00 $695.00
Della Icenhower Intermediate $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Donna Shepard Intermediate $512.00 $543.00 $1,190.00 $512.00
Elizabeth Smith Elementary $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Erma Nash Elementary $404.00 $428.00 $938.00 $404.00
Glenn Harmon Elementary $125.00 $133.00 $291.00 $125.00
Imogene Gideon Elementary $274.00 $290.00 $636.00 $274.00
J.L. Boren Elementary $491.00 $520.00 $1,141.00 $491.00
James Coble Middle School $695.00 $736.00 $1,614.00 $695.00
Janet Brockett Elementary $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Kenneth Davis Elementary $387.00 $409.00 $898.00 $387.00
Legacy High School $785.00 $831.00 $1,824.00 $785.00
Lake Ridge High School $786.00 $832.00 $1,825.00 $786.00
Linda Jobe Middle School $695.00 $736.00 $1,614.00 $695.00
Louise Cabaniss Elementary $375.00 $397.00 $871.00 $375.00
Maintenance Complex $185.00 $196.00 $431.00 $185.00
Mansfield High School $683.00 $724.00 $1,587.00 $683.00
Martha Reid Elementary $241.00 $255.00 $560.00 $241.00
Mary Jo Sheppard Elementary $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Mary Lillard Intermediate $371.00 $393.00 $861.00 $371.00
Mary Orr Intermediate $396.00 $419.00 $920.00 $396.00
Nancy Neal Elementary $491.00 $520.00 $1,141.00 $491.00
Roberta Tipps Elementary $485.00 $513.00 $1,125.00 $485.00
|[Rogene Worley Middle School $308.00 $326.00 $716.00 $308.00
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RFP #14-035
Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> Truegreen LP
. Spring pre Spring Post Dry Grassy W_eed Fall Pre Emergent [ Fall Post Emergent
Description Emergent Weed Emergent Weed T Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Summit High School $785.00 $831.00 $1,824.00 $785.00
T.A. Howard Middle School $440.00 $466.00 $1,023.00 $440.00
Tarver Rendon Elementary $491.00 $520.00 $1,141.00 $491.00
Timberview High School $723.00 $765.00 $1,679.00 $723.00
Center for the Performing Arts $324.00 $343.00 $753.00 $324.00
Thelma Jones Elementary $565.00 $599.00 $1,313.00 $565.00
Danny Griffin Complex $162.00 $171.00 $375.00 $162.00
Willie Brown Elementary $226.00 $239.00 $525.00 $226.00
Total for all locations based on one $18,051.00 $0.00 $19,113.00 $41,925.00 $18,051.00 $0.00
application
GRAND TOTAL $97,140.00
. . Trugreen 33-3-6 . . .
Brand Barricade 4L Tri-Power 50% SRN Blend Tribute Total Princep Tri-power
Ratio 12 oz/acre 47.92 oz/acre 1#N/KSF 3.2 oz/acre 38.1 oz/acre 47.92 oz/acre
Minimum Label rate for
. . recommended

Additional Information o Dallas grass-

application rate affected areas

per Texas A&M

Equipment

3 International enclosed spray trucks, 3 spray reels & 300 gallon tanks, 2 John Deere turf tractors with turf tires, 2 pull-behind
PTO driven liquid applicators with 16" wide spray booms & 200-gallon tank capacity, 2 pull-behind PTO driven dry hoppers with
750-pound capacity, 2 John Deere Gators, all-wheel drive, with turf tires, 200-gallon tank & spray reel.

Requested Documents and exceptions
to RFP

W-9 dated 1/23/2014; License, no insurance acord. Will also treat all visible fire ant mounds with Maxforce Fire Ant bait at no

additional charge.

Will you accept p-card for payment?

Yes

Interlocal

Yes

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at opening:

Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Mark Williamson, Director of Maintenan
Jerry Nash, Custodial Manager
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RFP #14-035
Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> Weed Solutions, Inc.
_ Spring Pre Spring Post Dry Grassy Wged Fall Pre Emergent [ Fall Post Emergent
Description Emergent Weed Emergent Weed . Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Sixth Avenue Transportation $65.35 $65.35 $110.00 $200.00 $65.35 $65.35
Administration Building $55.00 $55.00 $100.00 $195.00 $55.00 $55.00
Alternative Education Complex $50.00 $50.00 $70.00 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00
Alice Ponder Elementary $48.00 $48.00 $50.00 $75.00 $48.00 $48.00
Anna Mae Daulton Elementary $150.00 $150.00 $225.00 $350.00 $150.00 $150.00
Annette Perry Elementary $165.00 $165.00 $250.00 $350.00 $165.00 $165.00
Asa Low Intermediate School $150.00 $150.00 $225.00 $350.00 $150.00 $150.00
Athletics Complex $100.00 $100.00 $120.00 $130.00 $100.00 $100.00
Ben Barber Career Tech $100.00 $100.00 $120.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00
Brooks Wester Middle School $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 $85.00
Carol Holt Elementary $165.00 $165.00 $250.00 $350.00 $165.00 $165.00
Charlotte Anderson Elementary $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 $85.00
Cora Spencer Elementary $150.00 $150.00 $225.00 $350.00 $150.00 $150.00
Cross Timbers Intermediate $90.00 $90.00 $80.00 $100.00 $90.00 $90.00
D.P. Morris Elementary $85.00 $85.00 $75.00 $95.00 $85.00 $85.00
Danny Jones Middle School $290.00 $290.00 $200.00 $300.00 $290.00 $290.00
Della Icenhower Intermediate $150.00 $150.00 $225.00 $350.00 $150.00 $150.00
Donna Shepard Intermediate $196.00 $196.00 $150.00 $200.00 $196.00 $196.00
Elizabeth Smith Elementary $150.00 $150.00 $225.00 $350.00 $150.00 $150.00
Erma Nash Elementary $175.00 $175.00 $225.00 $350.00 $175.00 $175.00
Glenn Harmon Elementary $67.00 $67.00 $100.00 $120.00 $67.00 $67.00
Imogene Gideon Elementary $114.00 $114.00 $114.00 $125.00 $114.00 $114.00
J.L. Boren Elementary $180.00 $180.00 $160.00 $200.00 $180.00 $180.00
James Coble Middle School $294.00 $294.00 $200.00 $200.00 $294.00 $294.00
Janet Brockett Elementary $150.00 $150.00 $225.00 $350.00 $150.00 $150.00
Kenneth Davis Elementary $156.00 $156.00 $230.00 $350.00 $156.00 $156.00
Legacy High School $323.00 $323.00 $250.00 $420.00 $323.00 $323.00
Lake Ridge High School $323.00 $323.00 $250.00 $420.00 $323.00 $323.00
Linda Jobe Middle School $294.00 $294.00 $200.00 $300.00 $294.00 $294.00
Louise Cabaniss Elementary $150.00 $150.00 $100.00 $200.00 $150.00 $150.00
Maintenance Complex $62.50 $62.50 $60.00 $100.00 $62.50 $62.50
Mansfield High School $276.50 $276.50 $150.00 $175.00 $276.50 $276.50
Martha Reid Elementary $101.50 $101.50 $85.00 $120.00 $101.50 $101.50
Mary Jo Sheppard Elementary $150.00 $150.00 $100.00 $200.00 $150.00 $150.00
Mary Lillard Intermediate $150.00 $150.00 $100.00 $200.00 $150.00 $150.00
Mary Orr Intermediate $184.00 $184.00 $100.00 $150.00 $184.00 $184.00
Nancy Neal Elementary $206.50 $206.50 $140.00 $210.00 $206.50 $206.50
Roberta Tipps Elementary $206.50 $206.50 $140.00 $210.00 $206.50 $206.50
Rogene Worley Middle School $123.50 $123.50 $100.00 $200.00 $123.50 $123.50
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RFP #14-035
Weed Control and Fertilization

Vendor>>>> Weed Solutions, Inc.
_ Spring Pre Spring Post Dry Grassy Wged Fall Pre Emergent [ Fall Post Emergent
Description Emergent Weed Emergent Weed . Control (Tribute
Fertilization Weed Control Weed Control
Control Control Total Only)
Summit High School $323.50 $323.50 $200.00 $300.00 $323.50 $323.50
T.A. Howard Middle School $179.00 $179.00 $120.00 $200.00 $179.00 $179.00
Tarver Rendon Elementary $206.50 $206.50 $140.00 $210.00 $206.50 $206.50
Timberview High School $316.00 $316.00 $200.00 $300.00 $316.00 $316.00
Center for the Performing Arts $126.00 $126.00 $85.00 $130.00 $126.00 $126.00
Thelma Jones Elementary $228.50 $228.50 $150.00 $200.00 $228.50 $228.50
Danny Griffin Complex $55.00 $55.00 $48.00 $65.00 $55.00 $55.00
Willie Brown Elementary $88.00 $88.00 $75.00 $100.00 $88.00 $88.00
lﬁﬁ'cgiﬂ' locations based on one $7,538.85 $7,538.85 $6,897.00 $10,200.00 $7,538.85 $7,538.85
GRAND TOTAL $47,252.40
HA Il Pendulum AquaCa
Brand Syngenta Barricade | Lesco Three-Way | Fertilizer with | Bayer Tribute Total mAquatap | o5 Three-Way
- (Pendimethalin)
4% iron
Ratio 0.83 0z/1000 sq.ft 0.9 0z/1000 sq.ft. 4'02?#)00 0.073 oz/gallon 1.6 0z/1000 sq.ft 0.9 0z/1000 sq.ft.
. . Surfactant will be Surfactant will be
Additional Information N/A added N/A added. Iron added. N/A Surfactant added.

Equipment

2004 Isuzu NPR; 2004 Isuzu NPR; 2008 John Deere Utility Sprayer; 2009 Perma Green Sprayer

Requested Documents and exceptions
to RFP

License; insurance acord; no W-9; no school contracts

Will you accept p-card for payment?

Yes

Interlocal

Yes

Blank Cell = No Bid

Present at opening:

Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Mark Williamson, Director of Maintenan
Jerry Nash, Custodial Manager
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