Employee Service Awards

Bid #10-063

Artcraft Ad Specialies

Authentic Promotions,

VENDORS Co., LLC Inc. Award Center CFJ Manufacturing
Quantity [ Unit | Unit Price Exte'nded UT‘" Exte'nded Unit Price Exte'nded Unit Price Exte'nded
Price Price Price Price Price
Five-Year Award: Set of four white, 4-inch sandstone
coasters with two-color imprint (imprint colors — navy blue 310 Each $5.29 $1,639.90 $13.99 $4,336.90 $25.00 | $7,750.00| $17.86 $5,536.60
and red). Coasters are in a vertical wooden holder.
Set-up fee 1 Each | Included None None None
Ten-Year Award: OPTIC crystal 4.5-inch star, clear color,
with etching of MISD logo and “10 Years of Service”. 131 Each | $21.38 $2,800.78 | $37.19 $4,871.89 $36.75 |$4,814.25| $23.44 $3,070.64
Set-up fee 1 Each | Included None $45.00 $45.00 $60.00 $60.00
Fifteen-Year Award: Crystal bowl, 5.5-inch diameter, clear
color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “15 Years of 34 Each | $28.60 $972.40 $38.29 $1,301.86 $57.00 |$1,938.00| $40.00 $1,360.00
Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each | Included None $45.00 $45.00 $75.00 $75.00
Twenty-Five-Year Award: Lead Crystal Biscuit Barrel and
Lid, clear color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “25 12 Each | $62.15 $745.80 $58.99 $707.88 $80.75 $969.00 $58.67 $704.04
Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each | Included None $45.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00
Twenty-Year Award: Crystal Vase, 9.5-inch height, 6.5”
diameter, clear color, with etching of MISD logo, scrolling 24 Each $139.85 | $3,356.40| $78.00 $1,872.00
on both sides of logo, and “20 Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $45.00 $45.00 $55.00 $55.00
Thirty-Year Award: Set of Foundation Crystal bookends,
clear color, with laser deep etching of MISD logo, “30 3 Pair $134.67 $404.01 $168.44 | $505.32 | $172.50 $517.50
Years of Service” and employee’s hame.
Set-up fee 1 Each None $45.00 $45.00 None
Fee for personalization of award 3 Each $4.00 $12.00 $3.60 $10.80 $5.50 $16.50
Thirty-Five-Year Award: Schoolhouse clock, dark brown,
solid oak case, curved crystal glass, brass pendulum and
chimes. Laser etching on brass plate of MISD logo, “35 3 Each $139.54 $418.62 $200.00 | $600.00 | $113.00 $339.00
Years of Service” and employee’s name.
None, but
Set-up fee 1 Each S/H of $15.60 $15.60 None
$52.35

Fee for personalization of above award 3 Each None $3.60 $10.80 $3.50 $10.50
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Bid #10-063
Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Artcraft Ad Specialies | Authentic Promotions, Award Center Sl BT
Co., LLC Inc.
Quantity [ Unit | Unit Price Exte.nded Uf‘" Exte.nded Unit Price Exte.nded Unit Price Exte.nded
Price Price Price Price Price

Retiree Awards for Women: Ladies’ gold watch with
executive metal watch band of gold and stainless steel.
Center of face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using 10 Each $295.95 | $2,959.50 | $179.00 | $1,790.00
a two-color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each $150.00 | $150.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Retiree Awards for Men: Men'’s gold watch with executive
metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. Center of
face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using a two- 10 Each $295.95 |$2,959.50 | $173.00 | $1,730.00
color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each $150.00 | $150.00 | $45.00 $45.00
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $1.10 $605.00 $0.60 $330.00
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $1.16 $638.00 $1.03 $566.50
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $1.10 $605.00 $0.60 $330.00
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $1.16 $638.00 $1.03 $566.50
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Set-up fee for bags (line items 10, 11, 12 and 13) 1 Each $70.00 $70.00 $140.00 $140.00
Paper, Tissue: Silver in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $43.34 $173.36
Paper, Tissue: White in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $51.50 $206.00 $43.34 $173.36
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Employee Service Awards

Bid #10-063

Artcraft Ad Specialies

Authentic Promotions,

VENDORS Co., LLC Inc. Award Center CFJ Manufacturing
Quantity [ Unit | Unit Price Exte.nded Uf‘" Exte.nded Unit Price Exte.nded Unit Price Exte.nded
Price Price Price Price Price
Catalog Discount 30%
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes Yes Yes

Delivery Time

Average and maximum
delivery time 15 days

Average delivery time 20
days; maximum delivery
time 30 days

Average delivery time
14 business days;
maximum delivery time
up to six weeks. Only
10 units for Line Item
#5 are available now;
remaining 14 will not
be available until 6/10.

Varies. Three weeks
from date artwork is
approved for clock.

Minimum Order

AS UitildlcUu Uy
manufacturer; for 30-

year award S/H is
QB2 28

None

Shipping

None

Delivery to receiving
point will vary by
product.

Included in F.O.B.
pricing

XX = Does not meet specifications.
Blank Cell Under Unit Price = No Bid

Present at opening:
Pam Fennell, Buyer
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing
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Bid #10-063

Employee Service Awards

Creative Embroidery and

VENDORS Trophies imagestuff.com
. . Unit Extended Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Price Price Brand Number
Five-Year Award: Set of four white, 4-inch sandstone Coaster Lamaarafix
coasters with two-color imprint (imprint colors — navy blue 310 Each | $16.72 | $5,183.20 $12.99 | $4,026.90 9 LDSC 444
. . Stone Design
and red). Coasters are in a vertical wooden holder.
Set-up fee 1 Each None $62.50 $62.50
Ten-Year Award: OPTIC crystal 4.5-inch star, clear color, . Northeaster
with etching of MISD logo and “10 Years of Service”. 131 Bach | $21.00 | $2,751.00 | Topline | $29.00 | $3,799.00 n Etched NES7S
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Fifteen-Year Award: Crystal bowl, 5.5-inch diameter, clear Glass
color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “15 Years of 34 Each | $35.00 | $1,190.00 | Crystal D | $90.00 | $3,060.00 America 5480
Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each [ None $75.00 $75.00
Twenty-Five-Year Award: Lead Crystal Biscuit Barrel and St. Redis
Lid, clear color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “25 12 Each | $46.50 [ $558.00 | St. Regis | $91.00 | $1,092.00 C.r stgl BWL 484
Years of Service”. y
Set-up fee 1 Each None $40.00 $40.00
Twenty-Year Award: Crystal Vase, 9.5-inch height, 6.5” Show Glass
diameter, clear color, with etching of MISD logo, scrolling 24 Each | $60.00 | $1,440.00 $81.00 | $1,944.00 . 7526
. . ) Stopper America
on both sides of logo, and “20 Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each [ None $75.00 $75.00
Thirty-Year Award: Set of Foundation Crystal bookends, St. Redis
clear color, with laser deep etching of MISD logo, “30 3 Pair |$150.00| $450.00 (J.Charles|$196.00| $588.00 C.r stgl DSK 781
Years of Service” and employee’s hame. y
Set-up fee 1 Each | None $80.00 $80.00
Fee for personalization of award 3 Each None
Thirty-Five-Year Award: Schoolhouse clock, dark brown,
solid oak case, curved crystal glass, brass pendulum and .
chimes. Laser etching on brass plate of MISD logo, “35 3 Each | $119.00| $357.00 Seiko
Years of Service” and employee’s name.
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Fee for personalization of above award 3 Each None
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Bid #10-063
Employee Service Awards

Creative Embroidery and

VENDORS Trophies imagestuff.com
. . Unit Extended Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Price Price Brand Number

Retiree Awards for Women: Ladies’ gold watch with
executive metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. .
Center of face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using 10 Each [$225.00 | $2,250.00 | Insignia
a two-color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $15.00 $15.00
Retiree Awards for Men: Men'’s gold watch with executive
metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. Center of _—
face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using a two- 10 Each 1$225.00| $2,250.00 | Insignia
color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $15.00 $15.00
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each | $0.78 $429.00
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each | $0.84 $462.00
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each | $0.78 $429.00
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each | $0.84 $462.00
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Set-up fee for bags (line items 10, 11, 12 and 13) 1 Each None

. . . Premier
Paper, Tissue: Silver in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each | $48.00 [ $192.00 Line
Paper, Tissue: White in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $8.50 $34.00 Prﬁ?;er
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Bid #10-063
Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Creative Embr_0|dery and imagestuff.com
Trophies
. . Unit Extended Unit Extended Catalog

Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Price Price Brand Number
Catalog Discount 26%
EPCNT Agreement? None Yes
Delivery Time Average delivery time 30 days; |Average delivery time 14 days; maximum delivery

y maximum delivery time 45 days time 30 days

Minimum Order N/A "On certain items" , no quantity given
Shipping N/A "On certain items" , no quantity given

XX = Does not meet specifications.
Blank Cell Under Unit Price = No Bid

Present at opening:
Pam Fennell, Buyer
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing
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Bid #10-063
Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Imprint Resources MonogramPro
. . Unit Extended Catalog Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Number Price Price Number

Five-Year Award: Set of four white, 4-inch sandstone Coaster
coasters with two-color imprint (imprint colors — navy blue 310 Each | $16.40 | $5,084.00 WSGIFT | $21.25 | $6,587.50

- - Stone
and red). Coasters are in a vertical wooden holder.
Set-up fee 1 Each None None
Ten-Year Award: OPTIC crystal 4.5-inch star, clear color, Glass
with etching of MISD logo and “10 Years of Service”. 131 Bach | $25.15 | $3,294.65 Graphics P35 $36.25 | $4,748.75
Set-up fee 1 Each None None
Fifteen-Year Award: Crystal bowl, 5.5-inch diameter, clear Glass
color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “15 Years of 34 Each | $49.00 | $1,666.00 Graphics V65 $46.25 | $1,572.50 #2313
Service”. P
Set-up fee 1 Each None $68.00 $68.00
Twenty-Five-Year Award: Lead Crystal Biscuit Barrel and Creative
Lid, clear color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “25 12 Each | $76.28 $915.36 Gifts 60411 $128.00 | $1,536.00
Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Twenty-Year Award: Crystal Vase, 9.5-inch height, 6.5”
diameter, clear color, with etching of MISD logo, scrolling 24 Each XX XX XX XX $130.00 | $3,120.00
on both sides of logo, and “20 Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Thirty-Year Award: Set of Foundation Crystal bookends, Crvstal
clear color, with laser deep etching of MISD logo, “30 3 Pair | $170.20 $510.60 Bl)gnc 9721 $190.00 $570.00
Years of Service” and employee’s hame.
Set-up fee 1 Each
Fee for personalization of award 3 Each
Thirty-Five-Year Award: Schoolhouse clock, dark brown,
solid oak case, curved crystal glass, brass pendulum and .
chimes. Laser etching on brass plate of MISD logo, “35 3 Each | $159.60 $478.80 Seiko ZXH110BLH
Years of Service” and employee’s name.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $45.00 $45.00
Fee for personalization of above award 3 Each | $14.62 $43.86
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Bid #10-063

Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Imprint Resources MonogramPro
. . Unit Extended Catalog Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Number Price Price Number
Retiree Awards for Women: Ladies’ gold watch with
executive metal watch band of gold and stainless steel.
Center of face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using 10 Each | $67.20 $672.00 Pedre 5621TX
a two-color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $30.00 $30.00
Retiree Awards for Men: Men'’s gold watch with executive
metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. Center of
face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using a two- 10 Bach | $67.20 $672.00 Pedre 0403TX
color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $30.00 $30.00
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.76 $418.00 |Bag Makers| 34P79 $1.50 $825.00
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.87 $478.50 |Bag Makers| 34P1013 $1.50 $825.00
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.76 $418.00 |Bag Makers| 34P79 $1.50 $825.00
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.76 $418.00 |Bag Makers| 34P1013 $1.50 $825.00
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Set-up fee for bags (line items 10, 11, 12 and 13) 1 Each | $140.00 $140.00
Paper, Tissue: Silver in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $36.00 $144.00
Paper, Tissue: White in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each | $53.75 $215.00 |Bag Makers| 32CWT21 | $17.00 $68.00

Page 8 of 21




Bid #10-063

Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Imprint Resources MonogramPro
. . Unit Extended Catalog Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Number Price Price Number
Catalog Discount 0-35% 50%
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes

Delivery Time

problem.

Average delivery time 21 days; maximum delivery
time will be 21 days unless there is a stock

Average delivery time 10 days;
maximum delivery time 14 days

Minimum Order

Varies with suppliers

Shipping

Included in this bid

XX = Does not meet specifications.
Blank Cell Under Unit Price = No Bid

Present at opening:
Pam Fennell, Buyer

Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing
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Employee Service Awards

Bid #10-063

VENDORS PCA Sportswear Paper Direct, Inc.
. . I Extended Catalog o Extended
Quantity [ Unit [ Unit Price Price Brand Number Unit Price Price
Five-Year Award: Set of four white, 4-inch sandstone Coaster
coasters with two-color imprint (imprint colors — navy blue 310 Each $14.40 $4,464.00 WSGIFT
. . Stone
and red). Coasters are in a vertical wooden holder.
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Ten-Year Award: OPTIC crystal 4.5-inch star, clear color, Glass
with etching of MISD logo and “10 Years of Service”. 131 Each HE2Y 20 America Eheh
Set-up fee 1 Each
Fifteen-Year Award: Crystal bowl, 5.5-inch diameter, clear Northeaster
color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “15 Years of 34 Each $36.00 $1,224.00 n ETCH NE507
Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $75.00 $75.00
Twenty-Five-Year Award: Lead Crystal Biscuit Barrel and Class 334-
Lid, clear color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “25 12 Each $79.00 $948.00 y
o Glass C617D47
Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $40.00 $40.00
Twenty-Year Award: Crystal Vase, 9.5-inch height, 6.5” Glass
diameter, clear color, with etching of MISD logo, scrolling 24 Each $80.00 $1,920.00 . 6933
: p o America
on both sides of logo, and “20 Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Thirty-Year Award: Set of Foundation Crystal bookends, 3 Charles
clear color, with laser deep etching of MISD logo, “30 3 Pair $170.00 $510.00 .Cr stal 2010-9721
Years of Service” and employee’s hame. y
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Fee for personalization of award 3 Each None
Thirty-Five-Year Award: Schoolhouse clock, dark brown,
solid oak case, curved crystal glass, brass pendulum and
chimes. Laser etching on brass plate of MISD logo, “35 3 Each | $140.00 $420.00 PFI 801-403C
Years of Service” and employee’s name.
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Fee for personalization of above award 3 Each
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Employee Service Awards

Bid #10-063

VENDORS PCA Sportswear Paper Direct, Inc.
. . I Extended Catalog o Extended
Quantity [ Unit [ Unit Price Price Brand Number Unit Price Price

Retiree Awards for Women: Ladies’ gold watch with
executive metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. .
Center of face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using 10 Each $87.00 $870.00 | Fossil Corp.|  PR5377
a two-color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $120.00 $120.00
Retiree Awards for Men: Men'’s gold watch with executive
metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. Center of .
face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using a two- 10 Each $87.00 $870.00  |Fossil Corp.| PR5378
color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $120.00 $120.00
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X US Box
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.77 $423.50

. . L : . Corp
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X US Box
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.87 $478.50

. ) L . . Corp
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X US Box
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.77 $423.50

. . . . : . Corp
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X US Box
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.87 $478.50

. . . . . . Corp
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Set-up fee for bags (line items 10, 11, 12 and 13) 1 Each | $150.00 $150.00

. . . US Box
Paper, Tissue: Silver in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $42.00 $168.00 Corp
. oo US Box

Paper, Tissue: White in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $32.00 $128.00 Corp
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Employee Service Awards

Bid #10-063

VENDORS PCA Sportswear Paper Direct, Inc.
. . I Extended Catalog o Extended
Quantity [ Unit [ Unit Price Price Brand Number Unit Price Price
Catalog Discount 15%
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes

Delivery Time

Average delivery time 15 days; maximum delivery

time

30 days

Average delivery time 5
days; maximum delivery
time only applies to back
orders and personalized
items which could take
six weeks. SPECIAL
SOURCE CODE MUST
BE USED WITH ALL
ORDERS (WEBBID15)

Minimum Order

Shipping

6% of total order with
expedited shipping
available upon request.

XX = Does not meet specifications.
Blank Cell Under Unit Price = No Bid

Present at opening:
Pam Fennell, Buyer

Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing
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Bid #10-063

Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Positive Promotions Scarborough Specialties
. . I Extended I Extended Catalog
Quantity [ Unit | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Brand Number

Five-Year Award: Set of four white, 4-inch sandstone WSGIETPAC
coasters with two-color imprint (imprint colors — navy blue 310 Each $15.00 $4,650.00 |Coasterstone K
and red). Coasters are in a vertical wooden holder.
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Ten-Year Award: OPTIC crystal 4.5-inch star, clear color,
with etching of MISD logo and “10 Years of Service”. 131 Each $23.00 $3,013.00 J. Charles | STAR #509
Set-up fee 1 Each None
Fifteen-Year Award: Crystal bowl, 5.5-inch diameter, clear
color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “15 Years of 34 Each $36.00 $1,224.00 Crystal D 2313
Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $85.00 $85.00
Twenty-Five-Year Award: Lead Crystal Biscuit Barrel and 234.
Lid, clear color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “25 12 Each $63.00 $756.00 |Classy Glass

o C617DU7
Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $45.00 $45.00
Twenty-Year Award: Crystal Vase, 9.5-inch height, 6.5” Sterlingcut
diameter, clear color, with etching of MISD logo, scrolling 24 Each $55.00 $1,320.00 9 07-095M

: p o Glass

on both sides of logo, and “20 Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $50.00 $50.00
Thirty-Year Award: Set of Foundation Crystal bookends,
clear color, with laser deep etching of MISD logo, “30 3 Pair $155.00 $465.00 J. Charles 9721
Years of Service” and employee’s hame.
Set-up fee 1 Each
Fee for personalization of award 3 Each
Thirty-Five-Year Award: Schoolhouse clock, dark brown,
solid oak case, curved crystal glass, brass pendulum and e
chimes. Laser etching on brass plate of MISD logo, “35 3 Each $130.00 $390.00 | Indogi/Seiko | QXH110BLM
Years of Service” and employee’s name.
Set-up fee 1 Each $65.00 $65.00
Fee for personalization of above award 3 Each $4.00 $12.00
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Bid #10-063
Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Positive Promotions Scarborough Specialties
. . I Extended I Extended Catalog
Quantity [ Unit | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Brand Number

Retiree Awards for Women: Ladies’ gold watch with
executive metal watch band of gold and stainless steel.

Center of face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using 10 Each S S FELE PRI
a two-color imprint of navy blue and red.

Set-up fee 1 Each $80.00 $80.00

Retiree Awards for Men: Men'’s gold watch with executive

metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. Center of

face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using a two- 10 Each RO Y sl Ut
color imprint of navy blue and red.

Set-up fee 1 Each None

Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.58 $319.00 | Bag Makers 34P79
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.

Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.62 $341.00 | Bag Makers | 34P1013
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.

Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.58 $319.00 | Bag Makers 34P79
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.

Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.62 $341.00 | Bag Makers | 34P1013
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.

Set-up fee for bags (line items 10, 11, 12 and 13) 1 Each $60.00 $60.00
Paper, Tissue: Silver in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $37.00 $148.00 | Bag Makers 32T™M
Paper, Tissue: White in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $30.00 $120.00 | Bag Makers | 32CWT21
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Bid #10-063

Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Positive Promotions Scarborough Specialties
. . I Extended I Extended Catalog
Quantity [ Unit | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Brand Number
Catalog Discount 5% 0%
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes

Delivery Time

Average delivery time 8
days; maximum delivery
time 20 days

Average delivery time 10-12 days; maximum delivery
time 21 days

Minimum Order

None for non-custom
orders. Other shipping
varies.

Minimum for vases is 4; minimum for watches is 12-
cost is $55.00 each when ordering 12. Freight for
small bags is $33.00, for large bags is $39.00.

Shipping

Shipping charges are not included in pricing. Freight
for vase is approximately $4.50 each; freight for
watches is $12.00 for one dozen watches.

XX = Does not meet specifications.
Blank Cell Under Unit Price = No Bid

Present at opening:
Pam Fennell, Buyer
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing
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Employee Service Awards

Bid #1

0-063

VENDORS Shumsky Enterprises, Inc. TDG Creative
. . Unit Extended Catalog Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Number Price Price Brand Number
Five-Year Award: Set of four white, 4-inch sandstone Coaster Coaster
coasters with two-color imprint (imprint colors — navy blue 310 Each | $16.57 | $5,136.70 | Hindestone $20.45 $6,339.50 1
. - Set Stone
and red). Coasters are in a vertical wooden holder.
Set-up fee 1 Each None N/C
Ten-Year Award: OPTIC crystal 4.5-inch star, clear color,
with etching of MISD logo and “10 Years of Service”. 131 Each | $25.94 | $3,398.14 | J. Charles 509 $32.50 | $4,257.50 | OPTIC
Set-up fee 1 Each N/C
Fifteen-Year Award: Crystal bowl, 5.5-inch diameter, clear Class 11817565
color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “15 Years of 34 Each | $37.09 | $1,261.06 Glasg 7 $41.00 | $1,394.00
Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $50.00 | $50.00 N/C
Twenty-Five-Year Award: Lead Crystal Biscuit Barrel and Encore ';I;frlglt Pctzfét:]lz :zvro
Lid, clear color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “25 12 Each | $106.93 | $1,283.16 E1407 | $138.00 | $1,656.00 . o
- Etch Polish | shipping/$6
Years of Service”.
Crystal per carton
Set-up fee 1 Each | $95.00 $95.00 N/C
Twenty-Year Award: Crystal Vase, 9.5-inch height, 6.5” Sterling Cut
diameter, clear color, with etching of MISD logo, scrolling 24 Each | $56.66 | $1,359.84 g 07-095M | $75.00 | $1,800.00
; “ o Glass
on both sides of logo, and “20 Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each | $60.00 $60.00 $48.00 $48.00
Thirty-Year Award: Set of Foundation Crystal bookends,
clear color, with laser deep etching of MISD logo, “30 3 Pair | $142.84 | $428.52 | J. Charles 9721 $185.00 $555.00
Years of Service” and employee’s hame.
Set-up fee 1 Each
Fee for personalization of award 3 Each
Thirty-Five-Year Award: Schoolhouse clock, dark brown,
solid oak case, curved crystal glass, brass pendulum and . QXH110B
chimes. Laser etching on brass plate of MISD logo, “35 3 Each | $135.66 | $406.98 Seiko LH $215.85 $647.55
Years of Service” and employee’s name.
Set-up fee 1 Each
Fee for personalization of above award 3 Each | $7.50 $22.50 $5.00 $15.00
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Employee Service Awards

Bid #10-063

VENDORS Shumsky Enterprises, Inc. TDG Creative
. . Unit Extended Catalog Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Number Price Price Brand Number
Retiree Awards for Women: Ladies’ gold watch with Based on Based on
executive metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. quantity of quantity
Center of face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using 10 Each XX XX 12 per XX XX XX of 12 per
a two-color imprint of navy blue and red. order order
Set-up fee 1 Each XX XX XX XX
Retiree Awards for Men: Men'’s gold watch with executive Based on Based on
metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. Center of quantity of quantity
face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using a two- 10 Each XX XX 12 per XX XX XX of 12 per
color imprint of navy blue and red. order order
Set-up fee 1 Each XX XX XX XX
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X Matte
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.57 $313.50 |Bag Makers| 34P79 $0.98 $539.00 Bads
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center. g
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X Matte
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.60 $330.00 |Bag Makers| 34P1013 | $1.03 $566.50 Bads
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center. 9
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X Matte
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.57 $313.50 |Bag Makers| 34P79 $0.98 $539.00 Bags
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center. 9
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X Matte
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.60 $330.00 |Bag Makers| 34P1013 | $1.03 $566.50 Bags
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center. g
Ul TS
11 and
o 13 only if
Set-up fee for bags (line items 10, 11, 12 and 13) 1 Each | $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 ordered
after May
Paper, Tissue: Silver in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each | $46.55 | $186.20 (Bag Makers SII_?)\EER $0.00
Paper, Tissue: White in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each | $27.93 | $111.72 |Bag Makers|32CWT21
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Bid #10-063

Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Shumsky Enterprises, Inc. TDG Creative
. . Unit Extended Catalog Unit Extended Catalog
Quantity | Unit Price Price Brand Number Price Price Brand Number
Catalog Discount Negotiable 1-30%
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes

Delivery Time

Average delivery time 10-15 days; maximum

delivery time 25 days

Average delivery time 7-15 days; maximum
delivery time 30 days

Minimum Order

Varies by item

Based on crystal pieces "1's"

Shipping

F.O.B. Factory, shipping and handling will be
$58.80 for small bags (34P79) and $65.00 for

large bags (34P1013)

Varies on distance, weight

XX = Does not meet specifications.
Blank Cell Under Unit Price = No Bid

Present at opening:
Pam Fennell, Buyer

Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing

Page 18 of 21




Employee Service Awards

Bid #10-063

VENDORS Trophies and More Wilson Awards
. . R Extended I Extended Catalog
Quantity [ Unit Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Brand Number
Five-Year Award: Set of four white, 4-inch sandstone CoasterSton
coasters with two-color imprint (imprint colors — navy blue 310 Each $18.50 $5,735.00 $19.00 | $5,890.00 o W54
and red). Coasters are in a vertical wooden holder.
Set-up fee 1 Each $25.00 $25.00
Ten-Year Award: OPTIC crystal 4.5-inch star, clear color, .
with etching of MISD logo and “10 Years of Service”. 131 Each $21.75 $3,635.25 $20.00 $2,620.00 Wwilson
Set-up fee 1 Each $120.00 $120.00
Fifteen-Year Award: Crystal bowl, 5.5-inch diameter, clear
color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “15 Years of 34 Each $51.26 $1,742.84 $42.00 $1,428.00 Crystal D 2313
Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 $85.00
Twenty-Five-Year Award: Lead Crystal Biscuit Barrel and Sterling Cut
Lid, clear color, with deep etching of MISD logo and “25 12 Each $76.00 $912.00 $135.00 | $1,620.00 Glags 06-030S
Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 $85.00
Twenty-Year Award: Crystal Vase, 9.5-inch height, 6.5” Sterling Cut
diameter, clear color, with etching of MISD logo, scrolling 24 Each $83.30 $1,999.20 $60.35 $1,448.40 9 07-095M
; “ i on Glass
on both sides of logo, and “20 Years of Service”.
Set-up fee 1 Each $40.00 $40.00 $85.00 $85.00
Thirty-Year Award: Set of Foundation Crystal bookends, J Charles
clear color, with laser deep etching of MISD logo, “30 3 Pair $190.92 $572.76 $170.00 $510.00 9721
- , Crystalworks
Years of Service” and employee’s hame.
Set-up fee 1 Each $85.00 $85.00
Fee for personalization of award 3 Each $3.00 $9.00 $4.50 $13.50
Thirty-Five-Year Award: Schoolhouse clock, dark brown,
solid oak case, curved crystal glass, brass pendulum and .
chimes. Laser etching on brass plate of MISD logo, “35 3 Each $211.25 $633.75 $141.75 $425.25 Seiko QXH110BLH
Years of Service” and employee’s name.
Set-up fee 1 Each $70.00 $70.00
Fee for personalization of above award 3 Each $15.00 $45.00
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Bid #10-063
Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Trophies and More Wilson Awards
. . R Extended I Extended Catalog
Quantity [ Unit Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Brand Number
Retiree Awards for Women: Ladies’ gold watch with
executive metal watch band of gold and stainless steel.
Center of face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using 10 Each XX XX XX XX XX XX
a two-color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each XX XX XX XX
Retiree Awards for Men: Men'’s gold watch with executive
metal watch band of gold and stainless steel. Center of .
face of watch is engraved with MISD logo, using a two- 10 Each $77.96 $779.60 $85.00 $850.00 SS Time W525
color imprint of navy blue and red.
Set-up fee 1 Each $60.00 $60.00 $60.00 $60.00
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.98 $539.00 $0.85 $467.50 Noteworthy
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $1.05 $577.50 $0.85 $467.50 Noteworthy
to be imprinted in silver on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 9.75"H X
7.5"W X 4D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $0.98 $539.00 $0.85 $467.50 Noteworthy
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Gift bags for Awards: Black matte gift bags, 12.5"H X
9.75"W X 5”D, with twisted craft paper handles. MISD logo 550 Each $1.05 $577.50 $0.85 $467.50 Noteworthy
to be imprinted in white on one side of bag in the center.
Set-up fee for bags (line items 10, 11, 12 and 13) 1 Each $75.00 $75.00 $50.00 $50.00
Paper, Tissue: Silver in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $45.78 $183.12 $65.00 $260.00
Paper, Tissue: White in color, 480 sheets per ream. 4 Each $45.78 $183.12 $40.00 $160.00
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Bid #10-063
Employee Service Awards

VENDORS Trophies and More Wilson Awards
. . R Extended I Extended Catalog
Quantity [ Unit Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Brand Number
Catalog Discount 10%
EPCNT Agreement? Yes No

Average delivery time 3 Average delivery time 30 days; no maximum delivery

Delivery Time weeks; maximum delivery .
. listed
time 4 weeks

Minimum Order Quantities stated in bid

Shipping Added to costs

XX = Does not meet specifications.
Blank Cell Under Unit Price = No Bid

Present at opening:
Pam Fennell, Buyer
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing
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