
Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Oboe Fox model 330 3 $2,998.00 $8,994.00 60 days $3,041.00 $9,123.00 30-60 days

Oboe Fox Model 300 3 $4,698.00 $14,094.00 60 days $4,835.95 $14,507.85 30-60 days

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3 $3,738.00 $11,214.00 60 days $3,860.00 $11,580.00 30-60 days

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3 $4,538.00 $13,614.00 60 days $4,714.00 $14,142.00 30-90 days

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4 $1,597.00 $6,388.00 30 days

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4 XX XX XX

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2 XX XX XX

French Horn Conn 6D 10 $2,070.00 $20,700.00 XX XX XX

French Horn Conn 8D 10 $2,798.00 $27,980.00 XX XX XX

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4 XX XX XX

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4 XX XX XX

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3 $440.00 $1,320.00 30 days

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3 XX XX XX

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3 $1,330.00 $3,990.00 30 days

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3 $440.00 $1,320.00 30 days

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3 $570.00 $1,710.00 30 days

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3 $1,140.00 $3,420.00 30 days

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2 $624.00 $1,248.00 30 days $749.00 $1,498.00 7-28 days

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1 $318.00 $318.00 7-10 days $290.00 $290.00 10 days $349.00 $349.00 5-15 days

Brook MaysAves Audio Visual Systems Capshaw Olivas Music
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Brook MaysAves Audio Visual Systems Capshaw Olivas Music

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate? $10.00

30%

Yes

Yes

See Brochure

Yes

Yes

Yes

30-50%0%

N/A

No

See List

No

10-75%

18 repair techs with more than 20+ 
years experience
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Brook MaysAves Audio Visual Systems Capshaw Olivas Music

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director

None

None

Yes

None

None

Yes

None

Yes

$50.00

Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

$3,195.00 $9,585.00 90 days

$4,949.00 $14,847.00 120 days

$4,095.00 $12,285.00 90 days

$4,949.50 $14,848.50 90 days

$2,249.00 $22,490.00 90 days

$2,979.00 $29,790.00 90 days

$799.00 $1,598.00 1 week

Forte Instrument Repair       
(No References Given)Dallas Strings Ellis County Music Center
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Forte Instrument Repair       
(No References Given)Dallas Strings Ellis County Music Center

$30.00 N/A- see Repair Price List

10% Over $50 per repair 25% off

Yes No

Yes Yes

Yes yes

Yes Yes

String Instrument Repair

N/A

Minor adjustment, play condition, 
repad, economy overhaul, case 

repair

N/A

Yes

Yes

Yes

10%

Yes Yes

Internal clean, soldering, trombone 
slide repair, leadpip installation, 
valve repair, adjustments, repad, 
overhaul, corks , replace needle 
spring, flat spring, carbon fiber 

banning, crack pinning.

Repair technician since 1986.  See 
biography

Colorado Institute of Musical 
Instrument Technology- Castle 
Rock, Co  Brass, Woodwind, 

Strings

No

20%

$50.00

N/A

Yes

25% off $300 or more on a single 
item
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Forte Instrument Repair       
(No References Given)Dallas Strings Ellis County Music Center

N/A

N/A

Yes

N/A

N/A

Yes

$100.00

None
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del.

XX XX XX

$4,714.00 $14,142.00 0-45 
days

XX XX XX

$4,544.00 $13,632.00 0-60 
days

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

$4,524.00 $4,524.00 15 days

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

$619.00 $1,238.00 0-30 
days $620.00 $1,240.00

 $   302.00 $302.00 0-30 
days $330.00 $330.00

Interstate MusicGrand Staff Piano Centers Jack Rasmussen "Luthies"
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del.

Interstate MusicGrand Staff Piano Centers Jack Rasmussen "Luthies"

N/A $50.00

0% 10-50%

No No

No Yes

No Yes

YesNo

0%

Entire staff of 8 people are all 
certified

repad, overhaul, economy 
overhaul and major overhaul

Stringed instruments only and 
accessories

Lyon & Healy Harps supplies 
and strings for Harps.  Bid price 
is Lyon & Healy list price and is 
subject to Lyon & Healy prices 

increases and specials

50-10%

No, Instruments will be pre-
adjusted, we ship all items ready 
to play.  We do not unpack nor 

handle packing materials.

Yes
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del.

Interstate MusicGrand Staff Piano Centers Jack Rasmussen "Luthies"

N/A

Yes

only on risers & steel cabinets or 
orders under min. order amt.

No

$75 for free shipping None

None, except on Harps

Yes

None
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

$3,825.00 $11,475.00 180 
days

$5,892.19 $17,676.57 180 
days

$4,484.38 $13,453.14 180 
days

$5,718.75 $17,156.25 180 
days

$1,887.50 $7,550.00 30 days

$2,057.50 $8,230.00 30 days

$4,435.00 $8,870.00 30 days

$2,481.66 $24,816.60 30 days

$3,447.29 $34,472.90 30 days

$1,743.75 $6,975.00 30 days

$6,860.00 $27,440.00 30 days

$671.30 $1,342.60 30 days $923.75 $1,847.50 3-14 days

$326.00 $326.00 3-7 days

Lone Star Percussion McCormick's EnterprisesJohnny Paul's Music Shop
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Lone Star Percussion McCormick's EnterprisesJohnny Paul's Music Shop

$80.00

0%

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

repad, adjust, a complete full- 
service repair facility

0% 0%

Yes
No, we will not offer assembly 
unless specifically asked we 

hand deliver

20-40%

Yes

Over 60 years experience in shop
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Lone Star Percussion McCormick's EnterprisesJohnny Paul's Music Shop

Yes

N/A None

UPS Ground includes in bid pricing, all other items- 
actual shipping costs are charged

Yes Yes
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit 
Price

Ext. 
Price

Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del.

XX XX XX $3,611.00 $10,833.00 120 
days $3,140.00 $9,420.00 30-180 

days

XX XX XX $5,562.00 $16,686.00 120 
days $5,055.00 $15,165.00 30-180 

days

XX XX XX $4,233.00 $12,699.00 120 
days $3,970.00 $11,910.00 30-180 

days

XX XX XX $5,398.00 $16,194.00 120 
days $4,867.00 $14,601.00 30-180 

days

XX XX XX $1,588.00 $6,352.00 30 
days $1,623.00 $6,492.00 10-30 

days

XX XX XX $1,732.00 $6,928.00 30 
days $1,769.00 $7,076.00 10-30 

days

XX XX XX $3,732.00 $7,464.00 30 
days $3,796.00 $7,592.00 20-45 

days

XX XX XX $2,102.00 $21,020.00 60 
days $2,104.00 $21,040.00 10-30 

days

XX XX XX $2,921.00 $29,210.00 60 
days $2,923.00 $29,230.00 10-30 

days

XX XX XX $1,468.00 $5,872.00 30 
days $1,506.00 $6,024.00 20-60 

days

XX XX XX $5,605.00 $22,420.00 30 
days $5,700.00 $22,800.00 20-60 

days

$505.00 $1,515.00 20-45 
days

$735.00 $2,205.00 20-45 
days

$1,685.00 $5,055.00 20-45 
days

$530.00 $1,590.00 20-45 
days

$685.00 $2,055.00 20-45 
days

$1,425.00 $4,275.00 20-45 
days

$638.00 $1,276.00 30 
days $775.00 $1,550.00 10-45 

days

$363.00 $363.00 30 
days $375.00 $375.00 20-30 

days

Mr. E's Music Music & Arts (MD)Melhart Music Center Midwest Musical Imports
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit 
Price

Ext. 
Price

Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del.

Mr. E's Music Music & Arts (MD)Melhart Music Center Midwest Musical Imports

$8.00 $65.00N/A

0% 0-40%N/A

Yes YesN/A

Yes YesN/A

N/A

Yes

N/A Performs all services in a timely 
manner

N/A Yes

overhaul, complete re-pad, 
complete regulation, key 

soldering

Yes Yes

30% 0-50%0-50%

Yes

Instrument Repair, Print Music

Yes Yes

Staff of repairmen have over 50 
years of experience

10 repair technicians with 40+ 
experienceN/A

5-50%

Yes
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit 
Price

Ext. 
Price

Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del.

Mr. E's Music Music & Arts (MD)Melhart Music Center Midwest Musical Imports

None $25.001

Yes Yes, conditional

None N/AFOB- McAllen

Yes
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

$622.96 $1,868.88 15-45 days

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

$622.96 $1,868.88 15-45 days

XX XX XX

Percussion Source Peripole-BergeraultNational Educational Music 
Company
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Percussion Source Peripole-BergeraultNational Educational Music 
Company

No

Starred Items Already discounted, plus 
shipping

No

0% 20% from Peripole, plus shipping 25% 
Bergerault USA Catalog, plus shipping

No

0-50%

"Not Applicable"
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Percussion Source Peripole-BergeraultNational Educational Music 
Company

Included in bid pricing

Yes

$6.95

Yes

See back of catalog for rate 
tables

Orders up to $69.99=$6.95; $70-
$199.99=10% of order; $200-

$499.99=9%; $500-$999.99=8%; 
$1,000+=7% 

$50.00
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

$3,024.00 $9,072.00 60 days XX XX XX

$4,744.00 $14,232.00 60 days XX XX XX

$3,859.00 $11,577.00 60-90 XX XX XX

$4,644.00 $13,932.00 60-90 XX XX XX

$1,615.00 $6,460.00 30 days 
ARO

XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX

$2,008.00 $20,080.00 30 days 
ARO

XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX $4,150.00 $4,150.00
30-60 
days 
ARO

$660.00 $1,320.00 10 days $625.00 $1,250.00 30 days 
ARO

$294.00 $294.00 1-3 
days

Romeo MusicRivard Brothers San Antonio Music             
Alamo Music Center
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Romeo MusicRivard Brothers San Antonio Music             
Alamo Music Center

$45.00

0-50%

Yes, when available

Yes

No

No

Wind and percussion instrument 
repairs and mechanical 

restoration/repads.  (No cosmetic 
overhaul/re-laquering)

Yes Yes

10-50% 15% 0%

25 years experience and member 
of NAPBIRT
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del.

Romeo MusicRivard Brothers San Antonio Music             
Alamo Music Center

Applicable to accessory items only

YesYes

$20.00

None

Yes

None

None

None
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

$428.00 $1,284.00 14 days

$620.00 $1,860.00

$1,420.00 $4,260.00 14 days

$448.00 $1,344.00 14 days

$580.00 $1,740.00 14 days

$1,200.00 $3,600.00 14 days

$614.00 $1,228.00

Taylor Music, Inc.Shar Products Company Sweet Pipes, Inc.
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Taylor Music, Inc.Shar Products Company Sweet Pipes, Inc.

10% off Shar General 
Catalog/web prices

No

No

No

No

No "on site" services, unpacking 
available

10%

Aulos Recorders 5%; Sonor Orff 
Packages 5%

Yes

10% off Shar General Catalog; 
sheet music and method books 

20% off; Suzuki materials 35% off 
list price

Yes

0%
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del Unit Price Ext. Price Est. Del Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Taylor Music, Inc.Shar Products Company Sweet Pipes, Inc.

Free shipping on orders over 
$50.00; actual freight on orders 

under $50.00

Yes Yes

None on bid items; $8.00 
minimum on accessory orders 

under $75.00.  Oboes and 
bassoons are currently in stock, 

but may be 90 days delivery time, 
depending upon date of order.

Yes

None

$25.00 on accessory orders for 
free freightNone None
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

XX XX XX $3,190.00 $9,570.00 60-90 
days

XX XX XX $5,120.00 $15,360.00 60-90 
days

XX XX XX $4,038.00 $12,114.00 90-120 
days

XX XX XX $4,940.00 $14,820.00 90-120 
days

XX XX XX $1,622.00 $6,488.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $1,768.00 $7,072.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $3,810.00 $7,620.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $2,108.00 $21,080.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $2,929.00 $29,290.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $1,498.00 $5,992.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $5,722.00 $22,888.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $449.40 $1,348.20 20 days $535.00 $1,605.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $651.00 $1,953.00 20 days $775.00 $2,325.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $1,491.00 $4,473.00 20 days $1,775.00 $5,325.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $470.40 $1,411.20 20 days $560.00 $1,680.00 30-60 
days

XX XX XX $609.00 $1,827.00 20 days $725.00 $2,175.00 30-60 
days

$1,195.00 $3,585.00 30 days $1,260.00 $3,780.00 20 days $1,500.00 $4,500.00 30-60 
days

$669.00 $1,338.00 45 days $705.00 $1,410.00 30-60 
days

$339.00 $339.00 30 days $349.00 $349.00 30-60 
days

Williamson Music CompanyWashington Music Center, Inc. West Music Company
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Williamson Music CompanyWashington Music Center, Inc. West Music Company

$50.00

$0.00

Yes, for instruments we carry.  
Call for specific availability

Yes

Yes

Yes

N/A
Multiple services offered.  Sent 
detailed list with cost for each 

service.

Repairs

Yes

0-50%

Any Wenger brand products

No, uncrating and assembly not 
available.

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

Varies

No

5-40% benchmark pricing

N/A

Sent list of technicians, 
experience and qualifications of 

each, from 5-39 years of 
experience
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 

Del. Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Williamson Music CompanyWashington Music Center, Inc. West Music Company

Shipping fees included in bid 
pricing.  Bid is "inside delivery" 

only.  All instruments are 
delivered in factory-sealed 
cartons and are play tested 

before sealing.

Yes

Varies

Yes

None

Yes

NoneNone None
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Oboe Fox model 330 3

Oboe Fox Model 300 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 41 3

Bassoon Fox Renard 222 3

Bb Bass Clarinet Yamaha YCL-221 II 4

Tenor Saxophone Yahama YTS-475 4

Baritone Saxophone Yahama YBS-52 2

French Horn Conn 6D 10

French Horn Conn 8D 10

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S 4

Tuba Yamaha YBB-641 4

Studio Piano (includes bench, dolly & 
one tuning) Yamaha P22 1

Orff Soprano Xylophone Sonor SKX10 3

Orff Alto Xylophone Sonor TAKX10 3

Orff Deep Bass Xylophone Sonor GBKX10 3

Orff Soprano Metallophone Sonor SKM10 3

Orff Alto Metallophone Sonor TAKM10 3

Orff Deep Bass Metallophone Sonor GBKM10 3

Metronome MacAdams 20XV 2

Digital Recorder Edirol R-09 1

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

$3,088.00 $9,264.00 30-120 
days

$4,848.00 $14,544.00 30-120 
days

$3,798.00 $11,394.00 90-180 
days

$4,710.00 $14,130.00 45-60 
days

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

$2,134.00 $21,340.00 7-90 
days

$2,928.00 $29,280.00 7-90 
days

XX XX XX

XX XX XX

$510.00 $1,530.00 7-45 
days

$675.00 $2,025.00 7-45 
days

$1,624.00 $4,872.00 7-45 
days

$520.00 $1,560.00 7-45 
days

$680.00 $2,040.00 7-45 
days

$1,395.00 $4,185.00 7-45 
days

$295.00 $295.00 7-21 
days

Woodwind & Brasswind, The
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Catalog Discount

Discount does not apply to the 
following items:

Will your company be able to meet 
the conditions as stated in 
"Instrument Condition" of bid?

List qualifications, certification?

Services offered

On-site inspections to determine 
repair estimates?

Offers free pick up and deliver 
service for repairs?  If so, cost?
24-hour turn-around for emergency 
repairs
Loaner instruments provided during 
emergency repairs?

Discount off parts- %

Hourly charge rate?

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Woodwind & Brasswind, The

Discontinued, obsolete, outlet 
products

No, products shipped dock 
delivery.  No set-up or installation 

available.

3%
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Musical Instruments, Equipment and Repair
Bid# 10-061

Vendor

Description Brand Qty

Minimum order

Shipping 

Interlocal

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell  = No Bid
Present at opening:  

Shelley Freeman- PUR Director
Pam Fennell- PUR Buyer

Russell Sanders- Director of Fine Arts

Unit Price Ext. Price Est. 
Del.

Woodwind & Brasswind, The

Free standard ground, call for 
quote for truck freight discount

Yes, but must have "Mansfield 
ISD" on PO

$50.00
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