
Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number Unit Price Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Metering Faucet.  Moen model number 
8884 25 Each

Open Front Enlongated Toilet Seat – 5 per 
case.  10 Case $16.65 $166.50 SO1630WH

T
Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  
Sloan 25 Each $209.12 $5,228.00 SO44089AM $165.95 $4,148.75 EBV-89A-M

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  Zurn 25 Each $165.56 $4,139.00 ZERK-CPM

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint,Yellow – VOC less than 
65%, 17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Red – VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Blue - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Green - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces.  

36 Can

Discount off price for gas regulators
Service for Stop-Ups, Camera Line
Cable Machine Price
Jetter Price
Camera Price
Service Cost Per Hour
Discount off Parts
General Discount off Plumbing Parts 
and Supplies Not Listed (by Brand)
Acorn
American Standard
AO Smith
Bemis
Benz-o-matic
Bradley
Brass Craft

Allied Flow Specialists, Inc. Apex Supply Apple Specialties, Inc.

10%

45%
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number Unit Price Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

Allied Flow Specialists, Inc. Apex Supply Apple Specialties, Inc.

Chicago
Crane Lavatories
Delta
Dresser
Elkay
Febco
Fluid Master
Gerber
Halsey-Taylor
Intersan Kohler
Lenox
Lochinvar
Merit Brass
Moen
Nibco
Oasis
Oatey
Ridgid
Sloan
Spears
T&S Brass
Watts
Wilkins
Zurn
Other
Other

45%

Freight

Blank cell under "Unit Price"=No Bid

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, MISD
Pam Fennel, MISD
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing

X=Does not meet specifications

None

"Hot Shot" services are available at no 
extra charge.

"Hot Shot" services are available for a fee 
of $25.00. "Hot Shot" services are NOT available.

None On special order items and orders less 
than $50.00. None

None $5.00; $50.00 for free delivery

Sloan Parts = 50%

45%

45%
Chicago Parts = 47%

40%

EPCNT Agreement? Yes No Yes

Catalog Discount for all other items 50%
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Metering Faucet.  Moen model number 
8884 25 Each

Open Front Enlongated Toilet Seat – 5 per 
case.  10 Case

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  
Sloan 25 Each

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  Zurn 25 Each

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint,Yellow – VOC less than 
65%, 17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Red – VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Blue - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Green - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces.  

36 Can

Discount off price for gas regulators
Service for Stop-Ups, Camera Line
Cable Machine Price
Jetter Price
Camera Price
Service Cost Per Hour
Discount off Parts
General Discount off Plumbing Parts 
and Supplies Not Listed (by Brand)
Acorn
American Standard
AO Smith
Bemis
Benz-o-matic
Bradley
Brass Craft

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

$86.53 $2,163.25 $90.88 $2,272.00 Moen 8884 
(284497)

$21.79 $217.90 $21.00 $210.00 6/case 9100

$180.00 $4,500.00 $149.00 $3,725.00 89A-M 
(338590)

$180.00 $4,500.00 $123.87 $3,096.75 ZERK-C-CD 
(318071)

$5.50 $198.00

Arlington Pipe and Supply C&P Pump Services, Inc.              Cohn and Gregory, Inc.

90%
60%

50%
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Chicago
Crane Lavatories
Delta
Dresser
Elkay
Febco
Fluid Master
Gerber
Halsey-Taylor
Intersan Kohler
Lenox
Lochinvar
Merit Brass
Moen
Nibco
Oasis
Oatey
Ridgid
Sloan
Spears
T&S Brass
Watts
Wilkins
Zurn
Other
Other

Freight

Blank cell under "Unit Price"=No Bid

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, MISD
Pam Fennel, MISD
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing

X=Does not meet specifications

EPCNT Agreement?

Catalog Discount for all other items

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

Arlington Pipe and Supply C&P Pump Services, Inc.              Cohn and Gregory, Inc.

60%

None

"Hot Shot" services are available at no extra 
charge.

"Hot Shot" services are available at no 
extra charge.

"Hot Shot" services area available at no cost 
unless courier service is used.

$25.00 None

None Freight charges apply, but were not listed. None or normal stock items.

62%

50%

45%
60%
60%

60%

60%

60%

75%
%

62%
75%

Yes Yes Yes

Varies
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Metering Faucet.  Moen model number 
8884 25 Each

Open Front Enlongated Toilet Seat – 5 per 
case.  10 Case

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  
Sloan 25 Each

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  Zurn 25 Each

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint,Yellow – VOC less than 
65%, 17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Red – VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Blue - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Green - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces.  

36 Can

Discount off price for gas regulators
Service for Stop-Ups, Camera Line
Cable Machine Price
Jetter Price
Camera Price
Service Cost Per Hour
Discount off Parts
General Discount off Plumbing Parts 
and Supplies Not Listed (by Brand)
Acorn
American Standard
AO Smith
Bemis
Benz-o-matic
Bradley
Brass Craft

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

XX XX

$14.87 $148.70 Church 295SSCT-000

$149.42 $3,735.50 ZERK-CPM $185.00 $4,625.00

$185.95 $4,648.75 325105

$4.04 $145.44 Whitlam 
Plumb-Pro #MP-Yellow

$4.04 $145.44 Whitlam 
Plumb-Pro #MP-Red

$4.04 $145.44 Whitlam 
Plumb-Pro #MP-Blue

XX XX XX XX

Entech Sales and Service

$946

Epic Supply, LLC Faucet Parts Store, Inc.

$55.00
$150.00 $8,281.54
$150.00 $1,998.75
$75.00 N/A

23% from Standard 15%

23% from Standard 71%

23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 37% Varies
23% from Standard 44.6%
23% from Standard 25%
23% from Standard 0%
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 37.8% Varies
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Chicago
Crane Lavatories
Delta
Dresser
Elkay
Febco
Fluid Master
Gerber
Halsey-Taylor
Intersan Kohler
Lenox
Lochinvar
Merit Brass
Moen
Nibco
Oasis
Oatey
Ridgid
Sloan
Spears
T&S Brass
Watts
Wilkins
Zurn
Other
Other

Freight

Blank cell under "Unit Price"=No Bid

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, MISD
Pam Fennel, MISD
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing

X=Does not meet specifications

EPCNT Agreement?

Catalog Discount for all other items

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

Entech Sales and Service Epic Supply, LLC Faucet Parts Store, Inc.

23% from Standard 55.2%

N/A

"Hot Shot" services are NOT 
available.

"Hot Shot" services are available; average additional 
cost is $22.00, depending upon "ship-to" address. "Hot Shot" services are NOT available.

N/A

Varies

N/A Only on special orders Varies

N/A

23% from Standard 62.8% Varies

23% from Standard 44%

23% from Standard 0%
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 90%

23% from Standard 0%
23% from Standard 55.8% Varies
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 40.6%
23% from Standard 15.5% Varies
23% from Standard 80%

23% from Standard 44.9% Varies
23% from Standard 0%

23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 49.8%
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 0% Varies
23% from Standard 66.8%
23% from Standard 0%
23% from Standard 6.8%
23% from Standard 53% Varies
23% from Standard 0%

No YesYes

Varies
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Metering Faucet.  Moen model number 
8884 25 Each

Open Front Enlongated Toilet Seat – 5 per 
case.  10 Case

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  
Sloan 25 Each

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  Zurn 25 Each

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint,Yellow – VOC less than 
65%, 17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Red – VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Blue - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Green - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces.  

36 Can

Discount off price for gas regulators
Service for Stop-Ups, Camera Line
Cable Machine Price
Jetter Price
Camera Price
Service Cost Per Hour
Discount off Parts
General Discount off Plumbing Parts 
and Supplies Not Listed (by Brand)
Acorn
American Standard
AO Smith
Bemis
Benz-o-matic
Bradley
Brass Craft

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

$95.88 $2,397.00 Moen 8884

$32.73 $327.30 S/o 501 Ch 295 
c+/000

$246.50 $6,162.50 S/o 102 
EBV89AM

$2.78 $100.08 Rustoleum 2655838 $5.12 $184.32

$2.78 $100.08 Rustoleum 2564838 $5.12 $184.32

$2.78 $100.08 Rustoleum 2524838 $5.12 $184.32

$5.12 $184.32

Grainger Lowe's Home ImprovementHome Depot
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Chicago
Crane Lavatories
Delta
Dresser
Elkay
Febco
Fluid Master
Gerber
Halsey-Taylor
Intersan Kohler
Lenox
Lochinvar
Merit Brass
Moen
Nibco
Oasis
Oatey
Ridgid
Sloan
Spears
T&S Brass
Watts
Wilkins
Zurn
Other
Other

Freight

Blank cell under "Unit Price"=No Bid

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, MISD
Pam Fennel, MISD
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing

X=Does not meet specifications

EPCNT Agreement?

Catalog Discount for all other items

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

Grainger Lowe's Home ImprovementHome Depot

TXMAS Contract 2-539030 valid 
through November 30, 2010.

None

"Hot Shot" services are NOT available.

None

Prepaid

0%
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Metering Faucet.  Moen model number 
8884 25 Each

Open Front Enlongated Toilet Seat – 5 per 
case.  10 Case

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  
Sloan 25 Each

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  Zurn 25 Each

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint,Yellow – VOC less than 
65%, 17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Red – VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Blue - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Green - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces.  

36 Can

Discount off price for gas regulators
Service for Stop-Ups, Camera Line
Cable Machine Price
Jetter Price
Camera Price
Service Cost Per Hour
Discount off Parts
General Discount off Plumbing Parts 
and Supplies Not Listed (by Brand)
Acorn
American Standard
AO Smith
Bemis
Benz-o-matic
Bradley
Brass Craft

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

$83.90 $2,097.50 $65.66 $1,641.50 MB25802

$79.05 $790.50 9100 $19.65 $196.50 $14.40 $144.00 BS22602

$99.75 $2,493.75 6111 $229.60 $5,740.00 $138.88 $3,472.00 EBV89M SO23300

$99.75 $2,493.75 265445 $229.60 $5,740.00 $135.29 $3,382.25 ZERK-CPM

Morrison Supply CompanyMark's Plumbing Parts Moore Supply

0% 25% 0-85%
0% 35% 0-85%
0% 0-85%
0% 50% 0-85%
0% 0-85%
0% 20% 0-85%
0% 60% 0-85%
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Chicago
Crane Lavatories
Delta
Dresser
Elkay
Febco
Fluid Master
Gerber
Halsey-Taylor
Intersan Kohler
Lenox
Lochinvar
Merit Brass
Moen
Nibco
Oasis
Oatey
Ridgid
Sloan
Spears
T&S Brass
Watts
Wilkins
Zurn
Other
Other

Freight

Blank cell under "Unit Price"=No Bid

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, MISD
Pam Fennel, MISD
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing

X=Does not meet specifications

EPCNT Agreement?

Catalog Discount for all other items

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

Morrison Supply CompanyMark's Plumbing Parts Moore Supply

0% 33% 0-85%

None Free if minimum order of $100.00 and above.

$100.00 for free shipping; otherwise, none.$10.00

"Hot Shot" services are available.  Additional 
cost varies.

None

"Hot Shot" services are NOT available."Hot Shot" services are NOT available.

$6.95 minimum on orders from catalog under 
$500.00 total; $10.95 minimum on all special 
orders.  Fountains and china at actual cost.

0% 35% 0-85%

0% 0-85%

0% 0-85%
0% 50% 0-85%
0% 10% 0-85%

0% 0-85%
0% 33% 0-85%
0% 55% 0-85%
0% 0-85%
0% 77% 0-85%
0% 0-85%

0% 25% 0-85%
0% 0-85%

0% 0-85%
0% 43% 0-85%
0% 0-85%
0% 30% 0-85%
0% 0-85%
0% 37% 0-85%
0% 35% 0-85%
0% 30% 0-85%
0%
0% 80% 0-85%
0% 33% 0-85%
0% 50% 0-85%

Yes Yes

0% 0-85%
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Metering Faucet.  Moen model number 
8884 25 Each

Open Front Enlongated Toilet Seat – 5 per 
case.  10 Case

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  
Sloan 25 Each

Auto Flush Valves – Side mount only.  Zurn 25 Each

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint,Yellow – VOC less than 
65%, 17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Red – VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Blue - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces. 

36 Can

Rustoleum Rolatape Industrial Choice 
Marking Paint, Green - VOC less than 65%, 
17 ounces.  

36 Can

Discount off price for gas regulators
Service for Stop-Ups, Camera Line
Cable Machine Price
Jetter Price
Camera Price
Service Cost Per Hour
Discount off Parts
General Discount off Plumbing Parts 
and Supplies Not Listed (by Brand)
Acorn
American Standard
AO Smith
Bemis
Benz-o-matic
Bradley
Brass Craft

Unit Price Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

$82.52 $2,063.00 Moen SX-
284497 $71.38 $1,784.50 Moen S8884

$16.28 $162.80 1955CT0
00 6/case

SX-
239434 $14.86 $148.60 Bemis 

(6/case) 40211239

$134.65 $3,366.25 Sloan SX-338598 $119.42 $2,985.50 Sloan 40260003

$115.61 $2,890.25 Zerk-
CPM SX-347716 $106.67 $2,666.75 Zurn 40265106

Total Maintenance Solutions SouthTexas Water Products, Inc.Sexauer 

10%

10%
25%

40% 15%
15%
15%
25%
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Plumbing Parts, Supplies
and Service
Bid #10-028

VENDORS

Plumbing Parts, Supplies and Service Qty Unit

Chicago
Crane Lavatories
Delta
Dresser
Elkay
Febco
Fluid Master
Gerber
Halsey-Taylor
Intersan Kohler
Lenox
Lochinvar
Merit Brass
Moen
Nibco
Oasis
Oatey
Ridgid
Sloan
Spears
T&S Brass
Watts
Wilkins
Zurn
Other
Other

Freight

Blank cell under "Unit Price"=No Bid

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, MISD
Pam Fennel, MISD
Shelley Freeman, Director of Purchasing

X=Does not meet specifications

EPCNT Agreement?

Catalog Discount for all other items

Unit Price Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Brand Catalog 

Number

Total Maintenance Solutions SouthTexas Water Products, Inc.Sexauer 

30%40%

$75.00

None

$25.00 to avoid $5.00 handling fee

$200.00 is PPD freight; under $200.00 is PPD 
and added to invoice.

None

"Hot Shot" services are provided; additional cost 
will be quoted by courier per delivery.ot Shot" services available at no additional c"Hot Shot" services are NOT available.

Free Freight

30% 30%

65%, Mueller PVC/DWV Ftgs

15%
15%
5%

35% 20%
20% 25%
30% 25%
20% 25%

65%, Mueller Swt Ftgs

33% 20%
15%

20% 20%
15%
15%
15%

30% 20%
20% 25%

15%
10%
30%

33% 25%
25%

Yes YesYes

15%
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