
AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Laser Plain Paper Fax/Copier/Phone 2
Fax and Multi-Function Center 1 $310.00 $310.00
Wall/Table Mount UHF Micro Airline 
Aerobic Headset System 1 $231.00 $231.00
Camcorder Package (Includes 
camcorder and case) 2 $293.00 $586.00 $335.00 $670.00
3-Piece CD/Radio/Dual Cassette 
Recorder 2 $181.99 $363.98

1-Piece Digital Portable CD/MP3 Player 6 X X
Digital Camera Package (Includes 
camera and case) 1 $280.00 $280.00 $299.87 $299.87
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Standard Version) 16 $246.75 $3,948.00 $211.00 $3,376.00 $248.00 $3,968.00
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Economy Version) 16 $134.50 $2,152.00 $118.00 $1,888.00 $195.90 $3,134.40
6 Station Wireless Listening Center 
Pkg. (Wireless Version) 16 $199.50 $3,192.00 $200.00 $3,200.00 $289.45 $4,631.20
Wireless PA System 1 $679.00 $679.00 X X
DVD/VCR Combo 3 $70.50 $211.50 $72.00 $216.00 $73.99 $221.97
Super Multi Format DVD Recorder/VCR 
Combination 3 $172.50 $517.50 $164.00 $492.00 $234.99 $704.97
Progressive Scan DVD Player 1 $54.50 $54.50 $54.00 $54.00 $49.00 $49.00 $125.99 $125.99
Data Projection Package on Cart 3 $2,004.12 $6,012.36
Alternate:  Data Projection Package on 
Cart 3 $2,004.12 $6,012.36
Data Projector - Hitachi 1 xx xx $770.55 $770.55
Data Projector - Dukane 1 $1,665.00 $1,665.00
Alternate:  Data Projector - Dukane 1
Multimedia Media Cart 1 $235.00 $235.00 $157.50 $157.50 $200.95 $200.95
Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling Mount 1 $2,047.06 $2,047.06
Alternate:  Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling 
Mount 1
Ceiling Mount 1 $157.00 $157.00 $115.00 $115.00 $98.90 $98.90
Portable Document Camera 2 $573.00 $1,146.00 $606.00 $1,212.00
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
4X 2 $421.00 $842.00 $448.00 $896.00
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 4X 2
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
6X 2 $560.00 $1,120.00 $686.00 $1,372.00
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 6X 2
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
15X 2 X X
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Sunsplash 25 $448.00 $11,200.00 $137.50 $3,437.50

Accent Audio Video, 
Inc. Best Buy, Gov LLC

Audio Visual Aids 
Corp.Audio Enhancement

AVES Audio Visual 
Systems, Inc. B&H Photo Video
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Accent Audio Video, 
Inc. Best Buy, Gov LLC

Audio Visual Aids 
Corp.Audio Enhancement

AVES Audio Visual 
Systems, Inc. B&H Photo Video

Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Starfire 25 $699.00 $17,475.00 X X
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
3M 1830 25
Overhead Projector Dukane Starfire 1 $440.00 $440.00
Overhead Projector 3M 1
Overhead Projector Dukane Sunsplash 1 $187.00 $187.00
Overhead Projector Cart 1 $216.00 $216.00 $142.85 $142.85 $121.00 $121.00
Infocus Deluxe 60" Screen 1 $285.00 $285.00 $177.50 $177.50
S-VHS VCR 1
Portable Sound System 1 $553.00 $553.00 $522.00 $522.00 $519.00 $519.00 $593.75 $593.75
Portable PA System 1 $3,050.00 $3,050.00 $2,696.00 $2,696.00
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg. 25 $1,327.41 $33,185.25
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg. 2 X X
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg. 1
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television 1 $707.00 $17,675.00 $696.00 $17,400.00 $720.00 $720.00
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television 1 $1,073.00 $2,146.00 X X
Wall Screens 1
Multi-Mount 1 $42.00 $42.00
SMART Board Interactive Whiteboard 1
SMART Board Table Stand 1
Promethean Activ Board 1
Promethean Activ Stand 1
StarBoard FX77 Hitachi Interactive 
Whiteboard 1
Hitachi BT-1 Freedom Tablet 
Whiteboard 1

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order
Shipping Information
Additional Information
Present at Opening:
Shelley Freeman, MISD Purchasing
Pam Fennell, MISD Purchasing
X = Does not meet specs.
Blank Cell = No Bid

Free Shipping

Varies
None

0-15%
$25.00

0-83.82%

Call for Shipping

5-40%
None

Call for Shipping
Ref. #222324310

None
10%

$50.00None
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Laser Plain Paper Fax/Copier/Phone
Fax and Multi-Function Center
Wall/Table Mount UHF Micro Airline 
Aerobic Headset System
Camcorder Package (Includes 
camcorder and case)
3-Piece CD/Radio/Dual Cassette 
Recorder

1-Piece Digital Portable CD/MP3 Player
Digital Camera Package (Includes 
camera and case)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Standard Version)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Economy Version)
6 Station Wireless Listening Center 
Pkg. (Wireless Version)
Wireless PA System
DVD/VCR Combo
Super Multi Format DVD Recorder/VCR 
Combination
Progressive Scan DVD Player
Data Projection Package on Cart
Alternate:  Data Projection Package on 
Cart
Data Projector - Hitachi
Data Projector - Dukane
Alternate:  Data Projector - Dukane
Multimedia Media Cart
Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling Mount
Alternate:  Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling 
Mount
Ceiling Mount
Portable Document Camera
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
4X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 4X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
6X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 6X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
15X
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Sunsplash

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
$179.50 $359.00
$274.00 $274.00

$280.00 $280.00

$357.00 $714.00

$185.84 $371.68

$110.50 $663.00

$271.42 $271.42 $284.00 $284.00

$214.29 $3,428.64 $247.00 $3,952.00 $255.23 $4,083.68

$149.01 $2,384.16 $134.00 $2,144.00 $156.86 $2,509.76

$221.43 $3,542.88 $231.00 $3,696.00 $307.63 $4,922.08

$65.00 $195.00 $68.18 $204.54 $74.50 $223.50 $79.00 $237.00

$165.00 $495.00 $223.99 $671.97 $159.50 $478.50 $168.00 $504.00
$46.00 $46.00 $48.70 $48.70 $62.50 $62.50 $57.00 $57.00

$1,219.00 $3,657.00

$1,302.00 $3,906.00
$1,057.00 $1,057.00

$1,650.00 $1,650.00 $1,191.63 $1,191.63 $697.68 $697.68 $1,286.00 $1,286.00 $1,444.00 $1,444.00
$778.68 $778.68

$200.00 $200.00 $189.21 $189.21 $148.50 $148.50 $176.00 $176.00
$2,075.00 $2,075.00 $1,412.40 $1,412.40

$1,493.40 $1,493.40
$98.00 $98.00 $121.11 $121.11 $106.50 $106.50 $115.00 $115.00 $128.21 $128.21

$728.00 $1,456.00 X X $616.00 $1,232.00

$470.00 $940.00 $440.28 $880.56 X X $452.00 $904.00

$535.00 $1,070.00

$653.00 $1,306.00 $545.46 $1,090.92 X X $544.00 $1,088.00 $675.00 $1,350.00

$450.00 $11,250.00 $294.78 $7,369.50

CompUSACamcor, Inc.
Commercial Sales & 

Service, Inc. Computrac
CCS Presentation 

Systems Cousin's Video, Inc.
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
3M 1830
Overhead Projector Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector 3M
Overhead Projector Dukane Sunsplash
Overhead Projector Cart
Infocus Deluxe 60" Screen
S-VHS VCR
Portable Sound System
Portable PA System
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
Wall Screens
Multi-Mount
SMART Board Interactive Whiteboard
SMART Board Table Stand
Promethean Activ Board
Promethean Activ Stand
StarBoard FX77 Hitachi Interactive 
Whiteboard
Hitachi BT-1 Freedom Tablet 
Whiteboard

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order
Shipping Information
Additional Information
Present at Opening:
Shelley Freeman, MISD Purchasing
Pam Fennell, MISD Purchasing
X = Does not meet specs.
Blank Cell = No Bid

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
CompUSACamcor, Inc.

Commercial Sales & 
Service, Inc. Computrac

CCS Presentation 
Systems Cousin's Video, Inc.

$700.00 $17,500.00 $465.78 $11,644.50

$547.00 $13,675.00 $277.78 $6,944.50
$435.00 $435.00 $407.81 $407.81 $342.10 $342.10
$269.00 $269.00 $141.26 $141.26 $148.50 $148.50 $260.00 $260.00
$191.00 $191.00 $180.45 $180.45 $167.50 $167.50
$180.00 $180.00 $177.61 $177.61 $109.50 $109.50 $168.00 $168.00

$270.00 $270.00

$716.00 $716.00
$2,305.00 $2,305.00 $3,190.00 $3,190.00

$1,272.00 $31,800.00 $964.00 $24,100.00

$1,625.00 $3,250.00

$1,299.00 $1,299.00

$747.00 $747.00 $771.75 $685.50 $685.50 $740.00 $740.00

$1,435.35 $1,039.50 $1,039.50 $1,090.00 $1,090.00
$76.50 $76.50 $75.00 $75.00

$35.00 $35.00 $49.00 $49.00 $39.00 $39.00
$699.00 $699.00 $999.50 $999.50
$399.00 $399.00 $499.50 $499.50

$1,059.00 $1,059.00

X X

2-40%
None

2%

Free Shipping

5%
$100.00

11-71%5-35% 2%
None $100.00

Call for Shipping
$50.00
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Laser Plain Paper Fax/Copier/Phone
Fax and Multi-Function Center
Wall/Table Mount UHF Micro Airline 
Aerobic Headset System
Camcorder Package (Includes 
camcorder and case)
3-Piece CD/Radio/Dual Cassette 
Recorder

1-Piece Digital Portable CD/MP3 Player
Digital Camera Package (Includes 
camera and case)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Standard Version)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Economy Version)
6 Station Wireless Listening Center 
Pkg. (Wireless Version)
Wireless PA System
DVD/VCR Combo
Super Multi Format DVD Recorder/VCR 
Combination
Progressive Scan DVD Player
Data Projection Package on Cart
Alternate:  Data Projection Package on 
Cart
Data Projector - Hitachi
Data Projector - Dukane
Alternate:  Data Projector - Dukane
Multimedia Media Cart
Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling Mount
Alternate:  Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling 
Mount
Ceiling Mount
Portable Document Camera
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
4X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 4X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
6X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 6X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
15X
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Sunsplash

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
$282.00 $564.00
$380.00 $380.00

$349.00 $349.00

X X

$383.70 $6,139.20 $237.50 $3,800.00 $162.00 $2,592.00

$427.06 $6,832.96 $149.50 $2,392.00 $131.00 $2,096.00

$521.13 $8,338.08 $258.50 $4,136.00 $230.00 $3,680.00
$598.00 $598.00
$79.00 $237.00 $73.02 $219.06 $77.00 $231.00

$209.00 $627.00 $179.00 $537.00
$59.00 $59.00 $54.95 $54.95 $54.00 $54.00

$1,714.21 $5,142.63

$1,400.00 $1,400.00 $1,052.02 $1,052.02
$1,947.00 $1,947.00 $1,686.04 $1,686.04 $999.00 $999.00

$210.00 $210.00 $275.88 $275.88 $220.00 $220.00 $180.00 $180.00
$2,279.77 $2,279.77

$140.00 $140.00 $159.87 $159.87 $185.00 $185.00
$740.00 $1,480.00 $689.85 $1,379.70

$499.00 $998.00 $507.58 $1,015.16

$887.00 $1,774.00

$597.00 $1,194.00 $682.80 $1,365.60 $535.00 $1,070.00

Kurtz Brothers, Inc.Data Projections, Inc. Learning Services
J.E. Foss Company, 

Inc.
LightSpeed 

Technologies, Inc.Creative IT Solutions
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
3M 1830
Overhead Projector Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector 3M
Overhead Projector Dukane Sunsplash
Overhead Projector Cart
Infocus Deluxe 60" Screen
S-VHS VCR
Portable Sound System
Portable PA System
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
Wall Screens
Multi-Mount
SMART Board Interactive Whiteboard
SMART Board Table Stand
Promethean Activ Board
Promethean Activ Stand
StarBoard FX77 Hitachi Interactive 
Whiteboard
Hitachi BT-1 Freedom Tablet 
Whiteboard

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order
Shipping Information
Additional Information
Present at Opening:
Shelley Freeman, MISD Purchasing
Pam Fennell, MISD Purchasing
X = Does not meet specs.
Blank Cell = No Bid

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Kurtz Brothers, Inc.Data Projections, Inc. Learning Services

J.E. Foss Company, 
Inc.

LightSpeed 
Technologies, Inc.Creative IT Solutions

$529.00 $529.00 $399.00 $399.00
$288.00 $288.00 $159.00 $159.00 $245.00 $245.00
$269.00 $269.00
$157.00 $157.00 $215.50 $215.50 $175.00 $175.00
$429.00 $429.00

$640.00 $640.00
$3,450.00 $3,450.00

$1,108.00 $27,700.00

$1,789.00 $3,578.00

$1,789.00 $1,789.00

$740.00 $740.00

$1,359.00 $1,359.00
$69.00 $69.00 $75.00 $75.00
$24.00 $24.00 $60.00 $60.00

$659.32 $659.32
$99.00 $99.00

None
12%
None

25%

Call for ShippingCall for Shipping
None

3% off catalog except 
software is 10%.5-35%

Bid #TX08051

0-22%
$150.00 NoneCheck with Sales Rep.
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Laser Plain Paper Fax/Copier/Phone
Fax and Multi-Function Center
Wall/Table Mount UHF Micro Airline 
Aerobic Headset System
Camcorder Package (Includes 
camcorder and case)
3-Piece CD/Radio/Dual Cassette 
Recorder

1-Piece Digital Portable CD/MP3 Player
Digital Camera Package (Includes 
camera and case)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Standard Version)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Economy Version)
6 Station Wireless Listening Center 
Pkg. (Wireless Version)
Wireless PA System
DVD/VCR Combo
Super Multi Format DVD Recorder/VCR 
Combination
Progressive Scan DVD Player
Data Projection Package on Cart
Alternate:  Data Projection Package on 
Cart
Data Projector - Hitachi
Data Projector - Dukane
Alternate:  Data Projector - Dukane
Multimedia Media Cart
Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling Mount
Alternate:  Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling 
Mount
Ceiling Mount
Portable Document Camera
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
4X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 4X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
6X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 6X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
15X
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Sunsplash

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

$298.00 $298.00

$47.00 $282.00 $230.00 $1,380.00

$222.00 $3,552.00 $269.00 $4,304.00 $230.95 $3,695.20

$125.00 $2,000.00 $141.00 $2,256.00 $124.95 $1,999.20

$246.00 $3,936.00 $235.00 $3,760.00 $214.95 $3,439.20

$76.00 $228.00

$175.00 $525.00
$57.00 $57.00

$2,151.00 $6,453.00

$1,374.00 $4,122.00

$1,703.00 $1,703.00

$151.00 $151.00 $280.00 $280.00 $143.99 $143.99 $166.00 $166.00
$2,642.00 $2,642.00

$114.00 $114.00 $141.00 $141.00
$857.00 $1,714.00

$570.00 $1,140.00

$362.00 $9,050.00

Long's Electronics, 
Inc.

Schoolhouse Audio 
Visual

Renaissance 
Learning, Inc.

Matthews Office 
Supply

Pathway 
Communications

Pyramid School 
Products
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
3M 1830
Overhead Projector Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector 3M
Overhead Projector Dukane Sunsplash
Overhead Projector Cart
Infocus Deluxe 60" Screen
S-VHS VCR
Portable Sound System
Portable PA System
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
Wall Screens
Multi-Mount
SMART Board Interactive Whiteboard
SMART Board Table Stand
Promethean Activ Board
Promethean Activ Stand
StarBoard FX77 Hitachi Interactive 
Whiteboard
Hitachi BT-1 Freedom Tablet 
Whiteboard

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order
Shipping Information
Additional Information
Present at Opening:
Shelley Freeman, MISD Purchasing
Pam Fennell, MISD Purchasing
X = Does not meet specs.
Blank Cell = No Bid

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Long's Electronics, 
Inc.

Schoolhouse Audio 
Visual

Renaissance 
Learning, Inc.

Matthews Office 
Supply

Pathway 
Communications

Pyramid School 
Products

$656.00 $16,400.00

$479.00 $11,975.00
$448.00 $448.00 $439.50 $439.50
$186.00 $186.00 $136.25 $136.25 $272.75 $272.75
$190.00 $190.00 $183.75 $183.75
$109.00 $109.00 $99.79 $99.79 $115.00 $115.00

$2,928.00 $2,928.00

$1,263.00 $31,575.00 $1,495.00 $37,375.00

$2,399.00 $4,798.00

$2,086.00 $2,086.00

$748.00 $748.00 $780.00 $780.00

$1,497.00 $1,497.00
$66.00 $66.00 $127.00 $127.00

$42.00 $42.00

$1,950.00 $1,950.00
$575.00 $575.00

$1,650.00 $1,650.00

$468.00 $468.00

10-40%
None

5%

Free Shipping
None$100.00

Free Shipping

Cost +10%
None

Call for Shipping
See Catalog

Call for Shipping
Ref. #TX20080227-254

0%5-89%
$50.00
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Laser Plain Paper Fax/Copier/Phone
Fax and Multi-Function Center
Wall/Table Mount UHF Micro Airline 
Aerobic Headset System
Camcorder Package (Includes 
camcorder and case)
3-Piece CD/Radio/Dual Cassette 
Recorder

1-Piece Digital Portable CD/MP3 Player
Digital Camera Package (Includes 
camera and case)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Standard Version)
6 Station Califone Listening Center Pkg. 
(Economy Version)
6 Station Wireless Listening Center 
Pkg. (Wireless Version)
Wireless PA System
DVD/VCR Combo
Super Multi Format DVD Recorder/VCR 
Combination
Progressive Scan DVD Player
Data Projection Package on Cart
Alternate:  Data Projection Package on 
Cart
Data Projector - Hitachi
Data Projector - Dukane
Alternate:  Data Projector - Dukane
Multimedia Media Cart
Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling Mount
Alternate:  Data Projector Pkg. Ceiling 
Mount
Ceiling Mount
Portable Document Camera
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
4X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 4X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
6X
Alternate:  Gooseneck Portable 
Document Camera 6X
Gooseneck Portable Document Camera 
15X
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Sunsplash

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
$303.30 $606.60 $199.15 $398.30
$439.30 $439.30 $365.83 $365.83

$247.44 $247.44 $229.06 $229.06

$327.65 $655.30 $334.68 $669.36

$90.55 $543.30

$341.99 $341.99 $284.92 $284.92

$242.09 $3,873.44 $339.00 $5,424.00 $216.70 $3,467.20

$130.51 $2,088.16 $180.00 $2,880.00 X X

$234.11 $3,745.76 $325.00 $5,200.00
$247.44 $247.44 $229.06 $229.06
$78.10 $234.30 $68.70 $206.10

$170.12 $510.36 $161.40 $484.20
$60.20 $60.20 $49.97 $49.97

$1,224.00 $3,672.00

$867.29 $867.29
$908.11 $908.11

$148.13 $148.13
$1,434.24 $1,434.24

$95.36 $95.36 $105.93 $105.93
$578.95 $1,157.90 $619.00 $1,238.00

$414.41 $828.82 $453.10 $906.20

$417.37 $834.74

$519.41 $1,038.82

$505.00 $1,010.00

$519.41 $1,038.82

$383.73 $9,593.25

Windtree Enterprises
Troxell 

Communications Valiant
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AV Supplies and Equipment
Bid 08-051

Vendor
Description
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector Package (Includes 
overhead, 2 bulbs, cart and installation) 
3M 1830
Overhead Projector Dukane Starfire
Overhead Projector 3M
Overhead Projector Dukane Sunsplash
Overhead Projector Cart
Infocus Deluxe 60" Screen
S-VHS VCR
Portable Sound System
Portable PA System
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television Pkg.
32" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
42" Commercial Grade Multimedia 
HDTV LCD Television
Wall Screens
Multi-Mount
SMART Board Interactive Whiteboard
SMART Board Table Stand
Promethean Activ Board
Promethean Activ Stand
StarBoard FX77 Hitachi Interactive 
Whiteboard
Hitachi BT-1 Freedom Tablet 
Whiteboard

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order
Shipping Information
Additional Information
Present at Opening:
Shelley Freeman, MISD Purchasing
Pam Fennell, MISD Purchasing
X = Does not meet specs.
Blank Cell = No Bid

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Windtree Enterprises

Troxell 
Communications Valiant

$481.25 $12,031.25

$383.73 $9,593.25
X X

$159.17 $159.17
X X

$102.34 $102.34 X X
$67.11 $67.11
$86.77 $86.77

$514.44 $514.44 $511.75 $511.75
$2,193.76 $2,193.76 $2,598.00 $64,950.00

$1,288.65 $32,216.25

$2,419.70 $4,839.40

$2,470.47 $2,470.47

$773.66 $773.66 $691.75 $691.75

$1,636.36 $1,636.36 $1,430.35 $1,430.35
$67.11 $67.11 $124.00 $124.00 $48.00 $48.00
$30.48 $30.48 $32.80 $32.80

$1,295.92 $1,295.92
$239.80 $239.80

X X
X X

$1,295.92 $1,295.92

$255.10 $255.10

None
5-60% 5%

$50.00
Call for Shipping

None
Call for Shipping
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