
Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

1Bands, Rubber – Assorted Sizes, ¼ pound per 
package 40 Pkg $0.35 $14.00 

2Bands, Rubber – Large, ¼ pound per package 20 Pkg $0.35 $7.00 
3Combs, Binder, ¼” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box $3.29 $6.58 $1.89 $3.78 

4Combs, Binder, ½” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box $5.29 $10.58 $4.24 $8.48 

5Combs, Binder, 1” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 3 Box $14.56 $43.68 $12.44 $37.32 

6Cards, Index, 5” X 8” – Ruled, white, 100 per 
package 20 Pkg XX XX $1.87 $37.40 

7Cement, Rubber – Low-odor, acid-free, 4-ounce 
bottle, Ross brand preferred 14 Bottle $1.31 $18.34 $1.07 $14.98 

8Envelope, Clasp – 10” X 13”, 100 per box 2 Box $7.22 $14.44 
9Fluid, Correction – White, Liquid Paper brand or 
equivalent, bottle/brush 50 Bottle $0.28 $14.00 

10Folder, 2-Pocket, Dark Blue – With fasteners, 25 
per box 30 Box $9.21 $276.30 $8.00 $240.00 

11Folder, 2-Pocket, Green – With fasteners, 25 per 
box 340 Box $9.21 $3,131.40 $8.00 $2,720.00 

12Folder, File, Hanging, Legal, Blue – 8½” X 14”, 
color-coded tabs and blank inserts, 25 per box 30 Box $11.24 $337.20 

13Highlighter, Green – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box $2.10 $21.00 

14Highlighter, Pink – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View or 
BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box $2.10 $21.00 

15Highlighter, Yellow – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box $2.10 $21.00 $4.20 $42.00 

16Marker, Dry Erase, Black – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box $6.72 $336.00 $11.16 $558.00 

17Marker, Dry Erase, Blue – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box $14.16 $708.00 $13.08 $654.00 

18Marker, Dry Erase, Green – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box $10.45 $522.50 $13.08 $654.00 

19Marker, Dry Erase, Red – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box $10.92 $546.00 $13.08 $654.00 

20Marker, Overhead, Black – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 
12 per box 10 Box $7.44 $74.40 $10.44 $104.40 

21Marker, Overhead, Red – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 12 
per box 10 Box $7.44 $74.40 $10.44 $104.40 

22Marker, Permanent, Black – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each XX XX

Blick Art Supplies GBCAsel Art Supply Corporate Express Desk Top Supplies
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Blick Art Supplies GBCAsel Art Supply Corporate Express Desk Top Supplies

23Marker, Permanent, Blue – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each $0.49 $4.90 

24Marker, Permanent, Green – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each $0.44 $4.40 

25Marker, Permanent, Red – Marks-A-Lot or Carters, 
regular chisel point 10 Each $0.49 $4.90 

26Marker, Permanent, Black – Fine tip, Sharpie-
Sanford only, 12 per box 5 Box $2.76 $13.80 $8.76 $43.80 

27Notes, Post-It, Canary – 3M brand or equal, 1½” X 
2”, 12 per package 10 Pkg $1.34 $13.40 $2.40 $24.00 

28Paint, Tempera, Black – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $13.64 $13.64 

29Paint, Tempera, Blue – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 2 Gal XX XX $13.64 $27.28 

30Paint, Tempera, Brown – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $11.88 $11.88 

31Paint, Tempera, Green – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $13.64 $13.64 

32Paint, Tempera, Orange – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $13.64 $13.64 

33Paint, Tempera, Red – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $13.64 $13.64 

34Paint, Tempera, Violet/Purple – Non-toxic, 
washable, gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $13.64 $13.64 

35Paint, Tempera, White – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $13.64 $13.64 

36Paint, Tempera, Yellow – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal XX XX $13.64 $13.64 

37Paper, Construction, Violet – 12 X 18, acid-free, 50 
sheets per package, Bemiss and Jason or Riverside 100 Pkg XX XX XX XX

38Pen, Black – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box $1.16 $5.80 $1.32 $6.60 

39Pen, Blue – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box $1.13 $5.65 $1.32 $6.60 

40Pen, Red – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box $1.20 $6.00 $1.32 $6.60 

41Pins, Push – Assorted colors, 100 per box 50 Box $0.65 $32.50 $1.68 $84.00 
42Pins, Safety – Assorted sizes, 50 per box 10 Box
43Rings, Book – ¾” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box $4.28 $4.28 $11.00 $11.00 

44Rings, Book – 1” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box $11.17 $11.17 $12.00 $12.00 
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Blick Art Supplies GBCAsel Art Supply Corporate Express Desk Top Supplies

45Rings, Book – 1½” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 
per box 1 Box $5.89 $5.89 

46Rings, Book – 2” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box $18.26 $18.26 $19.00 $19.00 

47Ruler, Wooden, - 12”, metric and standard 50 Each $0.46 $23.00 $0.22 $11.00 
48Strips, Sentence, Blue – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 100 
per package, Pacon or equal 10 Pkg

49Strips, Sentence, Cherry – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 
100 per package, Pacon or equal 48 Pkg

50Tacks, Thumb – 3/8”, round head, #2, 100 per box 10 Box $0.68 $6.80 

51Tape, Adding Machine – 2¼” X 150' with red 
warning stripe 10 Roll $0.19 $1.90 

52Tape, Poster Adhesive – Double-stick, removable, 
¾” X 150”, Scotch #109 or equal 10 Each $2.75 $27.50 

53Transparencies – Clear, for plain paper copier, dry 
tone copier, 100 per box 5 Box $7.53 $37.65 

Present at opening:  
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent, MISD

20%

Pam Fennell, Buyer, MISD

Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX = Does not meet specifications
Catalog Discount 0% See Catalog 15% 30%
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
1Bands, Rubber – Assorted Sizes, ¼ pound per 
package 40 Pkg

2Bands, Rubber – Large, ¼ pound per package 20 Pkg
3Combs, Binder, ¼” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box

4Combs, Binder, ½” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box

5Combs, Binder, 1” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 3 Box

6Cards, Index, 5” X 8” – Ruled, white, 100 per 
package 20 Pkg

7Cement, Rubber – Low-odor, acid-free, 4-ounce 
bottle, Ross brand preferred 14 Bottle

8Envelope, Clasp – 10” X 13”, 100 per box 2 Box
9Fluid, Correction – White, Liquid Paper brand or 
equivalent, bottle/brush 50 Bottle

10Folder, 2-Pocket, Dark Blue – With fasteners, 25 
per box 30 Box

11Folder, 2-Pocket, Green – With fasteners, 25 per 
box 340 Box

12Folder, File, Hanging, Legal, Blue – 8½” X 14”, 
color-coded tabs and blank inserts, 25 per box 30 Box

13Highlighter, Green – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

14Highlighter, Pink – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View or 
BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

15Highlighter, Yellow – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

16Marker, Dry Erase, Black – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box

17Marker, Dry Erase, Blue – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box

18Marker, Dry Erase, Green – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box

19Marker, Dry Erase, Red – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box

20Marker, Overhead, Black – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 
12 per box 10 Box

21Marker, Overhead, Red – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 12 
per box 10 Box

22Marker, Permanent, Black – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

$0.59 $23.60 $0.65 $26.00 $0.56 $22.40 $1.28 $51.20 

$0.59 $11.80 $0.65 $13.00 $0.56 $11.20 $1.28 $25.60 

$5.82 $11.64 $5.49 $10.98 XX XX $5.85 $11.70 

$9.56 $19.12 $8.79 $17.58 XX XX $9.81 $19.62 

$24.58 $73.74 $21.99 $65.97 XX XX $24.04 $72.12 

$1.29 $25.80 $0.88 $17.60 $0.55 $11.00 $1.58 $31.60 

$1.39 $19.46 $1.06 $14.84 $0.94 $13.16 $1.32 $18.48 

$8.99 $17.98 $8.63 $17.26 $6.75 $13.50 $8.80 $17.60 

$0.39 $19.50 $0.89 $44.50 $0.19 $9.50 $0.79 $39.50 

$21.00 $630.00 $9.60 $288.00 $6.59 $197.70 $13.79 $413.70 

$21.00 $7,140.00 $9.60 $3,264.00 XX XX $13.79 $4,688.60 

$16.99 $509.70 $7.75 $232.50 $10.61 $318.30 $14.88 $446.40 

XX XX $4.63 $46.30 $3.20 $32.00 $3.48 $34.80 

XX XX $4.63 $46.30 $3.20 $32.00 $3.48 $34.80 

XX XX $4.05 $40.50 $3.20 $32.00 $3.48 $34.80 

$10.68 $534.00 $9.20 $460.00 $7.71 $385.50 $11.50 $575.00 

$12.68 $634.00 $9.20 $460.00 XX XX $11.50 $575.00 

$12.68 $634.00 $9.20 $460.00 $11.50 $575.00 

$12.68 $634.00 $9.20 $460.00 $8.40 $420.00 $11.50 $575.00 

$9.36 $93.60 $8.60 $86.00 $7.22 $72.20 $9.72 $97.20 

$9.36 $93.60 $8.60 $86.00 $7.22 $72.20 $9.72 $97.20 

$0.45 $4.50 $0.53 $5.30 $0.43 $4.30 $0.49 $4.90 

Matthews Office 
Supply

Oak Cliff Office 
Products Office DepotMaple Office Supply

Preferred Office 
Product, Inc.
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
23Marker, Permanent, Blue – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

24Marker, Permanent, Green – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

25Marker, Permanent, Red – Marks-A-Lot or Carters, 
regular chisel point 10 Each

26Marker, Permanent, Black – Fine tip, Sharpie-
Sanford only, 12 per box 5 Box

27Notes, Post-It, Canary – 3M brand or equal, 1½” X 
2”, 12 per package 10 Pkg

28Paint, Tempera, Black – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

29Paint, Tempera, Blue – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 2 Gal

30Paint, Tempera, Brown – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

31Paint, Tempera, Green – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

32Paint, Tempera, Orange – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

33Paint, Tempera, Red – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

34Paint, Tempera, Violet/Purple – Non-toxic, 
washable, gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

35Paint, Tempera, White – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

36Paint, Tempera, Yellow – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

37Paper, Construction, Violet – 12 X 18, acid-free, 50 
sheets per package, Bemiss and Jason or Riverside 100 Pkg

38Pen, Black – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

39Pen, Blue – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

40Pen, Red – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

41Pins, Push – Assorted colors, 100 per box 50 Box
42Pins, Safety – Assorted sizes, 50 per box 10 Box
43Rings, Book – ¾” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

44Rings, Book – 1” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Matthews Office 
Supply

Oak Cliff Office 
Products Office DepotMaple Office Supply

Preferred Office 
Product, Inc.

XX XX $0.45 $4.50 $0.53 $5.30 $0.43 $4.30 $0.49 $4.90 

$7.34 $73.40 $0.45 $4.50 $0.53 $5.30 $0.43 $4.30 $0.64 $6.40 

XX XX $0.45 $4.50 $0.53 $5.30 $0.43 $4.30 $0.49 $4.90 

$7.67 $38.35 $5.88 $29.40 $7.05 $35.25 $4.85 $24.25 $7.32 $36.60 

$1.59 $15.90 $3.00 $30.00 $1.49 $14.90 $1.52 $15.20 $1.39 $13.90 

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

$19.71 $39.42 $21.99 $43.98 XX XX

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

$19.71 $19.71 $21.99 $21.99 XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX XX XX $3.45 $345.00 

XX XX XX XX $0.98 $4.90 $0.99 $4.95 $1.62 $8.10 

XX XX XX XX $0.98 $4.90 $0.99 $4.95 $1.62 $8.10 

XX XX XX XX $0.98 $4.90 $0.99 $4.95 $1.62 $8.10 

$0.86 $43.00 $0.69 $34.50 $0.59 $29.50 $0.87 $43.50 $0.96 $48.00 
$0.75 $7.50 $0.80 $8.00 

$7.08 $7.08 $11.99 $11.99 $7.98 $7.98 $3.18 $3.18 $8.95 $8.95 

$7.48 $7.48 $13.99 $13.99 $8.20 $8.20 $3.52 $3.52 $9.74 $9.74 
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
45Rings, Book – 1½” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 
per box 1 Box

46Rings, Book – 2” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

47Ruler, Wooden, - 12”, metric and standard 50 Each
48Strips, Sentence, Blue – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 100 
per package, Pacon or equal 10 Pkg

49Strips, Sentence, Cherry – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 
100 per package, Pacon or equal 48 Pkg

50Tacks, Thumb – 3/8”, round head, #2, 100 per box 10 Box

51Tape, Adding Machine – 2¼” X 150' with red 
warning stripe 10 Roll

52Tape, Poster Adhesive – Double-stick, removable, 
¾” X 150”, Scotch #109 or equal 10 Each

53Transparencies – Clear, for plain paper copier, dry 
tone copier, 100 per box 5 Box

Present at opening:  
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent, MISD
Pam Fennell, Buyer, MISD

Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX = Does not meet specifications
Catalog Discount

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Matthews Office 
Supply

Oak Cliff Office 
Products Office DepotMaple Office Supply

Preferred Office 
Product, Inc.

$8.62 $8.62 $15.99 $15.99 $10.99 $10.99 $4.32 $4.32 $13.32 $13.32 

$6.56 $6.56 $11.99 $11.99 $6.99 $6.99 $3.21 $3.21 $7.77 $7.77 

$0.21 $10.50 XX XX $0.31 $15.50 $0.40 $20.00 $1.28 $64.00 

$4.24 $42.40 $2.49 $24.90 

$4.24 $203.52 $2.48 $119.04 

$0.73 $7.30 $0.89 $8.90 $0.41 $4.10 $0.59 $5.90 $0.89 $8.90 

$0.60 $6.00 $0.42 $4.20 $0.39 $3.90 $0.29 $2.90 $0.55 $5.50 

$4.28 $42.80 XX XX $2.69 $26.90 $4.58 $45.80 

$11.88 $59.40 $12.49 $62.45 $10.99 $54.95 $6.60 $33.00 $20.39 $101.95 

15-60% 5-89% 10% 5-92% 0%
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
1Bands, Rubber – Assorted Sizes, ¼ pound per 
package 40 Pkg

2Bands, Rubber – Large, ¼ pound per package 20 Pkg
3Combs, Binder, ¼” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box

4Combs, Binder, ½” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box

5Combs, Binder, 1” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 3 Box

6Cards, Index, 5” X 8” – Ruled, white, 100 per 
package 20 Pkg

7Cement, Rubber – Low-odor, acid-free, 4-ounce 
bottle, Ross brand preferred 14 Bottle

8Envelope, Clasp – 10” X 13”, 100 per box 2 Box
9Fluid, Correction – White, Liquid Paper brand or 
equivalent, bottle/brush 50 Bottle

10Folder, 2-Pocket, Dark Blue – With fasteners, 25 
per box 30 Box

11Folder, 2-Pocket, Green – With fasteners, 25 per 
box 340 Box

12Folder, File, Hanging, Legal, Blue – 8½” X 14”, 
color-coded tabs and blank inserts, 25 per box 30 Box

13Highlighter, Green – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

14Highlighter, Pink – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View or 
BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

15Highlighter, Yellow – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

16Marker, Dry Erase, Black – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box

17Marker, Dry Erase, Blue – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box

18Marker, Dry Erase, Green – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box

19Marker, Dry Erase, Red – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box

20Marker, Overhead, Black – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 
12 per box 10 Box

21Marker, Overhead, Red – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 12 
per box 10 Box

22Marker, Permanent, Black – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

$0.46 $18.40 

$0.46 $9.20 

$2.41 $4.82 XX XX

$4.06 $8.12 XX XX

$10.45 $31.35 XX XX

$0.74 $14.80 $0.750 $15.00 

$0.89 $12.46 XX XX XX XX

$4.70 $9.40 $6.79 $13.58 

$0.60 $30.00 $0.81 $40.50 $0.86 $43.00 

XX XX $6.93 $207.90 $5.17 $155.10 

XX XX $6.93 $2,356.20 $5.17 $1,757.80 

$7.90 $237.00 $5.50 $165.00 

$2.62 $26.20 $9.36 $93.60 

$2.62 $26.20 $3.50 $35.00 

$2.62 $26.20 $3.50 $35.00 

$6.48 $324.00 $7.20 $360.00 $8.76 $438.00 

$6.48 $324.00 $7.20 $360.00 $8.76 $438.00 

$6.48 $324.00 $7.21 $360.50 $8.76 $438.00 

$6.48 $324.00 $7.20 $360.00 $8.76 $438.00 

$5.86 $58.60 $8.16 $81.60 

$5.86 $58.60 $8.16 $81.60 

$0.42 $4.20 $0.51 $5.10 

School Specialty Scott ElectricS&S Worldwide
Pyramid School 

Products Quill Corporation
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
23Marker, Permanent, Blue – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

24Marker, Permanent, Green – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

25Marker, Permanent, Red – Marks-A-Lot or Carters, 
regular chisel point 10 Each

26Marker, Permanent, Black – Fine tip, Sharpie-
Sanford only, 12 per box 5 Box

27Notes, Post-It, Canary – 3M brand or equal, 1½” X 
2”, 12 per package 10 Pkg

28Paint, Tempera, Black – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

29Paint, Tempera, Blue – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 2 Gal

30Paint, Tempera, Brown – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

31Paint, Tempera, Green – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

32Paint, Tempera, Orange – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

33Paint, Tempera, Red – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

34Paint, Tempera, Violet/Purple – Non-toxic, 
washable, gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

35Paint, Tempera, White – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

36Paint, Tempera, Yellow – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

37Paper, Construction, Violet – 12 X 18, acid-free, 50 
sheets per package, Bemiss and Jason or Riverside 100 Pkg

38Pen, Black – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

39Pen, Blue – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

40Pen, Red – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

41Pins, Push – Assorted colors, 100 per box 50 Box
42Pins, Safety – Assorted sizes, 50 per box 10 Box
43Rings, Book – ¾” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

44Rings, Book – 1” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

School Specialty Scott ElectricS&S Worldwide
Pyramid School 

Products Quill Corporation

$0.42 $4.20 $0.51 $5.10 

$0.42 $4.20 $0.51 $5.10 

$0.42 $4.20 $0.51 $5.10 

$4.80 $24.00 $5.40 $27.00 $6.84 $34.20 

$0.99 $9.90 $1.12 $11.20 $1.03 $10.30 

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX XX XX

XX XX XX XX

$0.86 $4.30 $0.94 $4.70 $1.01 $5.05 

$0.86 $4.30 $0.94 $4.70 $1.01 $5.05 

$0.86 $4.30 $0.94 $4.70 $1.01 $5.05 

XX XX $0.26 $13.00 $0.27 $13.50 
$0.14 $1.40 $0.14 $1.40 

$2.00 $2.00 

$3.00 $3.00 $1.98 $1.98 
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
45Rings, Book – 1½” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 
per box 1 Box

46Rings, Book – 2” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

47Ruler, Wooden, - 12”, metric and standard 50 Each
48Strips, Sentence, Blue – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 100 
per package, Pacon or equal 10 Pkg

49Strips, Sentence, Cherry – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 
100 per package, Pacon or equal 48 Pkg

50Tacks, Thumb – 3/8”, round head, #2, 100 per box 10 Box

51Tape, Adding Machine – 2¼” X 150' with red 
warning stripe 10 Roll

52Tape, Poster Adhesive – Double-stick, removable, 
¾” X 150”, Scotch #109 or equal 10 Each

53Transparencies – Clear, for plain paper copier, dry 
tone copier, 100 per box 5 Box

Present at opening:  
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent, MISD
Pam Fennell, Buyer, MISD

Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX = Does not meet specifications
Catalog Discount

Unit Price
Extended 

Price Unit Price
Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

School Specialty Scott ElectricS&S Worldwide
Pyramid School 

Products Quill Corporation

$2.59 $2.59 

$2.12 $2.12 

$0.13 $6.50 $0.16 $8.00 $0.40 $20.00 $0.07 $3.50 

$1.99 $19.90 $1.57 $15.70 

$1.79 $85.92 $1.57 $75.36 

$0.18 $1.80 $0.20 $2.00 $0.10 $1.00 

$0.70 $7.00 $0.32 $3.20 

$2.49 $24.90 $2.51 $25.10 $2.81 $28.10 

$5.40 $27.00 $9.33 $46.65 $6.56 $32.80 $5.00 $25.00 

20% 10% 14% 10-25% 0%
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
1Bands, Rubber – Assorted Sizes, ¼ pound per 
package 40 Pkg

2Bands, Rubber – Large, ¼ pound per package 20 Pkg
3Combs, Binder, ¼” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box

4Combs, Binder, ½” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 2 Box

5Combs, Binder, 1” – Black, plastic combs for 
binding, 100 per box, IBICO or GBC 3 Box

6Cards, Index, 5” X 8” – Ruled, white, 100 per 
package 20 Pkg

7Cement, Rubber – Low-odor, acid-free, 4-ounce 
bottle, Ross brand preferred 14 Bottle

8Envelope, Clasp – 10” X 13”, 100 per box 2 Box
9Fluid, Correction – White, Liquid Paper brand or 
equivalent, bottle/brush 50 Bottle

10Folder, 2-Pocket, Dark Blue – With fasteners, 25 
per box 30 Box

11Folder, 2-Pocket, Green – With fasteners, 25 per 
box 340 Box

12Folder, File, Hanging, Legal, Blue – 8½” X 14”, 
color-coded tabs and blank inserts, 25 per box 30 Box

13Highlighter, Green – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

14Highlighter, Pink – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View or 
BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

15Highlighter, Yellow – Pen type, EF Uniblazer View 
or BIC Bright Line, 12 per box 10 Box

16Marker, Dry Erase, Black – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box

17Marker, Dry Erase, Blue – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box

18Marker, Dry Erase, Green – Expo II, low-odor, 
chisel-tip, 12 per box 50 Box

19Marker, Dry Erase, Red – Expo II, low-odor, chisel-
tip, 12 per box 50 Box

20Marker, Overhead, Black – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 
12 per box 10 Box

21Marker, Overhead, Red – Waterbase, Vis-à-vis, 12 
per box 10 Box

22Marker, Permanent, Black – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

$0.378 $15.12 $1.18 $47.20 

$0.378 $7.56 $1.18 $23.60 

$5.94 $11.88 

$9.08 $18.16 

$22.13 $66.39 

$0.95 $19.00 $1.44 $28.80 

XX XX $1.21 $16.94 

$7.33 $14.66 $18.44 $36.88 

$0.612 $30.60 $0.67 $33.50 

$5.54 $166.20 $18.48 $554.40 

$5.54 $1,883.60 $18.48 $6,283.20 

$7.82 $234.60 $12.83 $384.90 

XX XX $4.48 $44.80 

XX XX $4.48 $44.80 

XX XX $4.48 $44.80 

$6.55 $327.50 $12.54 $627.00 XX XX

$6.55 $327.50 $12.54 $627.00 XX XX

$6.55 $327.50 $12.54 $627.00 XX XX

$6.55 $327.50 $12.54 $627.00 XX XX

$7.06 $70.60 $10.05 $100.50 XX XX

$7.06 $70.60 $10.05 $100.50 XX XX

XX XX $0.59 $5.90 XX XX

Windtree Enterprises
Total Office 

Equipment Service
Standard Stationary 

Supply Co.
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Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
23Marker, Permanent, Blue – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

24Marker, Permanent, Green – Marks-A-Lot or 
Carters, regular chisel point 10 Each

25Marker, Permanent, Red – Marks-A-Lot or Carters, 
regular chisel point 10 Each

26Marker, Permanent, Black – Fine tip, Sharpie-
Sanford only, 12 per box 5 Box

27Notes, Post-It, Canary – 3M brand or equal, 1½” X 
2”, 12 per package 10 Pkg

28Paint, Tempera, Black – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

29Paint, Tempera, Blue – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 2 Gal

30Paint, Tempera, Brown – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

31Paint, Tempera, Green – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

32Paint, Tempera, Orange – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

33Paint, Tempera, Red – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

34Paint, Tempera, Violet/Purple – Non-toxic, 
washable, gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

35Paint, Tempera, White – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

36Paint, Tempera, Yellow – Non-toxic, washable, 
gallon, Ross or Versatemp 1 Gal

37Paper, Construction, Violet – 12 X 18, acid-free, 50 
sheets per package, Bemiss and Jason or Riverside 100 Pkg

38Pen, Black – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

39Pen, Blue – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

40Pen, Red – Fine Point, BIC or Papermate, 12 per 
box 5 Box

41Pins, Push – Assorted colors, 100 per box 50 Box
42Pins, Safety – Assorted sizes, 50 per box 10 Box
43Rings, Book – ¾” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

44Rings, Book – 1” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Windtree Enterprises
Total Office 

Equipment Service
Standard Stationary 

Supply Co.

XX XX $0.59 $5.90 XX XX

XX XX $0.59 $5.90 XX XX

XX XX $0.59 $5.90 XX XX

$5.86 $29.30 $7.92 $39.60 $7.08 $35.40 

$3.11 $31.10 $1.73 $17.30 

$12.95 $12.95 

$12.95 $25.90 

$12.95 $12.95 

$12.95 $12.95 

$12.95 $12.95 

$12.95 $12.95 

$12.95 $12.95 

$12.95 $12.95 

$12.95 $12.95 

$0.94 $4.70 $5.21 $26.05 

$0.94 $4.70 $5.21 $26.05 

$0.94 $4.70 $5.21 $26.05 

$0.347 $17.35 $0.85 $42.50 
$0.21 $2.10 

$1.92 $1.92 $7.72 $7.72 

$2.24 $2.24 $8.39 $8.39 

Page 11 of 12



Bid # 08-047
Office Supplies

VENDORS

Qty Unit
45Rings, Book – 1½” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 
per box 1 Box

46Rings, Book – 2” capacity, looseleaf rings, 100 per 
box 1 Box

47Ruler, Wooden, - 12”, metric and standard 50 Each
48Strips, Sentence, Blue – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 100 
per package, Pacon or equal 10 Pkg

49Strips, Sentence, Cherry – 3" X 24", 1½”, ruled, 
100 per package, Pacon or equal 48 Pkg

50Tacks, Thumb – 3/8”, round head, #2, 100 per box 10 Box

51Tape, Adding Machine – 2¼” X 150' with red 
warning stripe 10 Roll

52Tape, Poster Adhesive – Double-stick, removable, 
¾” X 150”, Scotch #109 or equal 10 Each

53Transparencies – Clear, for plain paper copier, dry 
tone copier, 100 per box 5 Box

Present at opening:  
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent, MISD
Pam Fennell, Buyer, MISD

Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX = Does not meet specifications
Catalog Discount

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Windtree Enterprises
Total Office 

Equipment Service
Standard Stationary 

Supply Co.

$2.52 $2.52 $11.77 $11.77 

$2.22 $2.22 $6.85 $6.85 

$0.079 $3.95 $0.65 $32.50 

$0.122 $1.22 $0.70 $7.00 

$0.52 $5.20 $5.76 $57.60 

XX XX $22.72 $113.60 

0%0% 10%
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