Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS
Ace Mart Best Products Co. Calico Industries Campbell Paper [ Central Poly Corp.
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Tilt Truck, 1-Cubic Yard — Utility duty, mass capacity 850 pounds, wheel size
12", 2 casters, black. Rubbermaid 1314 or equal 8 Each | $572.40 | $4,579.20 $392.44 | $3,139.52 $677.80 | $5,422.40
Alternate: Tilt Truck 8 Each
Lid for Tilt Truck (Line Item #1) — Domed, hinged lid. 4 Each [ $141.60 | $566.40 $114.34 | $457.36 $289.99 | $1,159.96
Alternate: Lid for Tilt Truck 4 Each
Bucket, Mop, - 44-quart, yellow, 3" casters, large capacity bucket, to fit with
wringer in Line ltem #4 below 48 | Each | $50.62 | $2,429.76 $40.84 | $1,960.32 $67.84 | $3,256.32
Alternate: Bucket Mop 48 | Each
Wringer, Mop Bucket — To fit 44-quart bucket, mop capacity 32 ounces,
downward pressure, yellow, Rubbermaid #7575-88 or equal 78 | Each $59.91 | $4,672.98 | $35.44 | $2,764.32 $76.80 [ $5,990.40
Alternate: Wringer, Mop Bucket 78 | Each
Bowl Mop, acid resistant yarn, 144 per package 700 | Each $0.54 $378.00
Alternate: Bowl Mop 700 | Each
Brooms, - 13" sweep surface, angle cut 264 | Each $9.48 $2,502.72 | $8.78 | $2,317.92 | $2.94 $776.16
Squeegee, Floor - 18” with handle 48 | Each [ $19.22 $922.56 $13.49 | $647.52 $5.37 $257.76
Scraper, Long-Handled — 4” blade, Unger #LH12C or equal 50 | Each $11.54 | $577.00
Alternate: Scraper, Long-Handled 50 | Each
Dust Pans - Long-handled, 6 per case 84 | Each [ $11.52 $967.68 $9.68 $813.12 $5.84 $490.56
Bottles, Plastic Bottles - For use with trigger sprayer on item below, Continental
922B or equal 600 | Each $0.48 $288.00 $0.41 $246.00
Sprayer, Trigger - For use with bottles. 560 | Each $0.74 $414.40 XX XX
Pads, Green, Scrubbing — 6” X 9", 20 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 163 [ Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Green, Scrubbing 163 | Case
Pad, Doodle Bug - With holder 72 | Each XX XX
Scraper, Razor — With one (1) blade 450 | Each
Rags, Terry Cloth - Cotton, 12" X 12", 50# box 110 | Box $62.14 | $6,835.40
Mask, Dust — 50 per box 28 Box $5.94 $166.32
Sign, Floor Sign, - “Wet Floor”, yellow, bilingual (English/Spanish), Rubbermaid
#6112 or equal 48 | Each $8.27 $396.96 $8.46 $406.08 $5.72 $274.56 $10.99 $527.52
Alternate: Sign, Floor Sign 48 | Each
Janitor Cart — With vinyl bag, 20"W “ X 44-7/8"D X 38-1/4"H, Rubbermaid #6173| 30 | Each | $139.80 | $4,194.00 | $105.90| $3,177.00 | $78.64 | $2,359.20 $199.99 | $5,999.70
Alternate: Janitor Cart 30 | Each
Can, Waste — 7 gal, black, Rubbermaid #2956 or equal 500 | Each $4.00 $2,000.00 | $3.25 | $1,625.00 | $2.57 | $1,285.00 $7.23 | $3,615.00
Alternate: Can, Waste 7 gal 500 | Each
Can, Waste — 55-gallon, Rubbermaid Brute 2655 grey, or equal 96 | Each | $50.40 | $4,838.40 | $41.78 | $4,010.88 | $40.97 | $3,933.12 $87.60 [ $8,409.60
Alternate: Can, Waste 55-gallon 500 | Each
Casters — To fit Brute 55-gallon trash container, Rubbermaid or equal 50 | Each | $32.72 | $1,636.00 | $27.75 | $1,387.50 XX XX $39.99 [ $1,999.50
Alternate: Casters 50 | Each
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 14", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 5 Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue 14" 5 Case
Pads, Buffing - Green, 17", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 22 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Green 17" 22 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 19", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 12 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 19" 12 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 31 | Case $46.45 | $1,439.95 XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 20" 31 | Case
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS
Ace Mart Best Products Co. Calico Industries Campbell Paper [ Central Poly Corp.
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Pads, Buffing - Pro black, 20", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 117 | Case $48.95 | $5,727.15 | $15.54 | $1,818.18
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Pro black 20" 117 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Red, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 48 | Case $46.45 | $2,229.60 XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Red, 20" 48 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case $9.34 $280.20
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing 14", Reg. 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing, 14" Lite 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 17 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 17 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 15 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 15 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Regular 26 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 26 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Lite 60 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 60 | Case
Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 85 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing 85 | Case
Adapter, Threaded Wood Cone — Internal Acme Thread, Unger TWAO0O 6 Each
Caddy, Johnny Mop — Acid-resistant plastic, 2 compartments 10 | Each
Blade - Single edge, for use with scraper 14 Pkg
Sprayer, Tank — 3-gallon, pump up 11 | Each
Grabber/Picker — Unger NN90O or equal 10 | Each $19.64 | $196.40
Alternate: Grabber/ Pickers 10 | Each
Bucket — 10-quart, plastic, Rubbermaid #2963 8 Each $5.59 $44.72 $5.15 $41.20 $3.64 $29.12 $9.99 $79.92
Alternate: Bucket 8 Each
Ladder, Step - Fiberglass, 6-foot, 250 pounds maximum, Type 1 5 Each
Squeegee - Window, 12" blade 43 | Each XX XX XX XX
Squeegee - Window, 18" blade 12 | Each XX XX $21.99 | $263.88
Gloves- Rubber, medium 228 | Pair $3.49 $795.72 $0.44 $100.32
Gloves- Rubber, large 144 | Pair $3.49 $502.56 $0.44 $63.36
Gloves- Rubber, extra-large 48 Pair $3.49 $167.52 $0.44 $21.12
Blade, Scraper, Replacement — 4", hardened tempered steel, 100 per package,
Under RB10C or equal 90 Pkg $4.64 $417.60
Alternate: Blade, Scraper, Replacement 90 Pkg
Duster, Telescopic, 60" 396 | Each
Alternate: Duster, Telescopic 396 | Each
Dust Pan — Metal, 12", 1-piece construction 12 | Each $2.74 $32.88 $3.79 $45.48 $2.54 $30.48
Bags, Vacuum - For Advance, 10 per package, APA#56703768 160 | Pkg
Bags, Vacuum - For Nobles Ultra Glide, 8 bags per package 290 | Pkg
Receptacle, Sanitary Napkin Disposal 30 | Each [ $29.18 $875.40 $24.64 | $739.20 $39.99 [ $1,199.70
Alternate: Receptacle 30 | Each
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS
Ace Mart Best Products Co. Calico Industries Campbell Paper [ Central Poly Corp.
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Liners, Sanitary Napkin Receptacle — Waxed, 250 bags per carton, Rubbermaid
#6141 or equal 66 | Carton| $20.52 [ $1,354.32 $17.54 | $1,157.64 $38.99 | $2,573.34
Alternate: Liners 66 | Carton
Glasses, Safety, Clear - ANSI approved 390 | Each $8.49 | $3,311.10
Glasses, Safety, Tinted - ANSI approved 30 | Each $8.49 $254.70
Pad, 14", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 24 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pad, 14", Red 24 | Case
Pad, 15", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 8 Case XX XX
Alternate: Pad, 15", Red 8 Case
Pad, 17", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 62 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pad, 17", Red 62 | Case
Pad, 19", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 37 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pad, 19", Red 37 | Case
Distilled Water — Gallon 120 | Each
Pole, Extension— 18" aluminum with locking collars, ergonomic handle, snap-in
threaded nylon cone adapter. Unger #UNGEP18 or equal 5 Each $39.84 | $199.20
Alternate: Pole, Extension 5 Each
Washer, Strip, 18" — With handle, Unger #UNG WS18 or equal 15 | Each
Alternate: Washer, Strip, 18" 15 | Each
soft goods and
smallwares 20%; call
for quote on
Discount from Catalog/Shelf Pricing 7% equipment 35% 5%

Present at opening:
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell, Buyer

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS
Complete Supply | Corporate Express Empire Paper Grainger
Unit Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Tilt Truck, 1-Cubic Yard — Utility duty, mass capacity 850 pounds, wheel size
12", 2 casters, black. Rubbermaid 1314 or equal 8 Each | $405.56 | $3,244.48 | $507.24 | $4,057.92 ($512.61 | $4,100.88 | $461.39 | $3,691.12
Alternate: Tilt Truck 8 Each
Lid for Tilt Truck (Line Item #1) — Domed, hinged lid. 4 Each | $111.52 | $446.08 | $131.96 | $527.84 |$119.39 | $477.56 | $125.51| $502.04
Alternate: Lid for Tilt Truck 4 Each
Bucket, Mop, - 44-quart, yellow, 3" casters, large capacity bucket, to fit with
wringer in Line Item #4 below 48 | Each [ $39.34 [ $1,888.32 | $52.57 | $2,523.36 [ $39.34 | $1,888.32 | $104.00 | $4,992.00
Alternate: Bucket Mop 48 | Each
Wringer, Mop Bucket — To fit 44-quart bucket, mop capacity 32 ounces,
downward pressure, yellow, Rubbermaid #7575-88 or equal 78 | Each XX XX $73.14 | $5,704.92 | $33.60 | $2,620.80 | $63.17 [ $4,927.26
Alternate: Wringer, Mop Bucket 78 | Each
Bowl Mop, acid resistant yarn, 144 per package 700 [ Each $0.57 $399.00 | $0.69 | $483.00 $0.50 $350.00
Alternate: Bowl Mop 700 | Each
Brooms, - 13" sweep surface, angle cut 264 [ Each $3.95 | $1,042.80 [ $3.28 | $865.92 $4.41 | $1,164.24
Squeegee, Floor - 18" with handle 48 | Each $6.58 $315.84 | $20.27 | $972.96 | $9.23 [ $443.04 $8.06 $386.88
Scraper, Long-Handled — 4" blade, Unger #LH12C or equal 50 | Each XX XX $14.17 | $708.50 XX XX $10.54 $527.00
Alternate: Scraper, Long-Handled 50 | Each
Dust Pans - Long-handled, 6 per case 84 | Each $5.66 $475.44 | $11.96 | $1,004.64 | $5.79 | $486.36 | $10.47 $879.48
Bottles, Plastic Bottles - For use with trigger sprayer on item below, Continental
922B or equal 600 | Each $0.33 $198.00 $0.470 $282.00 [ $0.38 $228.00 $0.49 $294.00
Sprayer, Trigger - For use with bottles. 560 | Each $0.31 $173.60 | $0.570 | $319.20 | $0.35 | $196.00 $0.44 $246.40
Pads, Green, Scrubbing — 6” X 9”, 20 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 163 | Case XX XX $7.14 [ $1,163.82 | $7.28 |$1,186.64 | $8.50 | $1,385.50
Alternate: Pads, Green, Scrubbing 163 | Case
Pad, Doodle Bug - With holder 72 Each $31.01 | $2,232.72 | $122.05 | $8,787.60
Scraper, Razor — With one (1) blade 450 | Each $8.82 | $3,969.00 $1.39 $625.50
Rags, Terry Cloth - Cotton, 12" X 12", 50# box 110 | Box $97.78 | $10,755.80
Mask, Dust — 50 per box 28 Box $6.30 $176.40 $4.02 $112.56
Sign, Floor Sign, - “Wet Floor”, yellow, bilingual (English/Spanish), Rubbermaid
#6112 or equal 48 | Each $5.52 $264.96 | $10.13 | $486.24 | $5.91 [ $283.68 $8.76 $420.48
Alternate: Sign, Floor Sign 48 | Each
Janitor Cart — With vinyl bag, 20"W “ X 44-7/8"D X 38-1/4"H, Rubbermaid #6173| 30 | Each [ $75.82 | $2,274.60 | $107.28 | $3,218.40 | $74.19 | $2,225.70 | $118.12 [ $3,543.60
Alternate: Janitor Cart 30 | Each
Can, Waste — 7 gal, black, Rubbermaid #2956 or equal 500 [ Each $2.47 | $1,235.00 | $3.82 | $1,910.00 | $2.42 |$1,210.00 | $4.49 [ $2,245.00
Alternate: Can, Waste 7 gal 500 | Each
Can, Waste — 55-gallon, Rubbermaid Brute 2655 grey, or equal 96 | Each | $44.97 | $4,317.12 | $44.67 | $4,288.32 | $44.00 | $4,224.00 | $53.46 | $5,132.16
Alternate: Can, Waste 55-gallon 500 | Each
Casters — To fit Brute 55-gallon trash container, Rubbermaid or equal 50 | Each XX XX $31.62 | $1,581.00 XX XX $35.93 | $1,796.50
Alternate: Casters 50 | Each
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 14", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 5 Case XX XX $16.58 $82.90 XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue 14" 5 Case
Pads, Buffing - Green, 17", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 22 | Case XX XX $24.93 | $548.46 XX XX $20.72 $455.84
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Green 17" 22 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 19", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 12 | Case XX XX $25.66 | $307.92 XX XX $21.32 $255.84
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 19" 12 [ Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 31 | Case XX XX $27.89 | $864.59 XX XX $23.28 $721.68
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 20" 31 | Case
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS
Complete Supply | Corporate Express Empire Paper Grainger
Unit Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Pads, Buffing - Pro black, 20", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 117 | Case | $14.80 | $1,731.60 | $53.62 | $6,273.54 | $13.19 [$1,543.23 | $44.46 | $5,201.82
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Pro black 20" 117 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Red, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 48 | Case XX XX $27.89 | $1,338.72 XX XX $23.25 | $1,116.00
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Red, 20" 48 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case XX XX $9.69 $290.70
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing 14", Reg. 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 [ Case XX XX $9.69 $242.25
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing, 14" Lite 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 17 [ Case XX XX $44.21 | $751.57 | $20.02 | $340.34
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 17 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 15 [ Case XX XX $44.21 | $663.15 | $20.02 | $300.30
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 15 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case XX XX $60.26 | $1,807.80 XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 [ Case XX XX $60.26 | $1,506.50 XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Regular 26 [ Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 26 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Lite 60 [ Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 60 [ Case
Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 85 | Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing 85 | Case
Adapter, Threaded Wood Cone — Internal Acme Thread, Unger TWAQO 6 Each $3.18 $19.08 $3.17 $19.02
Caddy, Johnny Mop — Acid-resistant plastic, 2 compartments 10 | Each XX XX $5.04 $50.40
Blade - Single edge, for use with scraper 14 Pkg $17.14 | $239.96 $9.04 $126.56 [ $18.35 | $256.90 $3.09 $43.26
Sprayer, Tank — 3-gallon, pump up 11 | Each | $34.19 | $376.09 | $28.39 | $312.29 | $36.60 | $402.60 | $39.51 $434.61
Grabber/Picker — Unger NN90O or equal 10 | Each $23.93 | $239.30 |$16.22 | $162.20 | $12.57 $125.70
Alternate: Grabber/ Pickers 10 | Each
Bucket — 10-quart, plastic, Rubbermaid #2963 8 Each $3.78 $30.24 $7.11 $56.88 $4.59 $36.72 $9.56 $76.48
Alternate: Bucket 8 Each
Ladder, Step - Fiberglass, 6-foot, 250 pounds maximum, Type 1 5 Each $159.90 | $799.50 $55.90 $279.50
Squeegee - Window, 12" blade 43 | Each XX XX $11.38 | $489.34 XX XX XX XX
Squeegee - Window, 18" blade 12 | Each XX XX $12.73 | $152.76 XX XX $8.80 $105.60
Gloves- Rubber, medium 228 | Pair $1.02 $232.56 | $1.23 | $280.44
Gloves- Rubber, large 144 | Pair $1.02 $146.88 | $1.23 | $177.12
Gloves- Rubber, extra-large 48 Pair $1.02 $48.96 $1.23 $59.04
Blade, Scraper, Replacement — 4", hardened tempered steel, 100 per package,
Under RB10C or equal 90 Pkg $17.14 | $1,542.60 | $4.97 $447.30 | $20.00 | $1,800.00 | $36.30 | $3,267.00
Alternate: Blade, Scraper, Replacement 90 Pkg
Duster, Telescopic, 60" 396 | Each $8.85 [ $3,504.60
Alternate: Duster, Telescopic 396 | Each
Dust Pan — Metal, 12", 1-piece construction 12 | Each $2.70 $32.40 $3.10 $37.20 $3.51 $42.12 $2.19 $26.28
Bags, Vacuum - For Advance, 10 per package, APA#56703768 160 | Pkg $8.92 | $1,427.20
Bags, Vacuum - For Nobles Ultra Glide, 8 bags per package 290 | Pkg
Receptacle, Sanitary Napkin Disposal 30 | Each $30.32 | $909.60 | $17.19 | $515.70 | $30.82 $924.60
Alternate: Receptacle 30 | Each
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS
Complete Supply | Corporate Express Empire Paper Grainger
Unit Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended Unit Extended

Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Liners, Sanitary Napkin Receptacle — Waxed, 250 bags per carton, Rubbermaid
#6141 or equal 66 | Carton $20.25 | $1,336.50 [ $12.50 | $825.00 $11.88 $784.08
Alternate: Liners 66 [ Carton
Glasses, Safety, Clear - ANSI approved 390 [ Each $6.51 [ $2,538.90 $1.02 $397.80
Glasses, Safety, Tinted - ANSI approved 30 | Each $7.75 $232.50 $1.91 $57.30
Pad, 14", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 24 | Case XX XX $16.58 | $397.92 XX XX $12.15 $291.60
Alternate: Pad, 14", Red 24 | Case
Pad, 15", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 8 Case XX XX $18.09 | $144.72 XX XX $15.03 $120.24
Alternate: Pad, 15", Red 8 Case
Pad, 17", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 62 | Case XX XX $21.51 | $1,333.62 XX XX $17.90 | $1,109.80
Alternate: Pad, 17", Red 62 | Case
Pad, 19", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 37 | Case XX XX $25.66 | $949.42 XX XX $21.29 $787.73
Alternate: Pad, 19", Red 37 | Case
Distilled Water — Gallon 120 | Each
Pole, Extension— 18’ aluminum with locking collars, ergonomic handle, snap-in
threaded nylon cone adapter. Unger #UNGEP18 or equal 5 Each | $36.99 | $184.95 | $50.59 [ $252.95 [ $41.29 | $206.45 | $35.45 $177.25
Alternate: Pole, Extension 5 Each
Washer, Strip, 18" — With handle, Unger #UNG WS18 or equal 15 | Each | $11.42 | $171.30 $9.78 $146.70 [ $12.99 | $194.85 $7.88 $118.20
Alternate: Washer, Strip, 18" 15 | Each
Discount from Catalog/Shelf Pricing 15% 30% 40% 10% and above

Present at opening:
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell, Buyer

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

Metro Webb
VENDORS Home Depot- Home Depot- Last Group Wholesale Food
Mansfield Grand Prairie JanPak Solutions Enterprises Service
Unit Extended Unit [Extended| Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Tilt Truck, 1-Cubic Yard — Utility duty, mass capacity 850 pounds, wheel size
12", 2 casters, black. Rubbermaid 1314 or equal 8 Each [$565.80| $4,526.40 $413.00( $3,304.00
Alternate: Tilt Truck 8 Each
Lid for Tilt Truck (Line Item #1) — Domed, hinged lid. 4 Each [$155.27| $621.08 $113.00| $452.00
Alternate: Lid for Tilt Truck 4 Each
Bucket, Mop, - 44-quart, yellow, 3" casters, large capacity bucket, to fit with
wringer in Line ltem #4 below 48 | Each [$190.00| $9,120.00 | $59.99 |$2,879.52
Alternate: Bucket Mop 48 | Each
Wringer, Mop Bucket — To fit 44-quart bucket, mop capacity 32 ounces,
downward pressure, yellow, Rubbermaid #7575-88 or equal 78 | Each | $78.17 | $6,097.26 $62.00 | $4,836.00
Alternate: Wringer, Mop Bucket 78 | Each
Bowl Mop, acid resistant yarn, 144 per package 700 | Each $0.74 $518.00 $0.60 $420.00
Alternate: Bowl Mop 700 | Each
Brooms, - 13" sweep surface, angle cut 264 | Each $8.99 |$2,373.36| $5.05 | $1,333.20 $5.20 | $1,372.80
Squeegee, Floor - 18” with handle 48 | Each $25.96 [$1,246.08| $11.60 [ $556.80
Scraper, Long-Handled — 4" blade, Unger #LH12C or equal 50 | Each XX XX $12.86 | $643.00
Alternate: Scraper, Long-Handled 50 | Each
Dust Pans - Long-handled, 6 per case 84 | Each | $13.99 | $1,175.16 | $17.96 [ $1,508.64| $9.65 $810.60 $13.37 | $1,123.08
Bottles, Plastic Bottles - For use with trigger sprayer on item below, Continental
922B or equal 600 | Each [ $55.00 | $33,000.00 | $4.99 [$2,994.00| $0.39 $234.00
Sprayer, Trigger - For use with bottles. 560 | Each |$254.00( $142,240.00 $0.61 $341.60 $0.60 $336.00
Pads, Green, Scrubbing — 6” X 9”, 20 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 163 | Case XX XX $5.05 $823.15 $16.42 | $2,676.46 XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Green, Scrubbing 163 | Case
Pad, Doodle Bug - With holder 72 Each $10.20 $734.40 $8.77 $631.44 | $32.79 | $2,360.88
Scraper, Razor — With one (1) blade 450 | Each | $4.72 | $2,124.00 | $2.37 |$1,066.50
Rags, Terry Cloth - Cotton, 12" X 12", 50# box 110 [ Box $88.60 | $9,746.00
Mask, Dust — 50 per box 28 Box | $6.60 $184.80 | $11.97 | $335.16 | $5.08 $142.24 $3.98 $111.44
Sign, Floor Sign, - “Wet Floor”, yellow, bilingual (English/Spanish), Rubbermaid
#6112 or equal 48 | Each | $10.56 | $506.88 | $16.49 | $791.52 | $8.70 $417.60 $8.95 $429.60
Alternate: Sign, Floor Sign 48 | Each
Janitor Cart — With vinyl bag, 20"W “ X 44-7/8"D X 38-1/4"H, Rubbermaid #6173 | 30 | Each [$110.08| $3,302.40 $95.50 | $2,865.00 $123.00 | $3,690.00
Alternate: Janitor Cart 30 | Each
Can, Waste — 7 gal, black, Rubbermaid #2956 or equal 500 [ Each | $3.00 | $1,500.00 $3.29 | $1,645.00 $4.72 | $2,360.00
Alternate: Can, Waste 7 gal 500 | Each
Can, Waste — 55-gallon, Rubbermaid Brute 2655 grey, or equal 96 | Each |$100.40( $9,638.40 | $64.97 | $6,237.12| $38.00 | $3,648.00 XX XX
Alternate: Can, Waste 55-gallon 500 | Each
Casters — To fit Brute 55-gallon trash container, Rubbermaid or equal 50 | Each | $29.88 | $1,494.00 $27.00 | $1,350.00 $38.75 | $1,937.50
Alternate: Casters 50 | Each
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 14", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 5 Case $7.78 $38.90 $7.68 $38.40 $9.90 $49.50
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue 14" 5 Case
Pads, Buffing - Green, 17", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 22 | Case $10.15 [ $223.30 $9.22 $202.84 | $13.15 $289.30
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Green 17" 22 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 19", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 12 | Case | $28.01 $336.12 $12.15 | $145.80 $11.11 | $133.32 | $15.56 | $186.72
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 19" 12 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 31 | Case | $30.51 $945.81 $13.15 | $407.65 $12.13 | $376.03 | $17.05 | $528.55
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 20" 31 | Case
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

Metro Webb
VENDORS Home Depot- Home Depot- Last Group Wholesale Food
Mansfield Grand Prairie JanPak Solutions Enterprises Service
Unit Extended Unit [Extended| Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Pads, Buffing - Pro black, 20", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 117 | Case | $31.31 | $3,663.27 $15.20 | $1,778.40 | $12.64 | $1,478.88 | $23.05 | $2,696.85
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Pro black 20" 117 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Red, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 48 | Case | $30.51 | $1,464.48 $13.15 | $631.20 $12.13 | $582.24 | $17.05 $818.40
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Red, 20" 48 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case $7.77 $233.10
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing 14", Reg. 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 | Case $7.77 $194.25
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing, 14" Lite 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 17 | Case $19.46 | $330.82 [ $28.30 [ $481.10
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 17 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 15 | Case $19.46 | $291.90
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 15 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case $31.50 | $945.00 $27.26 | $817.80 | $68.02 | $2,040.60
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 | Case $27.26 | $681.50 | $77.89 | $1,947.25
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Regular 26 | Case $30.16 | $784.16
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 26 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Lite 60 | Case $30.16 | $1,809.60
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 60 | Case
Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 85 | Case $29.86 | $2,538.10
Alternate: Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing 85 | Case
Adapter, Threaded Wood Cone — Internal Acme Thread, Unger TWAO0O 6 Each $3.00 $18.00 $2.60 $15.60
Caddy, Johnny Mop — Acid-resistant plastic, 2 compartments 10 | Each
Blade - Single edge, for use with scraper 14 Pkg XX XX $11.16 | $156.24
Sprayer, Tank — 3-gallon, pump up 11 | Each | $30.43 | $334.73
Grabber/Picker — Unger NN90O or equal 10 | Each $19.38 | $193.80 $20.25 | $202.50
Alternate: Grabber/ Pickers 10 [ Each
Bucket — 10-quart, plastic, Rubbermaid #2963 8 Each | $5.25 $42.00 $5.40 $43.20
Alternate: Bucket 8 Each
Ladder, Step - Fiberglass, 6-foot, 250 pounds maximum, Type 1 5 Each | $62.40 | $312.00 $82.00 [ $410.00
Squeegee - Window, 12" blade 43 | Each XX XX $8.03 $345.29
Squeegee - Window, 18" blade 12 | Each | $12.94 | $155.28 $16.99 | $203.88 XX XX $9.98 $119.76
Gloves- Rubber, medium 228 | Pair | $3.60 $820.80
Gloves- Rubber, large 144 | Pair $3.60 $518.40
Gloves- Rubber, extra-large 48 Pair [ $3.60 $172.80
Blade, Scraper, Replacement — 4", hardened tempered steel, 100 per package,
Under RB10C or equal 90 Pkg $7.75 $697.77 $4.77 $429.30
Alternate: Blade, Scraper, Replacement 90 Pkg
Duster, Telescopic, 60" 396 | Each $7.99 |$3,164.04
Alternate: Duster, Telescopic 396 | Each
Dust Pan — Metal, 12", 1-piece construction 12 | Each $2.78 $33.36 $3.12 $37.44
Bags, Vacuum - For Advance, 10 per package, APA#56703768 160 | Pkg
Bags, Vacuum - For Nobles Ultra Glide, 8 bags per package 290 | Pkg
Receptacle, Sanitary Napkin Disposal 30 | Each | $30.80 | $924.00 $26.05 | $781.50 $34.67 | $1,040.19
Alternate: Receptacle 30 | Each
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

Metro Webb
VENDORS Home Depot- Home Depot- Last Group Wholesale Food
Mansfield Grand Prairie JanPak Solutions Enterprises Service
Unit Extended Unit [Extended| Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Liners, Sanitary Napkin Receptacle — Waxed, 250 bags per carton, Rubbermaid
#6141 or equal 66 | Carton | $22.22 | $1,466.52 $18.50 | $1,221.00 $20.60 | $1,359.60
Alternate: Liners 66 | Carton
Glasses, Safety, Clear - ANSI approved 390 | Each | $3.74 | $1,458.60 | $5.96 |[$2,324.40| $0.72 $280.80
Glasses, Safety, Tinted - ANSI approved 30 | Each | $4.50 $135.00 $14.99 | $449.70 | $1.02 $30.60
Pad, 14", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 24 | Case | $18.08 | $433.92 $7.75 $186.00 $7.68 $184.32 $9.95 $238.80
Alternate: Pad, 14", Red 24 | Case
Pad, 15", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 8 Case | $19.80 | $158.40 $7.68 $61.44 $10.95 $87.60
Alternate: Pad, 15", Red 8 Case
Pad, 17", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 62 | Case | $23.58 | $1,461.96 $10.20 | $632.40 $9.22 $571.64 | $13.15 | $815.30
Alternate: Pad, 17", Red 62 | Case
Pad, 19", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 37 | Case | $28.01 | $1,036.37 $12.15 | $449.55 $11.11 | $411.07 [ $15.56 | $575.72
Alternate: Pad, 19", Red 37 | Case
Distilled Water — Gallon 120 | Each $1.50 $180.00 $1.53 $183.60
Pole, Extension— 18" aluminum with locking collars, ergonomic handle, snap-in
threaded nylon cone adapter. Unger #UNGEP18 or equal 5 Each XX XX $44.83 $224.15
Alternate: Pole, Extension 5 Each
Washer, Strip, 18" — With handle, Unger #UNG WS18 or equal 15 | Each $11.50 [ $172.50 $11.55 | $173.25
Alternate: Washer, Strip, 18" 15 | Each
Discount from Catalog/Shelf Pricing 0% Varies- call for quotes

Present at opening:
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell, Buyer

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
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Bid # 09-051

Custodial Supplies

VENDORS Olmsted-Kirk Pollock Paper
Equipment & Supply PASCO Brokerage Distributors Prime Source
Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price

Tilt Truck, 1-Cubic Yard — Utility duty, mass capacity 850 pounds, wheel size
12", 2 casters, black. Rubbermaid 1314 or equal 8 Each | $430.00 | $3,440.00 $383.75 $3,070.00 | $397.28 | $3,178.24 | $400.00 | $3,200.00
Alternate: Tilt Truck 8 Each $400.00 | $3,200.00
Lid for Tilt Truck (Line Item #1) — Domed, hinged lid. 4 Each | $117.99 $471.96 XX XX XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Lid for Tilt Truck 4 Each XX XX
Bucket, Mop, - 44-quart, yellow, 3" casters, large capacity bucket, to fit with
wringer in Line Item #4 below 48 | Each [ $47.00 [ $2,256.00 $41.75 $2,004.00 | $38.91 | $1,867.68 | $126.00 | $6,048.00
Alternate: Bucket Mop 48 | Each XX XX $39.75 | $1,908.00
Wringer, Mop Bucket — To fit 44-quart bucket, mop capacity 32 ounces,
downward pressure, yellow, Rubbermaid #7575-88 or equal 78 | Each | $65.40 | $5,101.20 XX XX XX XX $61.00 [ $4,758.00
Alternate: Wringer, Mop Bucket 78 | Each XX XX $33.95 | $2,648.10
Bowl Mop, acid resistant yarn, 144 per package 700 | Each [ $0.85 $595.00 $0.45 $315.00 $0.46 $322.00 $0.45 $315.00
Alternate: Bowl Mop 700 | Each XX XX
Brooms, - 13" sweep surface, angle cut 264 | Each [ $6.44 $1,700.16 XX XX $4.11 | $1,085.04 | $3.36 $887.04
Squeegee, Floor - 18" with handle 48 | Each | $18.95 $909.60 XX XX $6.43 $308.64 $6.75 $324.00
Scraper, Long-Handled — 4" blade, Unger #LH12C or equal 50 | Each | $16.85 $842.50 $11.45 $572.50 XX XX $12.45 | $622.50
Alternate: Scraper, Long-Handled 50 | Each $7.65 $382.50
Dust Pans - Long-handled, 6 per case 84 | Each | $10.02 $841.68 XX XX $5.60 $470.40 $8.00 $672.00
Bottles, Plastic Bottles - For use with trigger sprayer on item below, Continental
922B or equal 600 | Each $0.60 $360.00 XX XX $0.33 $198.00 $0.35 $210.00
Sprayer, Trigger - For use with bottles. 560 | Each $0.60 $336.00 XX XX $0.30 $168.00 $0.35 $196.00
Pads, Green, Scrubbing — 6" X 9”, 20 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 163 | Case [ $5.94 $968.22 $24.30 $3,960.90 XX XX $5.00 $815.00
Alternate: Pads, Green, Scrubbing 163 | Case $9.50 $1,548.50
Pad, Doodle Bug - With holder 72 Each | $15.75 $1,134.00 $11.45 $824.40 XX XX XX XX
Scraper, Razor — With one (1) blade 450 | Each | $1.96 $882.00 $1.60 $720.00 $1.20 $540.00 $1.25 $562.50
Rags, Terry Cloth - Cotton, 12" X 12", 50# box 110 | Box $89.67 | $9,863.70 XX XX
Mask, Dust — 50 per box 28 Box $4.96 $138.88 $6.36 $178.08 $3.75 $105.00
Sign, Floor Sign, - “Wet Floor”, yellow, bilingual (English/Spanish), Rubbermaid
#6112 or equal 48 | Each | $9.06 $434.88 $8.00 $384.00 $5.46 $262.08 $5.75 $276.00
Alternate: Sign, Floor Sign 48 | Each XX XX
Janitor Cart — With vinyl bag, 20"W “ X 44-7/8"D X 38-1/4"H, Rubbermaid #6173 | 30 | Each [ $95.92 | $2,877.60 $85.50 $2,565.00 | $75.00 | $2,250.00 | $90.00 | $2,700.00
Alternate: Janitor Cart 30 | Each XX XX $76.00 | $2,280.00
Can, Waste — 7 gal, black, Rubbermaid #2956 or equal 500 [ Each | $3.42 $1,710.00 $3.05 $1,525.00 [ $2.45 | $1,225.00 [ $3.25 [ $1,625.00
Alternate: Can, Waste 7 gal 500 | Each XX XX $2.50 [ $1,250.00
Can, Waste — 55-gallon, Rubbermaid Brute 2655 grey, or equal 96 | Each | $39.95 | $3,835.20 XX XX $36.90 | $3,542.40 | $45.00 | $4,320.00
Alternate: Can, Waste 55-gallon 500 | Each $45.00 | $22,500.00
Casters — To fit Brute 55-gallon trash container, Rubbermaid or equal 50 | Each | $28.28 | $1,414.00 XX XX XX XX $26.00 | $1,300.00
Alternate: Casters 50 | Each XX XX XX XX
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 14", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 5 Case | $6.92 $34.60 $13.30 $66.50 XX XX $8.60 $43.00
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue 14" 5 Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, Buffing - Green, 17", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 22 | Case XX XX $20.10 $442.20 XX XX $10.25 | $225.50
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Green 17" 22 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 19", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 12 | Case XX XX $20.60 $247.20 XX XX $12.40 | $148.80
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 19" 12 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 31 | Case XX XX $22.45 $695.95 XX XX $13.50 [ $418.50
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 20" 31 | Case XX XX XX XX
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Bid # 09-051

Custodial Supplies

VENDORS Olmsted-Kirk Pollock Paper
Equipment & Supply PASCO Brokerage Distributors Prime Source
Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price

Pads, Buffing - Pro black, 20", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 117 | Case | $19.32 | $2,260.44 $23.05 $2,696.85 XX XX $14.00 [ $1,638.00
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Pro black 20" 117 | Case $17.25 $2,018.25 $14.50 | $1,696.50
Pads, Buffing - Red, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 48 | Case XX XX $22.45 $1,077.60 XX XX $13.50 [ $648.00
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Red, 20" 48 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case | $9.70 $291.00 $8.65 $259.50 $8.96 $268.80 $8.70 $261.00
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing 14", Reg. 30 | Case XX XX
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 | Case | $9.70 $242.50 $8.65 $216.25 $8.96 $224.00 $8.70 $217.50
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing, 14" Lite 25 | Case XX XX
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 17 | Case | $20.03 $340.51 $40.70 $691.90 XX XX $21.75 | $369.75
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 17 | Case XX XX $20.00 $340.00
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 15 | Case | $20.03 $300.45 $40.70 $610.50 XX XX $21.75 | $326.25
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 15 | Case XX XX $20.00 $300.00
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case XX XX $57.20 $1,716.00 XX XX $30.00 [ $900.00
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 30 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 | Case XX XX $57.20 $1,430.00 XX XX $30.00 [ $750.00
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 25 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Regular 26 | Case XX XX $62.40 $1,622.40 XX XX $33.75 | $877.50
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 26 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Lite 60 | Case XX XX $62.40 $3,744.00 XX XX $33.75 [ $2,025.00
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 60 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 85 | Case XX XX $62.40 $5,304.00 XX XX $33.50 [ $2,847.50
Alternate: Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing 85 | Case XX XX XX XX
Adapter, Threaded Wood Cone — Internal Acme Thread, Unger TWAQO 6 Each | $3.40 $20.40 XX XX $2.89 $17.34 $2.65 $15.90
Caddy, Johnny Mop — Acid-resistant plastic, 2 compartments 10 | Each | $7.28 $72.80 XX XX $4.50 $45.00
Blade - Single edge, for use with scraper 14 Pkg | $10.35 $144.90 $10.50 $147.00 $12.91 | $180.74 $3.50 $49.00
Sprayer, Tank — 3-gallon, pump up 11 | Each $32.70 $359.70 $33.82 | $372.02 [ $34.50 | $379.50
Grabber/Picker — Unger NN90O or equal 10 Each | $26.50 $265.00 $18.05 $180.50 $21.58 $215.80 $20.00 $200.00
Alternate: Grabber/ Pickers 10 | Each XX XX $16.00 | $160.00
Bucket — 10-quart, plastic, Rubbermaid #2963 8 Each | $5.95 $47.60 $5.30 $42.40 $3.74 $29.92 $3.80 $30.40
Alternate: Bucket 8 Each $3.65 $29.20 $5.60 $44.80
Ladder, Step - Fiberglass, 6-foot, 250 pounds maximum, Type 1 5 Each $125.00 $625.00 $78.00 [ $390.00
Squeegee - Window, 12" blade 43 | Each | $11.20 $481.60 XX XX XX XX XX XX
Squeegee - Window, 18” blade 12 | Each | $13.06 $156.72 XX XX $11.16 | $133.92 XX XX
Gloves- Rubber, medium 228 | Pair $1.95 $444.60 $1.60 $364.80
Gloves- Rubber, large 144 | Pair $1.95 $280.80 $1.60 $230.40
Gloves- Rubber, extra-large 48 Pair $1.95 $93.60 $1.60 $76.80
Blade, Scraper, Replacement — 4", hardened tempered steel, 100 per package,
Under RB10C or equal 90 Pkg $6.26 $563.40 $4.30 $387.00 $4.25 $382.50 $4.65 $418.50
Alternate: Blade, Scraper, Replacement 90 Pkg $16.40 $1,476.00
Duster, Telescopic, 60" 396 | Each $4.38 $1,734.48 XX XX $4.67 | $1,849.32 $9.60 $3,801.60
Alternate: Duster, Telescopic 396 | Each $4.50 [ $1,782.00
Dust Pan — Metal, 12", 1-piece construction 12 | Each | $4.43 $53.16 $2.60 $31.20 $2.77 $33.24 $3.00 $36.00
Bags, Vacuum - For Advance, 10 per package, APA#56703768 160 | Pkg $8.48 | $1,356.80
Bags, Vacuum - For Nobles Ultra Glide, 8 bags per package 290 | Pkg $8.73 | $2,531.70 | $12.00 | $3,480.00
Receptacle, Sanitary Napkin Disposal 30 | Each | $27.11 $813.30 $24.15 $724.50 $10.28 | $308.40 | $25.60 [ $768.00
Alternate: Receptacle 30 | Each XX XX $12.50 | $375.00
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS

Olmsted-Kirk
Equipment & Supply

PASCO Brokerage

Pollock Paper
Distributors

Prime Source

Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price

Liners, Sanitary Napkin Receptacle — Waxed, 250 bags per carton, Rubbermaid
#6141 or equal 66 | Carton| $18.11 | $1,195.26 $16.15 $1,065.90 | $16.39 | $1,081.74 | $17.00 | $1,122.00
Alternate: Liners 66 | Carton $15.85 $1,046.10 $12.50 [ $825.00
Glasses, Safety, Clear - ANSI approved 390 | Each $5.20 $2,028.00 [ $1.30 $507.00
Glasses, Safety, Tinted - ANSI approved 30 | Each $9.90 $297.00 $1.40 $42.00
Pad, 14", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 24 | Case | $6.92 $166.08 $13.30 $319.20 XX XX $8.60 $206.40
Alternate: Pad, 14", Red 24 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pad, 15", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 8 Case XX XX $14.55 $116.40 XX XX $8.60 $68.80
Alternate: Pad, 15", Red 8 Case XX XX XX XX
Pad, 17", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 62 | Case XX XX $17.35 $1,075.70 XX XX $10.25 | $635.50
Alternate: Pad, 17", Red 62 | Case XX XX XX XX
Pad, 19", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 37 | Case XX XX $20.60 $762.20 XX XX $12.40 | $458.80
Alternate: Pad, 19", Red 37 | Case XX XX XX XX
Distilled Water — Gallon 120 | Each
Pole, Extension— 18" aluminum with locking collars, ergonomic handle, snap-in
threaded nylon cone adapter. Unger #UNGEP18 or equal 5 Each | $59.95 $299.75 $40.75 $203.75 $36.80 | $184.00 [ $47.00 | $235.00
Alternate: Pole, Extension 5 Each $35.55 $177.75 XX XX
Washer, Strip, 18" — With handle, Unger #UNG WS18 or equal 15 | Each | $15.20 $228.00 $10.25 $153.75 $11.29 | $169.35 [ $11.80 | $177.00
Alternate: Washer, Strip, 18" 15 | Each $9.45 $141.75 $9.50 $142.50
Discount from Catalog/Shelf Pricing 10% Varies- call for quote 30%

Present at opening:
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell, Buyer

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS Pyramid School Rocky Duran &
Products Quill Associates Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Unit | Extended | Unit [Extended| Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Tilt Truck, 1-Cubic Yard — Utility duty, mass capacity 850 pounds, wheel size
12", 2 casters, black. Rubbermaid 1314 or equal 8 Each [$375.99| $3,007.92 $349.32 | $2,794.56
Alternate: Tilt Truck 8 Each
Lid for Tilt Truck (Line Item #1) — Domed, hinged lid. 4 Each XX XX $126.98 | $507.92
Alternate: Lid for Tilt Truck 4 Each
Bucket, Mop, - 44-quart, yellow, 3" casters, large capacity bucket, to fit with
wringer in Line Item #4 below 48 | Each XX XX $43.68 | $2,096.64
Alternate: Bucket Mop 48 | Each
Wringer, Mop Bucket — To fit 44-quart bucket, mop capacity 32 ounces,
downward pressure, yellow, Rubbermaid #7575-88 or equal 78 | Each XX XX $37.31 | $2,910.18
Alternate: Wringer, Mop Bucket 78 | Each
Bowl Mop, acid resistant yarn, 144 per package 700 [ Each XX XX $0.59 $413.00
Alternate: Bowl Mop 700 | Each
Brooms, - 13" sweep surface, angle cut 264 [ Each XX XX $4.79 $1,264.56
Squeegee, Floor - 18" with handle 48 | Each | $6.72 | $322.56 $9.78 $469.44
Scraper, Long-Handled — 4" blade, Unger #LH12C or equal 50 [ Each | $14.89 | $744.50 $12.87 $643.50
Alternate: Scraper, Long-Handled 50 | Each
Dust Pans - Long-handled, 6 per case 84 | Each XX XX $18.50 | $1,554.00 $6.28 $527.52
Bottles, Plastic Bottles - For use with trigger sprayer on item below, Continental
922B or equal 600 | Each $0.34 $204.00 $0.37 $222.00
Sprayer, Trigger - For use with bottles. 560 | Each XX XX $0.34 $190.40
Pads, Green, Scrubbing — 6” X 9”, 20 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 163 | Case XX XX $10.99 | $1,791.37
Alternate: Pads, Green, Scrubbing 163 | Case
Pad, Doodle Bug - With holder 72 | Each XX XX $12.28 $884.16
Scraper, Razor — With one (1) blade 450 | Each $3.95 $1,777.50
Rags, Terry Cloth - Cotton, 12" X 12", 50# box 110 | Box
Mask, Dust — 50 per box 28 Box $4.59 | $128.52 | $4.51 | $126.28 $12.63 $353.64
Sign, Floor Sign, - “Wet Floor”, yellow, bilingual (English/Spanish), Rubbermaid
#6112 or equal 48 | Each [ $5.48 | $263.04 [ $7.62 | $365.76 | $31.22 [ $1,498.56 $6.12 $293.76
Alternate: Sign, Floor Sign 48 | Each
Janitor Cart — With vinyl bag, 20"W “ X 44-7/8"D X 38-1/4"H, Rubbermaid #6173| 30 | Each XX XX $425.88 | $12,776.40 | $84.18 [ $2,525.40
Alternate: Janitor Cart 30 | Each
Can, Waste — 7 gal, black, Rubbermaid #2956 or equal 500 [ Each XX XX $4.22 | $2,110.00( $21.01 | $10,505.00 | $2.75 $1,375.00
Alternate: Can, Waste 7 gal 500 | Each
Can, Waste — 55-gallon, Rubbermaid Brute 2655 grey, or equal 96 | Each | $42.35 | $4,065.60 $191.55 | $18,388.80 | $48.69 | $4,674.24
Alternate: Can, Waste 55-gallon 500 | Each
Casters — To fit Brute 55-gallon trash container, Rubbermaid or equal 50 | Each XX XX $158.00 | $7,900.00 XX XX
Alternate: Casters 50 | Each
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 14", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 5 Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue 14" 5 Case
Pads, Buffing - Green, 17", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 22 | Case XX XX $9.46 $208.12
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Green 17" 22 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 19", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 12 | Case XX XX $11.22 $134.64
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 19" 12 [ Case
Pads, Buffing - Blue, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 31 | Case XX XX $12.25 $379.75
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Blue, 20" 31 | Case
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS Pyramid School Rocky Duran &
Products Quill Associates Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Unit | Extended | Unit [Extended| Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Pads, Buffing - Pro black, 20", 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 117 | Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Pro black 20" 117 | Case
Pads, Buffing - Red, 20", 5 per case, 3M Brand, Norton or equal 48 | Case XX XX $12.25 $588.00
Alternate: Pads, Buffing- Red, 20" 48 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing 14", Reg. 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 14", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 [ Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing, 14" Lite 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 17 [ Case XX XX $20.76 $352.92
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 17 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 24", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 15 [ Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 24" 15 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Regular 30 | Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 30 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 27", 5 per case, Natural/Hoghair, Gorilla Lite 25 [ Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 27" 25 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Regular 26 [ Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 26 | Case
Pads, Burnishing - 28", 5 per case, Gorilla Lite 60 [ Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, Burnishing- 28" 60 | Case
Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 85 | Case XX XX
Alternate: Pads, 28" Beige Burnishing 85 | Case
Adapter, Threaded Wood Cone — Internal Acme Thread, Unger TWAO0O 6 Each | $3.89 $23.34 $2.92 $17.52
Caddy, Johnny Mop — Acid-resistant plastic, 2 compartments 10 | Each $17.56 $175.60
Blade - Single edge, for use with scraper 14 Pkg $11.27 $157.78
Sprayer, Tank — 3-gallon, pump up 11 | Each XX XX $108.86 | $1,197.46
Grabber/Picker — Unger NN90O or equal 10 [ Each | $20.99 | $209.90 $23.74 $237.40
Alternate: Grabber/ Pickers 10 | Each
Bucket — 10-quart, plastic, Rubbermaid #2963 8 Each | $3.56 $28.48 | $7.20 | $57.60 | $22.95 $183.60 $4.20 $33.60
Alternate: Bucket 8 Each
Ladder, Step - Fiberglass, 6-foot, 250 pounds maximum, Type 1 5 Each [$109.95| $549.75
Squeegee - Window, 12" blade 43 | Each $28.69 | $1,233.67 XX XX
Squeegee - Window, 18" blade 12 | Each $33.50 $402.00 XX XX
Gloves- Rubber, medium 228 | Pair XX XX
Gloves- Rubber, large 144 | Pair XX XX
Gloves- Rubber, extra-large 48 Pair XX XX
Blade, Scraper, Replacement — 4", hardened tempered steel, 100 per package,
Under RB10C or equal 90 Pkg XX XX $5.85 $526.50
Alternate: Blade, Scraper, Replacement 90 Pkg
Duster, Telescopic, 60” 396 [ Each | $4.59 | $1,817.64 $5.36 $2,122.56
Alternate: Duster, Telescopic 396 | Each
Dust Pan — Metal, 12", 1-piece construction 12 | Each | $2.55 $30.60 $11.96 $143.52 $2.99 $35.88
Bags, Vacuum - For Advance, 10 per package, APA#56703768 160 | Pkg
Bags, Vacuum - For Nobles Ultra Glide, 8 bags per package 290 | Pkg
Receptacle, Sanitary Napkin Disposal 30 | Each [ $16.23 | $486.90 [ $52.98|$1,589.40( $105.12 | $3,153.60 | $11.99 $359.70
Alternate: Receptacle 30 | Each
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Bid # 09-051
Custodial Supplies

VENDORS Pyramid School Rocky Duran &
Products Quill Associates Sam Tell and Son Inc.
Unit | Extended | Unit [Extended| Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Liners, Sanitary Napkin Receptacle — Waxed, 250 bags per carton, Rubbermaid
#6141 or equal 66 | Carton XX XX $30.17 | $1,991.22| $64.38 | $4,249.08 $18.40 | $1,214.40
Alternate: Liners 66 [ Carton
Glasses, Safety, Clear - ANSI approved 390 | Each $1.43 | $557.70
Glasses, Safety, Tinted - ANSI approved 30 | Each
Pad, 14", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 24 | Case XX XX XX XX
Alternate: Pad, 14", Red 24 | Case
Pad, 15", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 8 Case XX XX $7.87 $62.96
Alternate: Pad, 15", Red 8 Case
Pad, 17", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 62 | Case XX XX $9.46 $586.52
Alternate: Pad, 17", Red 62 | Case
Pad, 19", Red — 5 per case, 3M, Norton or equal 37 | Case XX XX $11.22 $415.14
Alternate: Pad, 19", Red 37 | Case
Distilled Water — Gallon 120 | Each
Pole, Extension— 18’ aluminum with locking collars, ergonomic handle, snap-in
threaded nylon cone adapter. Unger #UNGEP18 or equal 5 Each $149.17 | $745.85 $45.96 $229.80
Alternate: Pole, Extension 5 Each
Washer, Strip, 18" — With handle, Unger #UNG WS18 or equal 15 | Each $38.74 $581.10 $12.11 $181.65
Alternate: Washer, Strip, 18" 15 | Each

10% Discount does

not apply to office

machines,
technology
products, computer
hardware and

software, furniture

and Quill's Special
Discount from Catalog/Shelf Pricing 15% Order Catalog 8% 35%

Present at opening:
Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell, Buyer

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
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