BID RECOMMENDATION

January 23, 2007

MEMO: Lou Spiegel
Associate Superintendent for Business Services

FROM: Shelley Freeman
Purchasing Agent

RE: Consideration of Bids Received for General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

INTRODUCTION

We request that the MISD Board of Trustees approve the recommendation as made by the
Purchasing Department, in conjunction with the Maintenance Department, for awarding the
bid for General Maintenance Parts and Supplies. Completed bid requests for Bid #07-049
were received prior to the bid closing at 2:00 p.m. on January 8, 2007.

DISCUSSION

Attached is the bid tabulation from this bid opening. The purpose of this bid is to obtain
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies for the Maintenance Department to use
throughout the District (including rental equipment), as well as a general discount off
Maintenance Parts and Supplies not otherwise specified in the bid. Consideration was
given to the lowest price, product conformity, references, past experience, and compliance
with the bid requirements. This contract will be effective from February 1, 2007 through
January 31, 2008.

RECOMMENDATION

In conjunction with the Maintenance Department, the Purchasing Department recommends
that all individual items in the General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Bid be awarded as
indicated on the tabulation sheet and that all catalog and general discount bids, as
submitted by the vendors, be accepted. Regarding rental equipment, we recommend that
The Home Depot and Rental One be approved, as indicated on the tabulation.

FUNDING

Funding will be available through the 2006-2007 Maintenance budget.

ORIGINATING DEPARTMENT HEAD: FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Jeff Brogden Jeff Brogden 817-299-4345
Director of Maintenance Dottie Morrow 817-299-6091



General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Allstate Sign and | American Time and | Arlington Glass
Plaque Corporation [ Signal Company Company Benchmark Signs | Centerline Supply

Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Amerex A-500 Fire Extinguisher 1 Each
Amerex B-500 Fire Extinguisher 5-Pound 10 Each
AX 260 K Class Extinguisher 15-Pound 5 Each
NS-18 Tag Loop 500 |Each
ABC Dry Powder 20 Pound
Concrete, Pre-mixed 10 Yard
Wear Mats - GT Impax or equal, 44" X 48" X 1" thick 100 [Cu. Yd.

Engineered Wood Fiber, Soft/Hardwoods, Randomly Sized,

including delivery fee 100 [Cu. Yd.
Best Locks 35H7J15N 5 Each
Best Locks 83T7SSTK626CS 5 Each
LCN Door Closer #4011 10 Each
LCN Door Closer #4111 10 Each

1/8-Inch Lexan Each

3/16-Inch Lexan Each

38h Mortise, Lock, Best by Best Access Each

Len 3077 CNS Door Closer Arm Each

5
5
5
9827-f Exit Devise Von Duprin 5 Each
5
5

Silver Push Plates Each

Hourly labor charge for overhead door preventative

maintenance 1 Hour
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service during

regular business hours 1 Hour
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service

performed after regular business hours 1 Hour

Minimum Number of hours

Response time?

Percentage off parts and supplies needed for preventative
maintenance and repair

Flashing Cement — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
Fiber Roof Coating — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
NP1 Caulk - Tube 75 Tube
Partition Top Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
Partition Bottom Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
Offset Side Latch for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
4" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
6" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
170 fr2 Corner Guard - White 5 Each
Carpet Glue — Multi-purpose, 1-gallon can, Hendry or equal 5 Can

Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x2’, 16/cs, Armstrong 756 70 Case
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Allstate Sign and | American Time and | Arlington Glass
Plaque Corporation [ Signal Company Company Benchmark Signs | Centerline Supply
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.

General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x4’, 12/cs, Armstrong 755 112 |Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x2’, 4/case 5 Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x4’, 4/case 5 Case
Paint, Acrylic, Outdoor, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 50 Each
Paint, Latex, Indoor, Ultra-Hide, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 30 Each
Paint, Oil, 1-Gallon Buckets (for metal doors) 20 Each
Paint Thinner, 5-Gallon Container 30 Each
White Field Marking Paint — Flat latex 1300 [Gallon
Varnish, Clear, Polyurethane, Glossy and Semi-Gloss, one-
gallon buckets 30 Each
Stain, One-Gallon Buckets, Various Colors 50 Each
Rags, White, New Wash Knit, 176W, 10 pounds, 300/box 15 Box
Sandpaper, 80 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Sandpaper, 120 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Sandpaper, 150 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Sandpaper, 220 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Joint Compound (Mud), Ready-mix, All-purpose, non-
asbestos, 50 pounds, USG #20350 or equal 50 Pkg.
Joint Tape for wall board, 2"x250’ 50 Roll
2.5” Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each
3” Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each
2.5” Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 20 Each
3” Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each
2.5” Angle Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 20 Each
3” Angle Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each
2.5" Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each
3” Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each
Spray Paint, Aerosol, 11-ounce 120 |[Can
Sheepskin Roller Covers, 9” x 1", 20 per package 20 Pkg.
Premier Caulk White, 6 per package 20 Pkg.
Masking Tape, 2" X 60 yards, 6 per package 50 Pkg.
Goof Off Cleaner, 8-ounce 10 Each
Traffic Marking Paint, Red (Fire Lane), 5-gallon buckets 500 [Bucket $54.75 | $27,375.00
Traffic Marking Paint, White, 5-gallon buckets 100 |Bucket $44.25 | $4,425.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Yellow, 5-gallon buckets 100 |Bucket $44.25 | $4,425.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Blue, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket $55.50 | $5,550.00
Tempered Glass 1/8” Clear 1 Sq. Ft. $7.50 $7.50
Tempered Glass 1/8” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft. $8.75 $8.75
Tempered Glass 1/4” Clear 1 Sq. Ft. $8.50 $8.50
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049

VENDORS

Allstate Sign and

American Time and

Arlington Glass

Plaque Corporation [ Signal Company Company Benchmark Signs | Centerline Supply
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Tempered Glass 1/4” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft $9.75 $9.75
Wire Glass %" 1 Sq. Ft $18.50 | $18.50
Y, Clear Laminated 1 Sq. Ft $11.50 | $11.50
1" Tinted Insulated 1 Sq. Ft $14.00 | $14.00
¥," Mirror glass 1 Sq. Ft $6.50 $6.50
Tinting Film 1 Sq. Ft Varies
Regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour $45.00 | $45.00
After regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour $95.00 | $95.00
Minimum number of hours 1
Minimum number of persons required for installation 1
Minimum number of persons required for application of
window tinting 2
Response time (must be within six hours) 4
Percentage off list price for items needed to repair broken
glass 0%
Stop Sign — White/Red color, reflective aluminum, 24" X 24" 10 Each $60.00 | $600.00 $60.90 | $609.00 $69.00 | $690.00 [ $30.00 | $300.00
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Right,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each $55.00 | $550.00 $58.00 | $580.00 | $22.75 | $227.50
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Left,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each $55.00 | $550.00 $58.00 | $580.00 | $22.75 | $227.50
Speed Limit Sign, Black/White color, reflective aluminum, 24”
X 18" 10 Each $58.00 | $580.00 $58.00 | $580.00 | $22.75 | $227.50
“No Parking Anytime” Sign, Red/White color, reflective
aluminum, 18" X 12" 10 Each $23.50 | $235.00 $29.90 $299.00 $36.00 | $360.00 | $15.75 | $157.50
U-Channel side post, 8’ length, high tensile steel, 2
pounds/linear foot 40 Each $27.00 |$1,080.00 $39.00 | $1,560.00 | $24.95 | $998.00
Angle Iron, 1" X 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot
Angle Iron, 3" X 3" X 3/16” 1 Foot
Channel Iron, 5” X 6.7# 1 Foot
Diamond Tread Floor Plate, 48" X 96" X 14 gauge 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 12", #16 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 3/4”, #9 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Flat Iron, 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot
Flat Iron, 4"X 3/16” 1 Foot
Pipe — 2" X Schedule 40 1 Foot
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X ¥4" 1 Sq. Ft.
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 3/4" 1 Sheet
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 1" 1 Sheet
Rectangular Tubing, 3" X 2" X 11 gauge 1 Foot
Rectangular Tubing, 4” X 2” X 11 guage 1 Foot
Rods, Round, 1” X 20, hot rolled 1 Foot
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Allstate Sign and | American Time and | Arlington Glass
Plaque Corporation [ Signal Company Company Benchmark Signs | Centerline Supply

Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Rods, Round, 3/8” X 20’ 1 Foot
Rods, Square, 1/2" X 20’ 1 Foot
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 16 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 14 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Square Tubing, 1” X 14 guage (.083) 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 6” X (3/16") 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 1.5” X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 12" X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Minimum order requirements
Nitrogen 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon-CO, Mix 2 Cu. Ft.
Monthly Rental of Industrial Gas Bottles 1 Month

Freight

FOB Deer Park, New
York. Total shipping
cost for all items bid =
$390.00; otherwise,
call for quote.

Included in price

Included in pricing

$50.00 if order is less
than $1,000.00

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid

Present at opening:

Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent
Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Pam Fennell, Buyer
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049

Fort Worth Bolt &

Hancock Sign

VENDORS . :
Cowtown Materials Tool Company Company The Home Depot ICI Paints
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.

General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Amerex A-500 Fire Extinguisher 1 Each

Amerex B-500 Fire Extinguisher 5-Pound 10 Each

AX 260 K Class Extinguisher 15-Pound 5 Each

NS-18 Tag Loop 500 |Each

ABC Dry Powder 20 Pound

Concrete, Pre-mixed 10 Yard $115.00 | $1,150.00

Wear Mats - GT Impax or equal, 44" X 48" X 1" thick 100 [Cu. Yd.

Engineered Wood Fiber, Soft/Hardwoods, Randomly Sized,

including delivery fee 100 [Cu. Yd.

Best Locks 35H7J15N 5 Each

Best Locks 83T7SSTK626CS 5 Each

LCN Door Closer #4011 10 Each

LCN Door Closer #4111 10 Each

1/8-Inch Lexan 5 Each $12.99 $64.95

3/16-Inch Lexan 5 Each $211.42 | $1,057.10

38h Mortise, Lock, Best by Best Access 5 Each

9827-f Exit Devise Von Duprin 5 Each

Len 3077 CNS Door Closer Arm 5 Each

Silver Push Plates 5 Each $11.00 $55.00

Hourly labor charge for overhead door preventative

maintenance 1 Hour

Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service during

regular business hours 1 Hour

Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service

performed after regular business hours 1 Hour

Minimum Number of hours

Response time?

Percentage off parts and supplies needed for preventative

maintenance and repair

Flashing Cement — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket $8.92 $446.00

Fiber Roof Coating — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket $8.49 $424.50

NP1 Caulk - Tube 75 |Tube $3.50 | $262.50

Partition Top Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each $37.00 | $185.00

Partition Bottom Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each Sold as a kit: Top
Hinge, Bottom Hinge

Offset Side Latch for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each and Offset Side Latch

4" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each $1.86 $9.30

6" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each $123.44| $617.20

170 fr2 Corner Guard - White 5 Each $16.96 $84.80

Carpet Glue — Multi-purpose, 1-gallon can, Hendry or equal 5 Can $11.67 $58.35

Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x2’, 16/cs, Armstrong 7560 70  |Case $24.19 | $1,693.30 $39.94 | $2,795.80
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS . Fort Worth Bolt & Hancock Sign :
Cowtown Materials Tool Company Company The Home Depot ICI Paints
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x4’, 12/cs, Armstrong 755 112 |Case $35.62 | $3,989.44 $58.61 | $6,564.32
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x2’, 4/case 5 Case $7.84 $39.20
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x4’, 4/case 5 Case $15.20 $76.00
Paint, Acrylic, Outdoor, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 50 Each $58.98 [ $2,949.00
Paint, Latex, Indoor, Ultra-Hide, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 30 Each $52.35 | $1,570.50 | $52.75 | $1,582.50
Paint, Oil, 1-Gallon Buckets (for metal doors) 20 Each $15.27 | $305.40 | $16.94 | $338.80
Paint Thinner, 5-Gallon Container 30 Each $6.38 $191.40 $23.29 $698.70
White Field Marking Paint — Flat latex 1300 |Gallon $17.40 | $22,620.00( $4.62 | $6,006.00
Varnish, Clear, Polyurethane, Glossy and Semi-Gloss, one-
gallon buckets 30 Each $22.34 | $670.20 | $11.66 | $349.80
Stain, One-Gallon Buckets, Various Colors 50 Each $14.97 | $748.50 | $12.85 | $642.50
Rags, White, New Wash Knit, 176W, 10 pounds, 300/box 15 Box $39.00 | $585.00 $12.97 $194.55 $12.50 | $187.50
Sandpaper, 80 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $60.00 | $300.00 $31.83 | $159.15
Sandpaper, 120 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $60.00 | $300.00 $27.92 [ $139.60
Sandpaper, 150 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $60.00 | $300.00 $9.97 $49.85 $26.92 $134.60
Sandpaper, 220 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $60.00 | $300.00 $9.97 $49.85 $18.16 $90.80
$11.33
Joint Compound (Mud), Ready-mix, All-purpose, non- for 35
asbestos, 50 pounds, USG #20350 or equal 50 Pkg. pounds $5.85 $292.50
Joint Tape for wall board, 2"x250’ 50 Roll $2.09 $104.50 $1.45 $72.50
2.5" Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $6.47 $64.70 $7.49 $74.90
3” Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $8.26 $82.60
2.5" Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 20 Each $6.47 $129.40 $8.15 $163.00
3” Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $5.97 $59.70 $7.76 $77.60
2.5" Angle Sash China Bristle Qil Paint Brush 20 Each $8.23 $164.60 $7.00 $140.00
3” Angle Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $6.97 $69.70 $9.00 $90.00
2.5" Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $10.47 | $104.70 $6.64 $66.40
3” Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $9.43 $94.30 $7.94 $79.40
Spray Paint, Aerosol, 11-ounce 120 |[Can $1.96 $235.20 $2.15 $258.00
Sheepskin Roller Covers, 9” x 1", 20 per package 20 Pkg. $92.20 | $1,844.00
Premier Caulk White, 6 per package 20 Pkg. $10.50 | $210.00 $13.20 [ $264.00 $6.54 $130.80
Masking Tape, 2” X 60 yards, 6 per package 50 Pkg. $10.80 | $540.00 $6.97 $348.50 | $12.30 | $615.00
Goof Off Cleaner, 8-ounce 10 Each $4.97 $49.70 $3.75 $37.50
Traffic Marking Paint, Red (Fire Lane), 5-gallon buckets 500 [Bucket $44.30 | $22,150.00
Traffic Marking Paint, White, 5-gallon buckets 100 |Bucket $44.03 | $4,403.00 | $34.07 | $3,407.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Yellow, 5-gallon buckets 100 |Bucket $51.29 | $5,129.00 [ $35.96 | $3,596.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Blue, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket $43.57 | $4,357.00
Tempered Glass 1/8” Clear 1 Sq. Ft.
Tempered Glass 1/8” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft.
Tempered Glass 1/4” Clear 1 Sq. Ft.
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS . Fort Worth Bolt & Hancock Sign :
Cowtown Materials Tool Company Company The Home Depot ICI Paints
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Tempered Glass 1/4” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft
Wire Glass %" 1 Sq. Ft
Y, Clear Laminated 1 Sq. Ft
1" Tinted Insulated 1 Sq. Ft
Y4" Mirror glass 1 Sq. Ft
Tinting Film 1 Sq. Ft
Regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour
After regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour
Minimum number of hours
Minimum number of persons required for installation
Minimum number of persons required for application of
window tinting
Response time (must be within six hours)
Percentage off list price for items needed to repair broken
glass
Stop Sign — White/Red color, reflective aluminum, 24" X 24" 10 Each $74.60 | $746.00 | $29.99 | $299.90
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Right,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each $64.95 | $649.50 | $49.89 | $498.90
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Left,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each $64.95 | $649.50 | $49.89 | $498.90
Speed Limit Sign, Black/White color, reflective aluminum, 24”
X 18" 10 Each $64.95 | $649.50 | $49.89 | $498.90
“No Parking Anytime” Sign, Red/White color, reflective
aluminum, 18" X 12" 10 Each $35.75 | $357.50 | $9.99 $99.90
U-Channel side post, 8’ length, high tensile steel, 2
pounds/linear foot 40 Each $36.90 |$1,476.00| $39.99 | $1,599.60
Angle Iron, 1" X 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot
Angle Iron, 3" X 3" X 3/16” 1 Foot
Channel Iron, 5” X 6.7# 1 Foot
Diamond Tread Floor Plate, 48" X 96" X 14 gauge 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 12", #16 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 3/4”, #9 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Flat Iron, 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot
Flat Iron, 4"X 3/16” 1 Foot
Pipe — 2" X Schedule 40 1 Foot
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X ¥4" 1 Sq. Ft.
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 3/4" 1 Sheet
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 1" 1 Sheet
Rectangular Tubing, 3" X 2" X 11 gauge 1 Foot
Rectangular Tubing, 4” X 2” X 11 guage 1 Foot
Rods, Round, 1” X 20, hot rolled 1 Foot
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049

Fort Worth Bolt &

Hancock Sign

VENDORS . :
Cowtown Materials Tool Company Company The Home Depot ICI Paints
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.

General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Rods, Round, 3/8” X 20’ 1 Foot
Rods, Square, 1/2" X 20’ 1 Foot
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 16 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 14 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Square Tubing, 1” X 14 guage (.083) 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 6” X (3/16") 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 1.5” X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 12" X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Minimum order requirements

19 Cu Ft $10.00

exchange, $94.00 tank]

Nitrogen 1 Cu. Ft. and gas

21 Cu Ft $20.00

exchange, $101.00

Argon 1 Cu. Ft. tank and gas

23 Cu Ft $14.00

exchange, $94.00 tank

Argon-CO, Mix 2 Cu. Ft. and gas
Monthly Rental of Industrial Gas Bottles 1 Month N/A
Freight Only for special Depends on item None

order merchandise

ordered

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid

Present at opening:

Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent
Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Pam Fennell, Buyer
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Jim Leg and . Man.er Fire Mansfielq Glass Metal
Associates Kwal Paint Equipment and Mirror Supermarkets
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Amerex A-500 Fire Extinguisher 1 Each $29.95 $29.95
Amerex B-500 Fire Extinguisher 5-Pound 10 Each $29.95 | $299.50
AX 260 K Class Extinguisher 15-Pound 5 Each $120.95 | $604.75
NS-18 Tag Loop 500 [Each $0.02 $10.00
$20/50
ABC Dry Powder 20 Pound $1.00 pounds
Concrete, Pre-mixed 10 Yard
Wear Mats - GT Impax or equal, 44" X 48" X 1" thick 100 [Cu. Yd. XX XX
Engineered Wood Fiber, Soft/Hardwoods, Randomly Sized,
including delivery fee 100 |Cu.Yd.| $22.28 | $2,228.00
Best Locks 35H7J15N 5 Each
Best Locks 83T7SSTK626CS 5 Each
LCN Door Closer #4011 10 Each
LCN Door Closer #4111 10 Each
1/8-Inch Lexan 5 Each
3/16-Inch Lexan 5 Each
38h Mortise, Lock, Best by Best Access 5 Each
9827-f Exit Devise Von Duprin 5 Each
Len 3077 CNS Door Closer Arm 5 Each
Silver Push Plates 5 Each
Hourly labor charge for overhead door preventative
maintenance 1 Hour
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service during
regular business hours 1 Hour
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service
performed after regular business hours 1 Hour
Minimum Number of hours
Response time?
Percentage off parts and supplies needed for preventative
maintenance and repair
Flashing Cement — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
Fiber Roof Coating — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
NP1 Caulk - Tube 75 Tube $4.42 $331.50
Partition Top Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
Partition Bottom Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
Offset Side Latch for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
4" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
6" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
170 fr2 Corner Guard - White 5 Each
Carpet Glue — Multi-purpose, 1-gallon can, Hendry or equal 5 Can
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x2’, 16/cs, Armstrong 756 70 Case
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Jim Leg and . Man.er Fire Mansfielq Glass Metal
Associates Kwal Paint Equipment and Mirror Supermarkets
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x4’, 12/cs, Armstrong 755 112 |Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x2’, 4/case 5 Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x4’, 4/case 5 Case
Paint, Acrylic, Outdoor, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 50 Each $63.70 | $3,185.00
Paint, Latex, Indoor, Ultra-Hide, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 30 Each $46.48 | $1,394.40
Paint, Oil, 1-Gallon Buckets (for metal doors) 20 Each $15.94 | $318.80
Paint Thinner, 5-Gallon Container 30 Each $30.84 $925.20
White Field Marking Paint — Flat latex 1300 |Gallon $4.79 | $6,227.00
Varnish, Clear, Polyurethane, Glossy and Semi-Gloss, one-
gallon buckets 30 Each $23.73 $711.90
Stain, One-Gallon Buckets, Various Colors 50 Each $23.90 | $1,195.00
Rags, White, New Wash Knit, 176W, 10 pounds, 300/box 15 Box $13.41 $201.15
Sandpaper, 80 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $31.00 | $155.00
Sandpaper, 120 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $29.00 $145.00
Sandpaper, 150 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $29.00 $145.00
Sandpaper, 220 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $29.00 $145.00
Joint Compound (Mud), Ready-mix, All-purpose, non-
asbestos, 50 pounds, USG #20350 or equal 50 Pkg. $6.19 $309.50
Joint Tape for wall board, 2"x250’ 50 Roll $1.61 $80.50
2.5" Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $9.36 $93.60
3” Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $11.70 $117.00
2.5" Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 20 Each $10.29 | $205.80
3” Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $11.74 $117.40
2.5" Angle Sash China Bristle Qil Paint Brush 20 Each $4.73 $94.60
3” Angle Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $5.67 $56.70
2.5" Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $4.73 $47.30
3” Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $5.67 $56.70
Spray Paint, Aerosol, 11-ounce 120 [Can $1.66 $199.20
Sheepskin Roller Covers, 9” x 1", 20 per package 20 Pkg. $125.60 | $2,512.00
Premier Caulk White, 6 per package 20 Pkg. $1.14 $22.80
Masking Tape, 2” X 60 yards, 6 per package 50 Pkg. $16.26 | $813.00
Goof Off Cleaner, 8-ounce 10 Each $4.88 $48.80
Traffic Marking Paint, Red (Fire Lane), 5-gallon buckets 500 [Bucket $71.35 | $35,675.00
Traffic Marking Paint, White, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket $55.70 | $5,570.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Yellow, 5-gallon buckets 100 |Bucket $55.77 | $5,577.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Blue, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket $71.35 | $7,135.00
Tempered Glass 1/8” Clear 1 Sq. Ft. $4.50 $4.50
Tempered Glass 1/8” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft. $5.50 $5.50
Tempered Glass 1/4” Clear 1 Sq. Ft. $5.00 $5.00
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Jim Leg and . Man.er Fire Mansfielq Glass Metal
Associates Kwal Paint Equipment and Mirror Supermarkets
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Tempered Glass 1/4” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft $5.50 $5.50
Wire Glass ¥4” 1 Sq. Ft $15.00 | $15.00
¥;" Clear Laminated 1 Sq. Ft $10.00 | $10.00
1" Tinted Insulated 1 Sq. Ft $5.50 $5.50
Y4" Mirror glass 1 Sq. Ft $5.50 $5.50
Tinting Film 1 Sq. Ft
Regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or $50/hour| $50/hour
materials 1 Hour per man| per man
After regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour
Minimum number of hours 1
Minimum number of persons required for installation 1
Minimum number of persons required for application of
window tinting N/A
2-4
Response time (must be within six hours) hours
Percentage off list price for items needed to repair broken
glass 10%
Stop Sign — White/Red color, reflective aluminum, 24" X 24” 10 Each
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Right,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Left,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each
Speed Limit Sign, Black/White color, reflective aluminum, 24”
X 18" 10 Each
“No Parking Anytime” Sign, Red/White color, reflective
aluminum, 18" X 12" 10 Each
U-Channel side post, 8’ length, high tensile steel, 2
pounds/linear foot 40 Each
Angle Iron, 1" X 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot $0.57 $0.57
Angle Iron, 3" X 3" X 3/16” 1 Foot $2.35 $2.35
Channel Iron, 5" X 6.7# 1 Foot $4.45 $4.45
Diamond Tread Floor Plate, 48" X 96" X 14 gauge 1 Each $97.60 | $97.60
Expanded Metal, 12", #16 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each $58.88 $58.88
Expanded Metal, 3/4", #9 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each $56.00 | $56.00
Flat Iron, 1”7 X 1/8” 1 Foot $0.37 $0.37
Flat Iron, 4"X 3/16” 1 Foot $2.04 $2.04
Pipe — 2” X Schedule 40 1 Foot $3.13 $3.13
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X ¥4" 1 Sq. Ft. $6.50 $6.50
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 3/4" 1 Sheet $725.00 | $725.00
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 1" 1 Sheet $367.00 | $367.00
Rectangular Tubing, 3" X 2" X 11 gauge 1 Foot $3.82 $3.82
Rectangular Tubing, 4" X 2" X 11 guage 1 Foot $4.40 $4.40
Rods, Round, 1” X 20’, hot rolled 1 Foot $8.95 $8.95
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Jim Leg and . Man.er Fire Mansflelq Glass Metal
Associates Kwal Paint Equipment and Mirror Supermarkets
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Rods, Round, 3/8” X 20’ 1 Foot $5.40 $5.40
Rods, Square, 1/2" X 20’ 1 Foot $11.80 | $11.80
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 16 guage 1 Sq. Ft $60.48 | $60.48
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 14 guage 1 Sq. Ft $78.00 | $78.00
Square Tubing, 1” X 14 guage (.083) 1 Foot $0.88 $0.88
Square Tubing, 6” X (3/16") 1 Foot $14.86 | $14.86
Square Tubing, 1.5” X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot $26.80 | $26.80
Square Tubing, 12" X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot $34.40 | $34.40
Minimum order requirements None
Nitrogen 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon-CO, Mix 2 Cu. Ft.
Monthly Rental of Industrial Gas Bottles 1 Month
Freight Varies. Call for None N/A None None

quote.

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid

Present at opening:

Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent
Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Pam Fennell, Buyer
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Midwest Tech Overhead Door Pioneer Mfg. Professional Turf
Products Company of DFW Company Pittsburgh Paints Products
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Amerex A-500 Fire Extinguisher 1 Each
Amerex B-500 Fire Extinguisher 5-Pound 10 Each
AX 260 K Class Extinguisher 15-Pound 5 Each
NS-18 Tag Loop 500 |Each
ABC Dry Powder 20 Pound
Concrete, Pre-mixed 10 Yard
Wear Mats - GT Impax or equal, 44" X 48" X 1" thick 100 |[Cu. Yd.
Engineered Wood Fiber, Soft/Hardwoods, Randomly Sized,
including delivery fee 100 |[Cu. Yd.
Best Locks 35H7J15N 5 Each
Best Locks 83T7SSTK626CS 5 Each
LCN Door Closer #4011 10 Each
LCN Door Closer #4111 10 Each
1/8-Inch Lexan 5 Each
3/16-Inch Lexan 5 Each
38h Mortise, Lock, Best by Best Access 5 Each
9827-f Exit Devise Von Duprin 5 Each
Len 3077 CNS Door Closer Arm 5 Each
Silver Push Plates 5 Each
Hourly labor charge for overhead door preventative
maintenance 1 Hour $96.50
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service during
regular business hours 1 Hour $96.50
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service
performed after regular business hours 1 Hour $144.75
Minimum Number of hours 1
Response time? Within 48 hours
Percentage off parts and supplies needed for preventative
maintenance and repair 0%
Flashing Cement — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
Fiber Roof Coating — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
NP1 Caulk - Tube 75 Tube
Partition Top Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
Partition Bottom Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
Offset Side Latch for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each
4" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
6” Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
170 fr2 Corner Guard - White 5 Each
Carpet Glue — Multi-purpose, 1-gallon can, Hendry or equal 5 Can
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x2’, 16/cs, Armstrong 756 70 Case
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Midwest Tech Overhead Door Pioneer Mfg. Professional Turf
Products Company of DFW Company Pittsburgh Paints Products
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.

General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x4’, 12/cs, Armstrong 755 112 [Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x2’, 4/case 5 Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x4’, 4/case 5 Case
Paint, Acrylic, Outdoor, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 50 Each $67.50 | $3,375.00
Paint, Latex, Indoor, Ultra-Hide, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 30 Each $65.00 | $1,950.00
Paint, Oil, 1-Gallon Buckets (for metal doors) 20 Each $17.00 | $340.00
Paint Thinner, 5-Gallon Container 30 Each $22.00 | $660.00
White Field Marking Paint — Flat latex 1300 |Gallon $7.80 | $10,140.00| $5.70 | $7,410.00| $15.00 |$19,500.00
Varnish, Clear, Polyurethane, Glossy and Semi-Gloss, one-
gallon buckets 30 Each $43.29 | $1,298.70 $25.66 | $769.80
Stain, One-Gallon Buckets, Various Colors 50 Each $30.87 | $1,543.50 $16.00 | $800.00
Rags, White, New Wash Knit, 176W, 10 pounds, 300/box 15 Box
Sandpaper, 80 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Sandpaper, 120 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Sandpaper, 150 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Sandpaper, 220 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve
Joint Compound (Mud), Ready-mix, All-purpose, non-
asbestos, 50 pounds, USG #20350 or equal 50 Pkg. $8.90 $445.00
Joint Tape for wall board, 2"x250’ 50 Roll $2.58 $129.00
2.5” Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $10.43 | $104.30
3” Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $12.76 | $127.60
2.5” Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 20 Each $10.54 | $210.80
3” Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $10.65 | $106.50
2.5” Angle Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 20 Each $9.57 $191.40
3” Angle Sash China Bristle Qil Paint Brush 10 Each $9.24 $92.40
2.5" Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $7.95 $79.50
3” Flat Sash China Bristle Qil Paint Brush 10 Each $9.24 $92.40

$4.50- | Depends
Spray Paint, Aerosol, 11-ounce 120 |[Can $3.87 $464.40 $8.50 on color
Sheepskin Roller Covers, 9" x 1", 20 per package 20 Pkg. XX XX
Premier Caulk White, 6 per package 20 Pkg. $7.20 $144.00
Masking Tape, 2" X 60 yards, 6 per package 50 Pkg. $18.72 | $936.00 $15.00 [ $750.00
Goof Off Cleaner, 8-ounce 10 Each XX XX
Traffic Marking Paint, Red (Fire Lane), 5-gallon buckets 500 |Bucket
Traffic Marking Paint, White, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket
Traffic Marking Paint, Yellow, 5-gallon buckets 100 |Bucket
Traffic Marking Paint, Blue, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket
Tempered Glass 1/8” Clear 1 Sq. Ft.
Tempered Glass 1/8” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft.
Tempered Glass 1/4” Clear 1 Sq. Ft.
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Midwest Tech Overhead Door Pioneer Mfg. Professional Turf
Products Company of DFW Company Pittsburgh Paints Products
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Tempered Glass 1/4” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft
Wire Glass %" 1 Sq. Ft
Y," Clear Laminated 1 Sq. Ft
1" Tinted Insulated 1 Sq. Ft
¥," Mirror glass 1 Sq. Ft
Tinting Film 1 Sq. Ft
Regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour
After regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour
Minimum number of hours
Minimum number of persons required for installation
Minimum number of persons required for application of
window tinting
Response time (must be within six hours)
Percentage off list price for items needed to repair broken
glass
Stop Sign — White/Red color, reflective aluminum, 24" X 24" 10 Each
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Right,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Left,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each
Speed Limit Sign, Black/White color, reflective aluminum, 24”
X 18" 10 Each
“No Parking Anytime” Sign, Red/White color, reflective
aluminum, 18" X 12" 10 Each
U-Channel side post, 8’ length, high tensile steel, 2
pounds/linear foot 40 Each
Angle Iron, 1" X 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot
Angle Iron, 3" X 3" X 3/16” 1 Foot
Channel Iron, 5" X 6.7# 1 Foot
Diamond Tread Floor Plate, 48" X 96" X 14 gauge 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 2", #16 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 3/4”, #9 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Flat Iron, 1” X 1/8” 1 Foot
Flat Iron, 4"X 3/16” 1 Foot
Pipe — 2” X Schedule 40 1 Foot
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X V4" 1 Sq. Ft.
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 3/4" 1 Sheet
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 1" 1 Sheet
Rectangular Tubing, 3” X 2” X 11 gauge 1 Foot
Rectangular Tubing, 4” X 2” X 11 guage 1 Foot
Rods, Round, 1" X 20’, hot rolled 1 Foot
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Midwest Tech Overhead Door Pioneer Mfg. Professional Turf
Products Company of DFW Company Pittsburgh Paints Products
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Rods, Round, 3/8” X 20’ 1 Foot
Rods, Square, 1/2” X 20’ 1 Foot
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 16 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 14 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Square Tubing, 1" X 14 guage (.083) 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 6” X (3/16") 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 1.5” X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 12" X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Minimum order requirements
Nitrogen 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon-CO, Mix 2 Cu. Ft.
Monthly Rental of Industrial Gas Bottles 1 Month
$15.00 for orders o

. under $150.00; As c_harged by_ Pricing includes Shipping ch_arges

Freight . S supplier on repair . None vary according to
otherwise, shipping is delivery .
free parts ordered weight.

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid

Present at opening:

Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent
Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Pam Fennell, Buyer
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049

Recreation Services

Rocky Duron and

Sherwin Williams

Shiffler Equipment

Woodard Builders

VENDORS . . :
Corporation Associates, Inc. Paint Company Sales, Inc. Supply
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Amerex A-500 Fire Extinguisher 1 Each
Amerex B-500 Fire Extinguisher 5-Pound 10 Each
AX 260 K Class Extinguisher 15-Pound 5 Each
NS-18 Tag Loop 500 |Each
ABC Dry Powder 20 Pound
Concrete, Pre-mixed 10 Yard
Wear Mats - GT Impax or equal, 44" X 48" X 1" thick 100 [Cu. Yd. XX XX
Certified; | $1957.00
$16.00 Certified;
Engineered Wood Fiber, Soft/Hardwoods, Randomly Sized, Non- $1600.00
including delivery fee 100 |Cu. Yd.| Certified [Non-Certified
Best Locks 35H7J15N 5 Each $279.00 | $1,395.00
Best Locks 83T7SSTK626CS 5 Each $80.00 $400.00
LCN Door Closer #4011 10 Each $176.00 | $1,760.00
LCN Door Closer #4111 10 Each $176.00 | $1,760.00
1/8-Inch Lexan 5 Each
3/16-Inch Lexan 5 Each
38h Mortise, Lock, Best by Best Access 5 Each $122.00| $610.00
9827-f Exit Devise Von Duprin 5 Each $705.00 | $3,525.00
Len 3077 CNS Door Closer Arm 5 Each $71.90 $359.50
Silver Push Plates 5 Each $9.00 $45.00
Hourly labor charge for overhead door preventative
maintenance 1 Hour
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service during
regular business hours 1 Hour
Hourly labor charge for overhead door repair service
performed after regular business hours 1 Hour
Minimum Number of hours
Response time?
Percentage off parts and supplies needed for preventative
maintenance and repair
Flashing Cement — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
Fiber Roof Coating — 1-gallon bucket 50 Bucket
NP1 Caulk - Tube 75 Tube
Partition Top Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each $50.00 | $250.00 $24.95 | $124.75
Partition Bottom Hinge for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each for both | for both $24.95 | $124.75
TP225 TP225
Offset Side Latch for Bathroom Stalls 5 Each $8.15 $40.75
4" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
6" Vinyl Cove Base 5 Each
170 fr2 Corner Guard - White 5 Each $28.00 [ $140.00
Carpet Glue — Multi-purpose, 1-gallon can, Hendry or equal 5 Can
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x2’, 16/cs, Armstrong 756 70 Case
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Recreation Services | Rocky Duron and Sherwin Williams | Shiffler Equipment | Woodard Builders
Corporation Associates, Inc. Paint Company Sales, Inc. Supply
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Ceiling Tile, Fissured Square Lay, 2'x4’, 12/cs, Armstrong 755 112 |Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x2’, 4/case 5 Case
Ceiling Tile, Fireproof, Grid Stone, 2'x4’, 4/case 5 Case
Paint, Acrylic, Outdoor, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 50 Each $79.75 | $3,987.50
Paint, Latex, Indoor, Ultra-Hide, Bone White, 5-Gallon Bucket 30 Each $64.75 | $1,942.50
Paint, Oil, 1-Gallon Buckets (for metal doors) 20 Each $17.50 | $350.00
Paint Thinner, 5-Gallon Container 30 Each $25.45 $763.50
White Field Marking Paint — Flat latex 1300 |Gallon $5.75 | $7,475.00
Varnish, Clear, Polyurethane, Glossy and Semi-Gloss, one-
gallon buckets 30 Each $22.81 $684.30
Stain, One-Gallon Buckets, Various Colors 50 Each $21.19 | $1,059.50
Rags, White, New Wash Knit, 176W, 10 pounds, 300/box 15 Box $8.95 $134.25
Sandpaper, 80 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $29.00 $145.00
Sandpaper, 120 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $29.00 $145.00
Sandpaper, 150 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $23.00 | $115.00
Sandpaper, 220 grit, 9" x 11" Sheets, 100 sheets/sleeve,
Diamond Grit or equal 5 Sleeve $23.00 | $115.00
Joint Compound (Mud), Ready-mix, All-purpose, non-
asbestos, 50 pounds, USG #20350 or equal 50 Pkg. $7.73 $386.50
Joint Tape for wall board, 2"x250’ 50 Roll $1.75 $87.50
2.5" Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $4.64 $46.40
3” Angle Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $5.55 $55.50
2.5" Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 20 Each $4.59 $91.80
3” Flat Sash Nylon/Polyester Latex Paint Brush 10 Each $5.96 $59.60
2.5" Angle Sash China Bristle Qil Paint Brush 20 Each $8.07 $161.40
3” Angle Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $10.08 $100.80
2.5” Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $7.84 $78.40
3” Flat Sash China Bristle Oil Paint Brush 10 Each $7.24 $72.40
Spray Paint, Aerosol, 11-ounce 120 |[Can $2.90 $348.00
Sheepskin Roller Covers, 9” x 1", 20 per package 20 Pkg. $162.40 | $3,248.00
Premier Caulk White, 6 per package 20 Pkg. $8.40 $168.00
Masking Tape, 2” X 60 yards, 6 per package 50 Pkg. $14.10 | $705.00
Goof Off Cleaner, 8-ounce 10 Each XX XX
Traffic Marking Paint, Red (Fire Lane), 5-gallon buckets 500 [Bucket $53.75 | $26,875.00
Traffic Marking Paint, White, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket $38.75 | $3,875.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Yellow, 5-gallon buckets 100 |Bucket $38.75 | $3,875.00
Traffic Marking Paint, Blue, 5-gallon buckets 100 [Bucket $63.75 | $6,375.00
Tempered Glass 1/8” Clear 1 Sq. Ft.
Tempered Glass 1/8” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft.
Tempered Glass 1/4” Clear 1 Sq. Ft.

Page 18 of 20




General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Recreation Services | Rocky Duron and Sherwin Williams | Shiffler Equipment | Woodard Builders
Corporation Associates, Inc. Paint Company Sales, Inc. Supply
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Tempered Glass 1/4” Tinted 1 Sq. Ft
Wire Glass %" 1 Sq. Ft
Y, Clear Laminated 1 Sq. Ft
1" Tinted Insulated 1 Sq. Ft
Y4" Mirror glass 1 Sq. Ft
Tinting Film 1 Sq. Ft
Regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour
After regular business hours labor charge for all glass and/or
materials 1 Hour
Minimum number of hours
Minimum number of persons required for installation
Minimum number of persons required for application of
window tinting
Response time (must be within six hours)
Percentage off list price for items needed to repair broken
glass
Stop Sign — White/Red color, reflective aluminum, 24" X 24" 10 Each $36.49 | $364.90
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Right,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each $29.80 | $298.00
One Way Traffic Sign with Directional Arrow to Left,
White/Black color, reflective aluminum, 24"x18” 10 Each $29.80 | $298.00
Speed Limit Sign, Black/White color, reflective aluminum, 24”
X 18" 10 Each $29.80 | $298.00
“No Parking Anytime” Sign, Red/White color, reflective
aluminum, 18" X 12" 10 Each $18.95 | $189.50
U-Channel side post, 8’ length, high tensile steel, 2
pounds/linear foot 40 Each $21.25 | $850.00
Angle Iron, 1" X 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot
Angle Iron, 3" X 3" X 3/16” 1 Foot
Channel Iron, 5” X 6.7# 1 Foot
Diamond Tread Floor Plate, 48" X 96" X 14 gauge 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 12", #16 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Expanded Metal, 3/4”, #9 flat, sheet dimensions 48" X 96" 1 Each
Flat Iron, 1" X 1/8” 1 Foot
Flat Iron, 4"X 3/16” 1 Foot
Pipe — 2" X Schedule 40 1 Foot
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X ¥4" 1 Sq. Ft.
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 3/4" 1 Sheet
Plate Iron, 48" X 96" X 1" 1 Sheet
Rectangular Tubing, 3" X 2" X 11 gauge 1 Foot
Rectangular Tubing, 4” X 2” X 11 guage 1 Foot
Rods, Round, 1” X 20, hot rolled 1 Foot
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
VENDORS Recreation Services | Rocky Duron and Sherwin Williams | Shiffler Equipment | Woodard Builders
Corporation Associates, Inc. Paint Company Sales, Inc. Supply
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
General Maintenance Parts and Supplies Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Rods, Round, 3/8” X 20’ 1 Foot
Rods, Square, 1/2" X 20’ 1 Foot
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 16 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Sheet Steel — 48" X 96" X 14 guage 1 Sq. Ft
Square Tubing, 1” X 14 guage (.083) 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 6” X (3/16") 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 1.5” X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Square Tubing, 12" X 14 guage X 20' 1 Foot
Minimum order requirements
Nitrogen 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon 1 Cu. Ft.
Argon-CO, Mix 2 Cu. Ft.
Monthly Rental of Industrial Gas Bottles 1 Month
FOB Shipping Point,
prepaid and added to
Freight Included in bid price. None invoice. Freight None

charges vary. Call for
quote.

XX = Does not meet specifications
Blank Cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid

Present at opening:

Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent
Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Pam Fennell, Buyer
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies
Bid # 07-049

VENDOR

Allstate Sign &
Plague Corporation

American
Bearing Co.

American Time
& Signal Co.

Arlington Glass
Company

Benchmark
Signs

Centerline
Supply

Cooper Supply,
Inc.

Cowtown
Materials

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER GENERAL
MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Bathroom Stall Replacement Parts

Ceiling Tile/Grid Material

15%

Door Closers

Drywall Repair

Equipment Rental

Exit Devices

Fencing Repair Parts

Fire Safety Supplies

Flooring Repair Supplies

Glass

Hand Tools

Hardware/Carpentry Supplies

Insulation

15%

Key Duplication

Locks

Locker Repair Parts

Masonry

Metal Studs/Track

15%

Playground Repair Parts

Plywood/Lumber

Roofing Products

Safety Supplies

Sheet Rock

15%

Tile

Warehouse Supplies

Varies

Other

Varies

0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER PAINTING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Alex Plus

0%
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
Allstate Sign & American | American Time | Arlington Glass Benchmark Centerline |Cooper Supply,| Cowtown

VENDOR Plaque Corporation | Bearing Co. [ & Signal Co. Company Signs Supply Inc. Materials
Binks 10%
Coyote 0%
Crown 0%
Dalworth 0%
Daubert 0%
Deft 0%
Foster 0%
Gemini 0%
GoJo 0%
Hyde 0%
Kilz-Master Chem 0%
Klean Strip 0%
Krylon 0%
Lesco 0%
Lobo 0%
Mister Longarm 0%
Plasticoat 0%
Purdy 0%
Structorn 0%
USG 0%
Wallboard 0%
Whizz 0%
Wooster 0%
Zar United Gilsonite Lab. 0%
3M 0%
Other

0%
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER FENCING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED
Barbed Wire
Fencing Fabric, Light Weight
Fencing Fabric, Heavy Weight
Fencing Repair Parts
Other
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER SIGNAGE NOT
LISTED
Engraved Laminate Plastic w/Raised Braille Lettering 0% Call for quote 0%
Self-Stick Vinyl or Other Materials 0% Call for quote 0%
Outdoor Signage 0% Call for quote 10%
Architectural Signage 0% Call for quote 10%
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies
Bid # 07-049

VENDOR

Allstate Sign &
Plague Corporation

American
Bearing Co.

American Time
& Signal Co.

Arlington Glass
Company

Benchmark
Signs

Centerline
Supply

Cooper Supply,
Inc.

Cowtown
Materials

Letter-Board Signage

0%

Call for quote

0%

Custom Indoor Signage

0%

Call for quote

0%

Custom Outdoor Signage

0%

Call for quote

0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF STEEL AND OTHER
METALS NOT LISTED

Stainless Steel Alloys

0%

Aluminum Alloys

0%

Exotic Metals

0%

Other

0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF INDUSTRIAL
GASES/WELDING SUPPLIES NOT OTHERWISE

Torches

0%

Plasma Cutter

0%

Protective Eyewear

0%

Machinery

0%

Other

0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF ADDITIONAL ITEMS
FOR GENERAL MAINTENANCE PARTS AND
SUPPLIES

Air Compressors

Power Tools

Window Treatments

Freight

Shipping via truck.
FOB Deer Park, NY.
Call for quote on
freight charges.

Incoming
freight
charges. FOB
origin.

Included in
pricing

Included in
pricing

$50.00 if order
is less than
$1,000.00
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies
Bid # 07-049

VENDOR

Decker
Equipment

Fort Worth Bolt
& Tool Co.

Hancock
Sign Co.

The Home
Depot

ICI Paints

Jim Lea and
Associates

Kwal Paint

Maner Fire
Equipment

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER GENERAL
MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Bathroom Stall Replacement Parts

5%

Ceiling Tile/Grid Material

Door Closers

Drywall Repair

Equipment Rental

10%

Exit Devices

10%

Fencing Repair Parts

Fire Safety Supplies

10%

25%

Flooring Repair Supplies

Glass

Hand Tools

30%

Hardware/Carpentry Supplies

25%

Insulation

Key Duplication

Locks

5%

Locker Repair Parts

5%

Masonry

Metal Studs/Track

Playground Repair Parts

5%

Plywood/Lumber

Roofing Products

Safety Supplies

25%

Sheet Rock

Tile

Warehouse Supplies

5%

25%

Other

5%

25%

0%

10% discount
on all Little
Tikes and

Fusion
products;
additional

discounts will
apply to
purchases
exceeding
$10,000.00.

0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER PAINTING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Alex Plus

25%
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
Decker Fort Worth Bolt| Hancock The Home Jim Lea and Maner Fire
VENDOR Equipment & Tool Co. Sign Co. Depot ICI Paints Associates Kwal Paint Equipment
Binks 10%
Coyote 25%
Crown 25%
Dalworth 25%
Daubert 25%
Deft 25%
Foster 25%
Gemini 25%
GoJo 25% 25%
Hyde 30% 25%
Kilz-Master Chem 25%
Klean Strip 25%
Krylon 30% 25%
Lesco 25%
Lobo 25%
Mister Longarm 25%
Plasticoat 25%
Purdy 25%
Structorn 25%
USG 25%
Wallboard 25%
Whizz 25%
Wooster 25%
Zar United Gilsonite Lab. 25%
3M 25% 25%
Other 30-50% off list
25% 25% price
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER FENCING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED
Barbed Wire
Fencing Fabric, Light Weight
Fencing Fabric, Heavy Weight
Fencing Repair Parts
Other
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER SIGNAGE NOT
LISTED
Engraved Laminate Plastic w/Raised Braille Lettering 5% 2%
Self-Stick Vinyl or Other Materials 2%
Outdoor Signage 5% 2%
Architectural Signage 2%
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies
Bid # 07-049

VENDOR

Decker
Equipment

Fort Worth Bolt
& Tool Co.

Hancock
Sign Co.

The Home
Depot

ICI Paints

Jim Lea and
Associates

Kwal Paint

Maner Fire
Equipment

Letter-Board Sighage

5%

2%

Custom Indoor Signage

5%

2%

Custom Outdoor Signage

5%

2%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF STEEL AND OTHER
METALS NOT LISTED

Stainless Steel Alloys

Aluminum Alloys

Exotic Metals

Other

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF INDUSTRIAL
GASES/WELDING SUPPLIES NOT OTHERWISE

Torches

Plasma Cutter

Protective Eyewear

25%

Machinery

Other

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF ADDITIONAL ITEMS
FOR GENERAL MAINTENANCE PARTS AND
SUPPLIES

Air Compressors

20%

Power Tools

25%

Window Treatments

Freight

Catalog prices do

not include

shipping. Call for

estimate.

Only for special
order
merchandise

Depends on
item ordered

None

None

None
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies
Bid # 07-049

Mansfield Glass Metal Technology Olen Williams, | Overhead Door Pioneer Mfg Pittsburgh
VENDOR and Mirror Supermarkets Products Inc. Company of DFW Company Paints

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER GENERAL
MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Bathroom Stall Replacement Parts

Ceiling Tile/Grid Material

Door Closers

Drywall Repair

Equipment Rental

Exit Devices

Fencing Repair Parts

Fire Safety Supplies 10%

Flooring Repair Supplies

Glass

Hand Tools 10%

Hardware/Carpentry Supplies 10%

Insulation

Key Duplication

Locks

Locker Repair Parts

Masonry 10%

Metal Studs/Track

Playground Repair Parts

Plywood/Lumber

Roofing Products

Safety Supplies 10%

Sheet Rock

Tile

Warehouse Supplies

Other
Discount varies
10% off list price for scoreboard
for items needed sales and
for broken glass service. Call for
repair 10% quote. 0% 0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER PAINTING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Alex Plus
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies
Bid # 07-049

Mansfield Glass Metal Technology Olen Williams, | Overhead Door Pioneer Mfg Pittsburgh
VENDOR and Mirror Supermarkets Products Inc. Company of DFW Company Paints

Binks

Coyote

Crown

Dalworth

Daubert

Deft

Foster

Gemini

GoJo

Hyde

Kilz-Master Chem

Klean Strip

Krylon

Lesco

Lobo

Mister Longarm

Plasticoat

Purdy

Structorn

USG

Wallboard

Whizz

Wooster

Zar United Gilsonite Lab.

3M

Other
0% 0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER FENCING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Barbed Wire

Fencing Fabric, Light Weight

Fencing Fabric, Heavy Weight

Fencing Repair Parts

Other

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER SIGNAGE NOT
LISTED

Engraved Laminate Plastic w/Raised Braille Lettering

Self-Stick Vinyl or Other Materials

Outdoor Signage

Architectural Signage
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
Mansfield Glass Metal Technology Olen Williams, | Overhead Door Pioneer Mfg Pittsburgh
VENDOR and Mirror Supermarkets Products Inc. Company of DFW Company Paints
Letter-Board Signage
Custom Indoor Signage
Custom Outdoor Signage
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF STEEL AND OTHER
METALS NOT LISTED
Stainless Steel Alloys 10%
Aluminum Alloys 10%
Exotic Metals 10%
Other
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF INDUSTRIAL
GASES/WELDING SUPPLIES NOT OTHERWISE
Torches 10%
Plasma Cutter 10%
Protective Eyewear 10%
Machinery 10%
Other 10%
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF ADDITIONAL ITEMS
FOR GENERAL MAINTENANCE PARTS AND
SUPPLIES
Air Compressors 10%
Power Tools 10%
Window Treatments
$15.00 for orders
. under $150.00; Varies. Call for As c_harged by_ Pricing includes
Freight None . S supplier on repair . None
otherwise, shipping quote. delivery
is free parts ordered
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049

VENDOR

Professional
Turf Products

Recreation
Services Corp.

Rocky Duron &
Associates, Inc.

Sherwin Williams
Paint Co.

Shiffler Equipment
Sales, Inc.

Woodard Builders
Supply

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER GENERAL
MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Bathroom Stall Replacement Parts

0%

Ceiling Tile/Grid Material

Door Closers

0%

Drywall Repair

Equipment Rental

Exit Devices

Fencing Repair Parts

Fire Safety Supplies

Flooring Repair Supplies

Glass

Hand Tools

Hardware/Carpentry Supplies

Insulation

Key Duplication

Locks

Locker Repair Parts

25%

Masonry

Metal Studs/Track

Playground Repair Parts

Plywood/Lumber

Roofing Products

Safety Supplies

Sheet Rock

Tile

Warehouse Supplies

Other

0%

0%

0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER PAINTING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED

Alex Plus

30%
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049
Professional Recreation Rocky Duron & | Sherwin Williams | Shiffler EQuipment | Woodard Builders

VENDOR Turf Products | Services Corp. | Associates, Inc. Paint Co. Sales, Inc. Supply
Binks 30%
Coyote 30%
Crown 30%
Dalworth 30%
Daubert 30%
Deft 30%
Foster 30%
Gemini 30%
GoJo 30%
Hyde 30%
Kilz-Master Chem 30%
Klean Strip 30%
Krylon 30%
Lesco 30%
Lobo 30%
Mister Longarm 30%
Plasticoat 30%
Purdy 30%
Structorn 30%
USG 30%
Wallboard 30%
Whizz 30%
Wooster 30%
Zar United Gilsonite Lab. 30%
3M 30%
Other

30%
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER FENCING
SUPPLIES NOT LISTED
Barbed Wire
Fencing Fabric, Light Weight
Fencing Fabric, Heavy Weight
Fencing Repair Parts
Other
GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF OTHER SIGNAGE NOT
LISTED
Engraved Laminate Plastic w/Raised Braille Lettering 0%
Self-Stick Vinyl or Other Materials 0%
Outdoor Signage 0%
Architectural Signage 0%
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies

Bid # 07-049

VENDOR

Professional
Turf Products

Recreation
Services Corp.

Rocky Duron &
Associates, Inc.

Sherwin Williams
Paint Co.

Shiffler Equipment
Sales, Inc.

Woodard Builders
Supply

Letter-Board Sighage

0%

Custom Indoor Signage

0%

Custom Outdoor Signage

0%

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF STEEL AND OTHER
METALS NOT LISTED

Stainless Steel Alloys

Aluminum Alloys

Exotic Metals

Other

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF INDUSTRIAL
GASES/WELDING SUPPLIES NOT OTHERWISE

Torches

Plasma Cutter

Protective Eyewear

Machinery

Other

GENERAL DISCOUNT OFF ADDITIONAL ITEMS
FOR GENERAL MAINTENANCE PARTS AND
SUPPLIES

Air Compressors

Power Tools

Window Treatments

Freight

Shipping
charges vary
according to

weight.

Included in bid
price.

Per order if under
$100.00; over
$100.00 is no

charge.

None

FOB Shipping Point,
prepaid and added to
invoice. Freight
charges vary. Call for
guote.

None
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General Maintenance Parts and Supplies, Bid #07-049

VENDOR The Home Depot Rental One
Pick-Up and

TOOL AND EQUIPMENT RENTAL FULL DAY WEEK 4 WEEKS FULL DAY WEEK 4 WEEKS | Delivery Fee
Tractor with 5-Foot Brush Hog
Sod Cutter $29.00 $116.00 $346.00 $80.00 $280.00 $720.00 $60.00
Stump Grinder $98.00 $392.00 $1,176.00 $120.00 $360.00 | $1,080.00 $60.00
Tree Limb Chipper $160.00 $640.00 $1,920.00 $175.00 $550.00 | $1,550.00 $60.00
Bucket Lift $180.00 $540.00 | $1,620.00 $60.00
Scissor Lift, 19-Foot, Electric $120.00 $360.00 $1,080.00 $90.00 $270.00 $400.00 $100.00
Scissor Lift, 26-Foot, Electric $110.00 $330.00 $650.00 $100.00
Scissor Lift, 32-Foot, Electric $150.00 $450.00 | $1,000.00 $100.00
Scissor Lift, 26-Foot, Gas $140.00 $420.00 | $1,100.00 $100.00
Scissor Lift, 43-Foot, Gas $190.00 $570.00 | $1,500.00 $100.00
Asphalt Roller $200.00 $600.00 | $1,600.00 $100.00
Trencher, Rider 4"=$160.00| 4"=$480.00 | 4"=$1,440.00| $230.00 $690.00 | $1,900.00 $100.00
Trencher, Walk-Behind 4"=$148.00| 4"=$592.00 | 4"=%$1,760.00| $120.00 $360.00 $950.00 $60.00
90-pound Jack Hammer Gas=$68 | Gas=$272 | Gas=$816 $30.00 $90.00 $270.00 $60.00
Rear-Tine Tiller $62.00 $248.00 $744.00 $120.00 $360.00 | $1,080.00 $60.00
Backhoe, 8-Foot Dig Terramite $135.00 $415.00 | $1,095.00 $100.00
Backhoe, 14-Foot Dig J.D. 310G $215.00 $645.00 | $1,400.00 $100.00
Backhoe, 18-Foot Dig J.D. 310G with
Extendahoe $230.00 $690.00 | $1,750.00 $100.00
Water Pump, 2" Electric Sub with 1 DISCH $30.00 $120.00 $360.00 $25.00 $75.00 $185.00 $60.00
Water Pump, 2" Electric Sub with 1 suction,
1 DISCH $36.00 $140.00 $432.00 $35.00 $105.00 $225.00 $60.00
Water Pump, 3” Electric Sub with 1 suction,
1 DISCH $40.00 $160.00 $480.00 $45.00 Gas [$135.00 Gasfp325.00 Gag $60.00
Water Pump, 4” Electric Sub with 1 suction,
1 DISCH $70.00 Gas [$220.00 Gasp575.00 Gag $60.00
Water Pump, 6” Electric Sub with 1 suction,
1 DISCH $150.00 Gas|$450.00 Gas|1,225.00 G5 $60.00
Air Compressor, 185 CFM $90.00 $270.00 $695.00 $60.00
Air Compressor, 375 CFM $160.00 $480.00 | $1,250.00 $60.00
Air Compressor, 100 CFM with 90-pound
Hammer/50-Foot Hose $100.00 $300.00 $795.00 $60.00
Generator, 2500 Watt $35.00 $110.00 $275.00 $60.00
Generator, 3500-4500 Watt $36.00 $144.00 $432.00 $50.00 $150.00 $375.00 $60.00
Generator, 6000 Watt $62.00 $248.00 $744.00 $60.00 $205.00 $525.00 $60.00
Generator, 25 KVA $120.00 $360.00 $925.00 $60.00
Generator, 40-45 KVA $150.00 $450.00 | $1,150.00 $60.00
Generator, 60 KVA $200.00 $600.00 | $1,550.00 $60.00
Light Tower with 4000-Watt Generator $85.00 $255.00 $650.00 $60.00

"Hot Shot" services are available. No charge was
Other . .

listed. No minimum order.
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