
Copy Paper Bid # 07-001

COPY PAPER
Qty Unit Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Dual Purpose White Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 35,200 Ream No Bid No Bid  $       2.88 $101,376.00 $2.444 $86,028.80 $2.50 $88,000.00 
Dual Purpose White Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, by 
truck load 79,200 Ream No Bid No Bid  $       2.88 $228,096.00 $2.424 $191,980.80 $2.47 $195,624.00 
Dual Purpose White Paper, 8.5 X 14, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 84-
86 brightness 100 Ream No Bid No Bid  $       3.97 $397.00 $3.474 $347.40 $3.94 $394.00 
Dual Purpose White Paper, 11 X 17, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 84-
86 brightness 30 Ream No Bid No Bid 6.36$       $190.80 $2.732 $81.96 $6.22 $186.60 
Dual Purpose Blue Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 330 Ream No Bid No Bid 3.31$       $1,092.30 $2.98 $983.40 $3.48 $1,148.40 
Dual Purpose Canary Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 600 Ream No Bid No Bid 3.31$       $1,986.00 $2.98 $1,788.00 $3.48 $2,088.00 

Dual Purpose Golden Rod Paper, 8.5 X 11, 
20-pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 600 Ream No Bid No Bid 3.31$       $1,986.00 $2.98 $1,788.00 $3.48 $2,088.00 
Dual Purpose Cherry Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 200 Ream No Bid No Bid 5.62$       $1,124.00 $3.17 $634.00 $3.48 $696.00 
Dual Purpose Green Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 600 Ream No Bid No Bid 3.31$       $1,986.00 $2.98 $1,788.00 $3.48 $2,088.00 
Dual Purpose Orchid Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 260 Ream No Bid No Bid 3.31$       $860.60 $2.98 $774.80 $3.48 $904.80 
Dual Purpose Pink Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 280 Ream No Bid No Bid 3.31$       $926.80 $2.98 $834.40 $3.48 $974.40 
Dual Purpose Red or Holiday Red Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 20-pound, 500 sheets per ream 150 Ream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 (24#) $825.00 No Bid No Bid
Kelly Green/Holiday Green Paper, 8.5 X 11, 
20-pound, 500 sheets per ream 90 Ream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 (24#) $495.00 No Bid No Bid
Dual Purpose Salmon Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream 120 Ream No Bid No Bid 3.31$       $397.20 $2.98 $357.60 $3.48 $417.60 
Dual Purpose Bright Green/Lime, 8.5 X 11, 
20-pound, 500 sheets per ream 700 Ream No Bid No Bid 8.55$       $5,985.00 $5.50 (24#) $3,850.00 No Bid No Bid
Dual Purpose Bright Lemon, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, 500 sheets per ream 230 Ream No Bid No Bid 8.55$       $1,966.50 $5.50 (24#) $1,265.00 No Bid No Bid
Dual Purpose Bright Orange/Tangerine, 8.5 X 
11, 20-pound, 500 sheets per ream 200 Ream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 (24#) $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid
Dual Purpose Bright Pink, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, 500 sheets per ream 300 Ream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 (24#) $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid
Dual Purpose Blue Vellum Bristol Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream 120 Ream No Bid No Bid 8.72$       $1,046.40 $3.26 $391.20 $3.86 $463.20 

Dual Purpose Canary Vellum Bristol Paper, 
8.5 X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream 88 Ream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.26 $286.88 $3.86 $339.68 
Dual Purpose Green Vellum Bristol Paper, 
8.5 X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream 176 Ream No Bid No Bid 8.72$       $1,534.72 $3.26 $573.76 $3.86 $679.36 

Bennett Printing and 
Office Supply Corporate Express, Inc.

Olmsted-Kirk Paper 
CompanyOffice Depot



Copy Paper Bid # 07-001

Dual Purpose Pink Vellum Bristol Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream 88 Ream No Bid No Bid 5.07$       $446.16 No Bid No Bid $3.86 $339.68 
Dual Purpose White Vellum Bristol Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream 320 Ream No Bid No Bid 8.04$       $2,572.80 $3.26 $1,043.20 $3.64 $1,164.80 
Heavy Weight White Paper, 8.5 X 11, Index 
110-pound, 250 sheets per ream 150 Ream No Bid No Bid 6.22$       $933.00 $4.23 $634.50 $4.79 $718.50 
Parchment Text, Natural, 8.5 X 11, Long 
Grain, 60-pound, 250 sheets per ream 20 Ream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.04 $260.80 $9.32 $186.40 

Present at opening:  Shelley Freeman, Purchasing Agent
                                    Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Catalog Discount for all other items

Freight

Special Instructions

None

Minimum Order

5-91%

None

Call for pricing.

None if order $500 or more

None None

None on standard orders None

0% 2006 Business 

Office Depot reserves the 
right to evaluate its paper 
prices on a quarterly basis 
and will attempt to notify 
MISD in writing of any 

increase or decrease in 
writing with a 30-day time 

frame.

All prices are firm until 
12/31/06.

None

None $500.00 for free delivery.



Copy Paper Bid # 07-001

COPY PAPER

Dual Purpose White Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose White Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, by 
truck load
Dual Purpose White Paper, 8.5 X 14, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 84-
86 brightness
Dual Purpose White Paper, 11 X 17, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 84-
86 brightness
Dual Purpose Blue Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Canary Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream

Dual Purpose Golden Rod Paper, 8.5 X 11, 
20-pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Cherry Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Green Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Orchid Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Pink Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Red or Holiday Red Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 20-pound, 500 sheets per ream
Kelly Green/Holiday Green Paper, 8.5 X 11, 
20-pound, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Salmon Paper, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, long grain, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Bright Green/Lime, 8.5 X 11, 
20-pound, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Bright Lemon, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Bright Orange/Tangerine, 8.5 X 
11, 20-pound, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Bright Pink, 8.5 X 11, 20-
pound, 500 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Blue Vellum Bristol Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream

Dual Purpose Canary Vellum Bristol Paper, 
8.5 X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose Green Vellum Bristol Paper, 
8.5 X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

$2.443 $85,993.60 $2.475 $87,120.00

$2.323 $183,981.60 $2.475 $196,020.00

$3.376 $337.60 $3.970 $397.00

$5.47 $164.10 $6.160 $184.80

$3.464 $1,143.12 $3.515 $1,159.95

$3.464 $2,078.40 $3.515 $2,109.00

$3.464 $2,078.40 $3.515 $2,109.00

$3.464 $692.80 $3.515 $703.00

$3.464 $2,078.40 $3.515 $2,109.00

$3.464 $900.64 $3.515 $913.90

$3.464 $969.92 $3.515 $984.20

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$4.564 $410.76 No Bid No Bid

$3.464 $415.68 $3.515 $421.80

$4.564 $3,194.80 No Bid No Bid

$4.564 $1,049.72 No Bid No Bid

$4.564 $912.80 No Bid No Bid

$4.564 $1,369.20 No Bid No Bid

$3.64 $436.80 No Bid No Bid

$3.64 $320.32 No Bid No Bid

$3.64 $640.64 No Bid No Bid

Xerox CorporationRicoh Corporation



Copy Paper Bid # 07-001

Dual Purpose Pink Vellum Bristol Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream
Dual Purpose White Vellum Bristol Paper, 8.5 
X 11, 67-pound, 250 sheets per ream
Heavy Weight White Paper, 8.5 X 11, Index 
110-pound, 250 sheets per ream
Parchment Text, Natural, 8.5 X 11, Long 
Grain, 60-pound, 250 sheets per ream

Present at opening:  Shelley Freeman, Purc
                                    Dottie Morrow, Buyer

Catalog Discount for all other items

Freight

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

$3.64 $320.32 No Bid No Bid

$3.39 $1,084.80 No Bid No Bid

$4.47 $670.50 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$250.00 for free delivery

After 12/31, price subject 
to 7.5% increase per 

quarter.  Xerox will only 
increase their price if an 
increase is received from 
its supplier.  Call 24 hours 

prior to delivery for 
appointment

F.O.B. Destination

0-30%

Must call for pricing.  Pricing 
firm to 9/30/07 on all items 
except 11" white.  11" white 
pricing valid for delivery as 

stated in bid.

None if order is $250 or 

$200.00 


