1 Computer Hardware, Software, Peripherals, Etc.
Bid #06-024
Creative IT
COMPUTER HARDWARE, Apple Computer, Boxlight CDW Government, Solutions Dell Marketing, Discovery
SOFTWARE, PERIPHERALS, ETC. Amer.com Inc. B & H Photo Corporation CCV Software, Inc. Inc. Network, Inc. L.P. Education
Discount 35% off MSRP Education% 2% 19% 0% 0% 75% Varies 15%
Method of Pricing Net Pricing Net Pricing Net Pricing (B) Catalog Pricing Net Pricing Net Pricing Texas DIR Discount Pricing
CISV with State of Texas? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
CISV Number 1-59-3478766-200 |1-94-2404110-104] 1-13-2768071-300 | 1-68-0099098-400 | 1-55-0624066-000 | 1-36-4230110-800 | 1-75-2858040-400 | 1-74-2616805-400
Accept Purchase Orders? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Reference Sheet completed? No Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes, but discount will
On-Line ordering? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes not apply
None if order is Standard S&H per
Freight None None None None None None over $1,000.00 None catalog
Minimum Order None None None None None None None None None

XX=Does not qualify

PRESENT AT OPENING:
Dottie Morrow
Tara Ingle




2 Computer Hardware, Software, Peripherals, Etc.
Bid #06-024
Global
COMPUTER HARDWARE, Gov't/Education Gov Lenovo (United |M & A Technology,| Midwest MAC
SOFTWARE, PERIPHERALS, ETC. | Don Johnston, Inc. | Educate-Me.Net Gateway Solutions, Inc. GoTolearn Connection, Inc.| Learning Services States), Inc. Inc. Parts
10% except site
licenses/networks
(0%);
hardware/peripherals
Discount 0% 5-17% No Bid 4% Up to 30% 3% only 3%. 15-25% Up to 40% 0%
Method of Pricing List Catalog Pricing Catalog Pricing No Bid Discount Pricing | Benchmark Pricing Web Pricing Catalog Pricing Discount Pricing
CISV with State of Texas? No No No Bid Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
CISV Number No Bid 1-20-272419-800| 1-75-2964375-500 | 1-52-1837891-5| 1-93-0894387-700 | 1-52-2449153-800 | 1-75-2132118-600
Accept Purchase Orders? Yes Yes No Bid Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Reference Sheet completed? Yes No No Bid Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
On-Line ordering? No Yes No Bid Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
3% plus $5.00
$6 to $32 unless handling, waived
over $1,000 which is Free with $600 for software orders | Free for standard None for orders

Freight 3% None or more order | $5.00 per module FOB over $500.00 ground shipping. over $500.00 $10.00
Minimum Order None None No Bid None None None None None None None

XX=Does not qualify

PRESENT AT OPENING:
Dottie Morrow
Tara Ingle




3 Computer Hardware, Software, Peripherals, Etc.
Bid #06-024
Midwest
COMPUTER HARDWARE, Technology Premio Computer, | Renaissance Learning, | RICHO Business SHI Government Schoolware, | Silicon Mountain
SOFTWARE, PERIPHERALS, ETC. Products Office Max Inc. Inc. Systems Solutions Inc. Memory, Inc. SHEA-PC
Discount No Bid XX 0% 10%-50% Varies 0% 30-40% 7%
Method of Pricing No Bid XX Benchmark Pricing Discount/Cost Plus Net Pricing Retail/Shelf Net Pricing Discount Pricing
CISV with State of Texas? No Bid XX Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
CISV Number No Bid XX 1-33-0357649-300 1-39-1559474-400 1-22-2783521-700 | 1-22-369-5478-500 Pending 1-84-1439750-700 | 1-42-1591312-200
Accept Purchase Orders? No Bid XX Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Reference Sheet completed? No Bid XX Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes
On-Line ordering? No Bid XX No Yes No Yes No Yes Yes
$0-$49.99=$4.95;

$50-$249.99 =$7.95;

$250-$449.99=$12.95;

$450-$999.99=$15.95;

$1000-$1999.99=$21.95;
$2000-$3499.99=$29.95;

$3500 & over=1% of None unless listed on| 2% of total None for orders
Freight No Bid XX None total Included quote cost over $500.00 $10.00
Minimum Order No Bid $25.00 $100.00 None None None None None None

XX=Does not qualify

PRESENT AT OPENING:
Dottie Morrow
Tara Ingle




4 Computer Hardware, Software, Peripherals, Etc.
Bid #06-024
COMPUTER HARDWARE, Sleek Software | Software Express, | Software Plus, Technology Tom Snyder West
SOFTWARE, PERIPHERALS, ETC. Corporation Inc. Ltd. Techdepot Resource Center Productions Technologies

Discount 0% 10% 2% 7% Varies 0% 5% to 40%
Method of Pricing Benchmark Pricing Discount Pricing Net Pricing Net Pricing Shelf Net Pricing
CISV with State of Texas? Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes
CISV Number 1-74-2714226-400 | 1-56-1738100-700 1-06-1526627-600 | 1-36-4035189-900 | 1-96-0159280-100 | 1-74-3024414-900
Accept Purchase Orders? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Reference Sheet completed? Yes Yes Yes Only one Yes Yes Yes
On-Line ordering? No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

$0-$30=%$2.50;

$30-$500=8%;

UPS Ground Free Ground $501-$1000=$7%;

Freight $20.00 None Shipping Cost Shipping $9.95 minimum | Over $1000=$6% Included
Minimum Order None $100.00 None $1.000 None None None

XX=Does not qualify

PRESENT AT OPENING:

Dottie Morrow
Tara Ingle




