Grounds Equipment and Supplies

Bid #12-080
A Better American Bearing . Classic Turf .
VENDORS Choice/USA Turf Company Austin Turf and Tractor BSN Sports Equipment Clear Fork Materials
Grounds Parts, Supplies and . Unit | Extended . Extended . Extended . Extended . Extended Unit Extended
Service Bid #12-080 Qty Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost

Scag Turf Tiger Z-Mower 2 Each $9,599.25 | $19,198.50
ALTERNATE: Turf Tiger 2 Each
Infield Drag 1 Each $11,400.00| $11,400.00
Utility Vehicle 2 Each $7,500.00 | $15,000.00
Utility Vehicle--with canopy 2 Each $1,000.00 | $2,000.00
Field Painter 1 Each $1,174.43| $1,174.43
22" Push Mower 1 Each $703.44 $703.44
ALTERNATE: Push Mower 1 Each $758.88 $758.88
Air Compressor 1 Each $1,025.00 | $1,025.00
Trimmer, Echo SRM 230 only 2 Each $218.99 $437.98
Edger, Echo, PE 230 only 2 Each $257.99 $515.98
Blower, Echo, PB 620ST only 2 Each $343.99 $687.98
Field Chalker 1 Each $126.67 | $126.67
Hot Shot Spray Nozzle 4 Each
Hose, High Pressure, green only 2 Each
6 x 4 Keystone Screen Drag 1 Each $184.12 | $184.12
3 x 5 Metal Nail Drag 1 Each $522.77 | $522.77
Rakes, 36" 12 Each $32.58 $390.96
Rakes, 30" 4 Each $45.74 $182.96
8" dirt tamps 2 Each $49.14 $98.28
:grf;eld Conditioner, bulk, Diamond 24 Ton $203.72 | $4,889.28
::r:rf(l)eld Conditioner, pallet, Diamond 1 Pallet $507.97 | $507.97
Premium Top Soil — Weed-free,
mixed with a little mulch or 150 Yard $37.25 | $5,811.00
compost
Clay, Red, Infield 80 Ton $148.16 | $11,852.80 $35.25 | $2,961.00
Screened Arena Sand 150 Yard $27.25 | $4,251.00
Infield Drying Agent (Baseball
/Softball Fields), 50-pound bags 1| Pallet $592.58 |  $592.58
Bricks, Clay 80 Each XX XX
Clay, home plate/mound, pallet of 1 Pallet $646.63 | $646.63
50 Ib. bags
Fire Ant Bait, Dupont Advion only,
12 Ib. bag 60 | Bag
Weed eater Trim Line, .095—Non-| - 5 | g5 $38.95 | $1,168.50 $43.77 | $1,313.10
rounded mono filament
S;'S'GTWO'CVC'E — 48 bottles per 25 | case $72.75 | $1,818.75 $99.27 | $2,481.75
Fertilizer 20-0-0 or 21-0-0, Fifty-
Pound Bags 2000 Bag
ALTERNATE: Fertilizer 2000 Bag
Fertilizer PRE-M+0-0-7 - Fifty-
Pound Bags 80 Bag
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Grounds Equipment and Supplies

Bid #12-080
VENDORS ChoiﬁeE/,StStZrTurf Ame(r:lgra:]np::;nng Austin Turf and Tractor BSN Sports (223?;;2:: Clear Fork Materials
Grounds Parts, Supplies and . Unit | Extended . Extended . Extended . Extended . Extended Unit Extended
Service Bid #12-080 Qty Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost
Fertilizer 18-24-12 - Fifty-Pound 120 Bag
Bags
DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER
Bob Cat
Briggs-Stratton 25%
Echo 25%
Hunter
John Deere
Kawasaki 25%
Kubota
Rainbird
Smithco
Scag 25%
Toro 25%
Turf Tiger 25%
Other 25%
DISCOUNT OFF LANDSCAPING PARTS
Landscaping Materials
Plant Supplies
Plants
Shrubs
Trees
Ground Cover
Annuals/Perennials
Grass Seed
Sod
Tree Trimming
Other
CATALOG DISCOUNT 0% 0% 0% 10% 25% 0%
Hot Shot Services Available? Yes Yes-$50.00 charge No No Yes
Average Delivery Time 3-4 hours 1-2 days 2-5 days 2-10 days 2-3 days 2 hours
Minimum Order None None None $25.00 None None
Freight None None upless itis a Included Included
special order.
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes No Yes Yes No

Blank cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX - Does not meet specifications

Note: Fertilizer was awarded to total lowest
combined bid.

Present at Bid Opening:
Elaine Johnson, Buyer
Pam Fennell, Buyer
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Grounds Equipment and Supplies

Bid #12-080
VENDORS Ewing Irrigation Gail's Flags H.S.C. Supply Co. FEIEENE eI eE] Horizon Distributors el PEES
Company Landscapes
Grounds Parts, Supplies and . . Extended . Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended . Extended Unit Extended
Service Bid #12-080 Qty unit | Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost
Scag Turf Tiger Z-Mower 2 Each
ALTERNATE: Turf Tiger 2 Each
Infield Drag 1 Each
Utility Vehicle 2 Each
Utility Vehicle--with canopy 2 Each
Field Painter 1 Each
22" Push Mower 1 Each $879.00 | $879.00
ALTERNATE: Push Mower 1 Each
Air Compressor 1 Each
Trimmer, Echo SRM 230 only 2 Each $275.50( $551.00 $223.99 | $447.98
Edger, Echo, PE 230 only 2 Each $313.50| $627.00 $263.99 $527.98
Blower, Echo, PB 620ST only 2 Each $399.00( $798.00 $327.99 $655.98
Field Chalker 1 Each $289.95 $289.95
Hot Shot Spray Nozzle 4 Each
Hose, High Pressure, green only 2 Each $195.00 $390.00
6 x 4 Keystone Screen Drag 1 Each $225.00 $225.00 $195.88 | $195.88
3 x 5 Metal Nail Drag 1 Each $499.95 $499.95
Rakes, 36" 12 Each $42.72 $512.64 $55.00 $660.00 $70.12 | $841.44 $40.75 $489.00 $42.00 $504.00
Rakes, 30" 4 Each $63.52 | $254.08 $41.08 $164.32 $42.00 $168.00
8" dirt tamps 2 Each $54.53 $109.06 $70.00 $140.00 $77.27 | $154.54 $23.47 $46.94 $22.00 $44.00
:Qrfcl)eld Conditioner, bulk, Diamond 24 Ton $140.00 | $3,360.00 XX XX
:Dnrf(l)eld Conditioner, pallet, Diamond 1 Pallet $400.00 $400.00 XX XX
Premium Top Soil — Weed-free,
mixed with a little mulch or 150 Yard $19.46 | $2,919.00
compost
Clay, Red, Infield 80 Ton $50.00 $4,000.00 $44.50 | $3,560.00 $477.64 [$38,211.20
Screened Arena Sand 150 Yard $40.00 $6,000.00 $28.00 | $4,200.00
Infield Drying Agent (Baseball 1 | Pallet | $360.00 | $360.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 $372.00| $372.00 | $380.80 | $380.80 |$380.00| $380.00
/Softball Fields), 50-pound bags
Bricks, Clay 80 Each $1.90 $152.00 $2.50 $200.00 XX XX $2.07 $165.60
gﬁt’)’ Tg;‘: plate/mound, palletof | ;| oyt | $560.00 | $560.00 | $400.00 | $400.00 $390.00| $390.00 | $578.00 | $578.00 |$652.00 | $652.00
E'Z’TbAggia”' Dupont Adviononly, | ¢ | gao | $146.50 | $8,790.00 $117.00 | $7,020.00 | $150.00 | $9,000.00 | $150.67 | $9,040.20
Weed eater Trim Line, 095 —Non-| 5 | g $58.00 | $1,740.00 | $56.05 | $1,681.50 $31.75 | $952.50 | $28.00 | $840.00
rounded mono filament
S;'S'eTWO'CVC'e — 48 bottles per 25 | case $81.23 | $2,030.75 $54.00 | $1,350.00 | $45.60 | $1,140.00
Eiﬁ'r']'geé;gos'o'o or21-0:0, Fifty- | 5600 | Bag | $11.97 | $23,940.00 $9.75 | $19,500.00 | $9.44 [$18,880.00| $13.80 |$27,600.00
ALTERNATE: Fertilizer 2000 Bag
Eiﬁ::';i;;iEMw@q - Fifty- 80 | Bag | $11.98 | $958.40 $12.25 | $980.00 $0.81 | $784.80 | $13.16 | $1,052.80
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Grounds Equipment and Supplies

Bid #12-080
VENDORS Ewing Irrigation Gail's Flags H.S.C. Supply Co. Al R Horizon Distributors Ll RS (s
Company Landscapes
Grounds Parts, Supplies and . . Extended . Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended . Extended Unit Extended
Service Bid #12-080 Qty Unit - |Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost
gt;gglzer 18-24-12 - Fify-Pound | 150 | Bag | $2279 | $2.734.80 $17.25 | $2,070.00 | $18.47 |$2,216.40 | $25.90 | $3,108.00
DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER
Bob Cat
Briggs-Stratton
Echo 20%
Hunter 49% 57% 53%
John Deere
Kawasaki 20%
Kubota
Rainbird 49% 56% 51%
Smithco
Scag
Toro 47% *Irrigation Only 51% 51%-Irrigation only
Turf Tiger
Other 0-63%
DISCOUNT OFF LANDSCAPING PARTS
Landscaping Materials 0-8%-Buyboard
Plant Supplies 0-5%-Buyboard
Plants 0-5%-Buyboard
Shrubs 0-5%-Buyboard
Trees 0-5%-Buyboard
Ground Cover 0-5%-Buyboard
Annuals/Perennials 0-5%-Buyboard
Grass Seed 0-5%-Buyboard
Sod 0-8%-Buyboard
Tree Trimming
Other
CATALOG DISCOUNT 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0-63%-Buyboard
Hot Shot Services Available? No Yes No Yes-$10.00 charge Yes
Average Delivery Time 3-4 hours 2-3 days Yes-$50.00 charge 2-4 days 3 hours 2-10 days
Minimum Order None $1.00 None None None None
Freight Freeste:é:fir:;:;non Free Shipping Fr:fss’:!ggrgrszfzpt None Free Shipping Free Shipping
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No

Blank cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX - Does not meet specifications

Note: Fertilizer was awarded to total lowest
combined bid.

Present at Bid Opening:
Elaine Johnson, Buyer
Pam Fennell, Buyer
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Grounds Equipment and Supplies

Bid #12-080

VENDORS

Jones Equipment & Turf,

Justin Seed Company

Lawn and Garden

Longhorn, Inc.

Mansfield Feed Mill

Metro Irrigation

Paul's Starter and

Pioneer

Professional Turf

Rocky's Stone and

Silver Creek Materials

Inc. Warehouse Supply, Inc. Alternator Manufacturing Products, LP More, Inc.
Grounds Parts, Supplies and . . Extended . Extended . Extended . Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended . Extended Unit Extended . Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Service Bid #12-080 Qty Unit | Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
Scag Turf Tiger Z-Mower 2 Each XX XX XX XX XX XX
ALTERNATE: Turf Tiger 2 Each XX XX
Infield Drag 1 Each $12,250.00| $12,250.00
Utility Vehicle 2 Each |$8,231.25| $16,462.50 $6,989.00 | $13,978.00
Utility Vehicle--with canopy 2 Each | $128.20 $256.40 $422.00 $844.00
Field Painter 1 Each $999.00 | $999.00
22" Push Mower 1 Each $1,085.00 | $1,085.00 | $925.00 $925.00 $999.00 $999.00
ALTERNATE: Push Mower 1 Each
Air Compressor 1 Each
Trimmer, Echo SRM 230 only 2 Each $220.00 $440.00 $215.00 $430.00
Edger, Echo, PE 230 only 2 Each $256.00 $512.00 $250.00 $500.00
Blower, Echo, PB 620ST only 2 Each $320.00 $640.00 $325.00 $650.00
Field Chalker 1 Each $350.00 | $350.00
Hot Shot Spray Nozzle 4 Each $59.00 | $236.00
Hose, High Pressure, green only 2 Each
6 x 4 Keystone Screen Drag 1 Each
3 x 5 Metal Nail Drag 1 Each
Rakes, 36" 12 Each
Rakes, 30" 4 Each
8" dirt tamps 2 Each $29.00 $58.00 $52.00 $104.00
Infield Conditioner, bulk, Diamond 24 Ton
Pro
Infield Conditioner, pallet, Diamond 1 Pallet
Pro
Premium Top Soil — Weed-free,
mixed with a little mulch or 150 Yard $24.00 | $3,600.00 | $21.98 $3,297.00
compost
Clay, Red, Infield 80 Ton $18.00 | $1,440.00
Screened Arena Sand 150 Yard $38.00 | $5,700.00 | $14.38 $2,157.00
Infield Drying Agent (Baseball
/Softball Fields), 50-pound bags 1| Pallet $440.00 | $440.00
Bricks, Clay 80 Each
Clay, home plate/mound, pallet of 1 Pallet $600.00 | $600.00
50 Ib. bags
Fire Ant Bait, Dupont Advion only,
12 Ib. bag 60 | Bag
Weed eater Trim Line, .095—Non-| - 5, | g $39.99 | $1,199.70 | $37.00 $110.00
rounded mono filament
S;'S'GTWO'CVC'E ~ 48 bottles per 25 | case $84.00 | $2,100.00 | $110.00 | $2,750.00
Fertilizer 20-0-0 or 21-0-0, Fifty- 2000 Bag $11.48 |$22,960.00
Pound Bags
ALTERNATE: Fertilizer 2000 Bag $10.28 [$20,560.00
Fertilizer PRE-M+0-0-7 - Fifty-
Pound Bags 80 Bag
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Grounds Equipment and Supplies
Bid #12-080

VENDORS

Jones Equipment & Turf,

Inc.

Justin Seed Company

Lawn and Garden
Warehouse

Longhorn, Inc.

Mansfield Feed Mill

Metro Irrigation
Supply, Inc.

Paul's Starter and
Alternator

Pioneer

Manufacturing

Professional Turf
Products, LP

Rocky's Stone and
More, Inc.

Silver Creek Materials

Grounds Parts, Supplies and

Service Bid #12-080 Qty

Unit

Extended

Unit Cost
Cost

Extended

Unit Cost
Cost

Extended

Unit Cost
Cost

Extended

Unit Cost
Cost

Extended
Cost

Unit
Cost

Extended
Cost

Unit
Cost

Extended

Unit Cost
Cost

Unit
Cost

Extended
Cost

Extended

Unit Cost
Cost

Extended
Cost

Unit
Cost

Extended
Cost

Unit
Cost

Fertilizer 18-24-12 - Fifty-Pound

Bags 120

Bag

$19.22 | $2,306.40

DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER

Bob Cat

Briggs-Stratton

25%

Echo

25%

List-15%

Hunter

List-52%

51%

John Deere

Kawasaki

10%

25%

List-15%--engine parts

Kubota

Rainbird

List-54%

51%

Smithco

Scag

Toro

25%

List-20%--mower parts

Turf Tiger

Other

Toro Irrigation-List 50%

DISCOUNT OFF LANDSCAPING PARTS

Landscaping Materials

3%

Plant Supplies

3%

Plants

Shrubs

Trees

Ground Cover

Annuals/Perennials

Grass Seed

3%

Sod

Tree Trimming

Other

3%

CATALOG DISCOUNT

0%

3%

0%

0%

0%

51%

0%

0%

0%

0%

Hot Shot Services Available?

No

Yes-$150.00 charge

No

Yes

Yes

Yes

No

No

Yes-Charge will vary

Yes

Yes

Average Delivery Time

3 days

2 days

3 days

3 days

1 hour

1 day

2 days

3-5 days

1 day

24 hours

1 day

Minimum Order

None

$300.00

None

None

None

None

None

None

Freight

Standard UPS Ground
rates will apply.

Call for Quote

Free Shipping

N/A

Free Shipping

N/A

Call for Quote

Call for Quote

Included

EPCNT Agreement?

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Blank cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX - Does not meet specifications

Note: Fertilizer was awarded to total lowest

combined bid.

Present at Bid Opening:
Elaine Johnson, Buyer
Pam Fennell, Buyer
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Grounds Equipment and Supplies

Bid #12-080
VENDORS Texas Water Products ULETHEEl ST Zlmmgrer pULoelEe:
Company Equipment, Inc.
Grounds Parts, Supplies and . Unit Extended Unit Extended . Extended
Service Bid #12-080 Qty Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost

Scag Turf Tiger Z-Mower 2 Each
ALTERNATE: Turf Tiger 2 Each
Infield Drag 1 Each
Utility Vehicle 2 Each
Utility Vehicle--with canopy 2 Each
Field Painter 1 Each
22" Push Mower 1 Each
ALTERNATE: Push Mower 1 Each
Air Compressor 1 Each
Trimmer, Echo SRM 230 only 2 Each $208.89 $417.78
Edger, Echo, PE 230 only 2 Each $240.99 $481.98
Blower, Echo, PB 620ST only 2 Each $323.49 $646.98
Field Chalker 1 Each
Hot Shot Spray Nozzle 4 Each
Hose, High Pressure, green only 2 Each
6 x 4 Keystone Screen Drag 1 Each
3 x 5 Metal Nail Drag 1 Each
Rakes, 36" 12 Each
Rakes, 30" 4 Each
8" dirt tamps 2 Each
Infield Conditioner, bulk, Diamond 24 Ton
Pro
Infield Conditioner, pallet, Diamond 1 Pallet
Pro
Premium Top Soil — Weed-free,
mixed with a little mulch or 150 Yard
compost
Clay, Red, Infield 80 Ton
Screened Arena Sand 150 Yard
Infield Drying Agent (Baseball 1 Pallet
/Softball Fields), 50-pound bags
Bricks, Clay 80 Each
Clay, home plate/mound, pallet of
50 Ib. bags 1 Pallet
Fire Ant Bait, Dupont Advion only,
12 Ib. bag 60 | Bag
Weed eater Trlm Line, .095 — Non- 30 Spool $50.34 $1,510.20
rounded mono filament
S;'S'eTWO'CVC'e — 48 bottles per 25 | case $73.35 | $1,833.75
Fertilizer 20-0-0 or 21-0-0, Fifty-
Pound Bags 2000 Bag
ALTERNATE: Fertilizer 2000 Bag
Fertilizer PRE-M+0-0-7 - Fifty-
Pound Bags 80 Bag
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Grounds Equipment and Supplies

Bid #12-080

Tractor Supply

Zimmerer Kubota &

VENDORS Texas Water Products .
Company Equipment, Inc.
Grounds Parts, Supplies and . Unit Extended Unit Extended . Extended
Service Bid #12-080 Qly Unit Cost Cost Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost
Fertilizer 18-24-12 - Fifty-Pound 120 Bag
Bags
DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER
Bob Cat
Briggs-Stratton
Echo 5%
Hunter
John Deere
Kawasaki
Kubota 5%
Rainbird
Smithco
Scag 5%
Toro
Turf Tiger
Other
DISCOUNT OFF LANDSCAPING PARTS
Landscaping Materials
Plant Supplies
Plants
Shrubs
Trees
Ground Cover
Annuals/Perennials
Grass Seed
Sod
Tree Trimming
Other
CATALOG DISCOUNT 0% 0% 0%
Hot Shot Services Available? Yes No No
Average Delivery Time 1-7 days 1-3 days
Minimum Order None None None
Freight None N/A Charged as incurred
EPCNT Agreement? Yes Yes Yes

Blank cell under "Unit Price" = No Bid
XX - Does not meet specifications

Note: Fertilizer was awarded to total lowest
combined bid.

Present at Bid Opening:
Elaine Johnson, Buyer
Pam Fennell, Buyer
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