
Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

And Then There Were None 90 Each $5.60 $504.00 $4.89 $440.10 $4.36 $392.40
Jurassic Park 80 Each $6.40 $512.00 $5.59 $447.20 * $5.19 $415.20
Night 120 Each $7.96 $955.20 $6.97 $836.40 * $6.47 $776.40
Of Mice and Men 180 Each $7.20 $1,296.00 $6.30 $1,134.00 $5.58 $1,004.40
Pride and Prejudice 30 Each $3.96 $118.80 $3.47 $104.10 $2.97 $89.10
SAT Word Power Book 10 Each $11.06 $110.60
SAT Word Power Book II 10 Each $10.36 $103.60 $11.06 $110.60
Speak 120 Each $6.40 $768.00 $7.00 $840.00 $6.50 $780.00
Tarzan 45 Each $3.96 $178.20 $3.47 $156.15 $3.22 $144.90 
Tess of D'urbervilles 45 Each $3.96 $178.20 $3.47 $156.15 $3.22 $144.90 
The Adventures of Tom Sawyer 45 Each $4.76 $214.20 $3.49 $157.05
The Bridges of Toko-Ri 45 Each $5.60 $252.00 $4.89 $220.05 * $4.54 $204.30 
The Crystal Cave 90 Each $5.20 $468.00 $10.49 $944.10
The Grapes of Wrath 90 Each $13.60 $1,224.00 $11.90 $1,071.00 $14.50 $1,305.00 
The Great Gatsby 120 Each $12.00 $1,440.00 $10.50 $1,260.00 $12.80 $1,536.00 
The House on Mango Street 120 Each $8.80 $1,056.00 $7.70 $924.00 * $7.15 $858.00 
The Princess Bride 90 Each $5.60 $504.00 $4.89 $440.10 $5.99 $539.10 
Merriam-Webster's Collegiate Dictionary 180 Each $17.56 $3,160.80 $15.37 $2,766.60 $14.27 $2,568.60 
Roget's The New Thesaurus, 3rd Ed. 150 Each $17.90 $2,685.00 
Whirligig 90 Each $5.20 $468.00 $5.59 $503.10 
In Cold Blood 70 Each $12.00 $840.00 $10.50 $735.00 $12.80 $896.00 
Invisible Man 70 Each $3.96 $277.20 $3.47 $242.90 $3.22 $225.40 
MLA Handbook for Writers of Research Papers, 
7th Edition 90 Each * $17.60 $1,584.00 $22.00 $1,980.00 $23.81 $2,142.90 

Merriam Webster Thesaurus 999 Each $4.80 $4,795.20 $4.19 $4,185.81 $5.14 $5,134.86 
The Merriam- Webster Dictionary 999 Each $5.20 $5,194.80 $4.55 $4,545.45 $5.58 $5,574.42 
Merriam Webster's Dictionary and Thesaurus 999 Each $7.20 $7,192.80 $6.29 $6,283.71 $7.69 $7,682.31 
You Haven't Taught until They Have Learned:  
John Wooden's Teaching Principles and Practice 1 Each $15.77 $15.77

The Wisdom of Wooden:  My Century On and Off 
the Court 1 Each * $17.60 $17.60 $22.05 $22.05 

The Talent Code:  Greatness Isn't Born, It's Grown, 
Here's How 3 Each * $20.00 $20.00 $21.30 $63.90 

Well- Educated Mind:   A Guide to the Classical 
Education You Never Had 1 Each * $23.96 $23.96 $25.51 $25.51 

The Teaching Gap:  Best Ideas from the World's 
Teachers for Improving Education in the Classroom 1 Each * $12.00 $12.00 $12.80 $12.80 

Stand Your Ground:  Building Honorable Leaders 
the West Point Way 1 Each $27.96 $27.96 $21.60 $21.60 

School Leadership That Works:  From Research to 
Results 1 Each * $22.36 $22.36 $28.00 $28.00 

Outliners:  The Story of Success 1 Each $13.60 $13.60 $14.49 $14.49 
Origins of Genius:  Darwinian Perspectives on 
Creativity 1 Each * $47.96 $47.96 $60.00 $60.00 

Follett Library 
Resources, Inc. Frog PublicationsThe BooksourceBarnes & Noble 

Booksellers
Bright Point 

Literacy
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Follett Library 
Resources, Inc. Frog PublicationsThe BooksourceBarnes & Noble 

Booksellers
Bright Point 

Literacy

On Common Ground:  The Power of Professional 
Learning Communities 1 Each $27.96 $27.96 $35.00 $35.00 

Mindset:  The New Psychology of Success 20 Each * $12.80 $256.00 XX XX $22.15 $443.00 
Learning by Doing:  A handbook for Professional 
Learning Communities at Work, Second Edition 1 Each * $27.96 $27.96 $35.00 $35.00 

Handbook for Classroom Instruction that Works 1 Each $31.47 $31.47 $32.00 $32.00 
Good to Great:  Why Some Companies Make the 
Leap… and Others Don't 1 Each $24.00 $24.00 $25.54 $25.54 

Getting Started:  Recruiting Schools to Become 
Professional Learning Communities 1 Each $19.96 $19.96 $25.00 $25.00 

Genius Explained 1 Each $20.80 $20.80
Failure is Not an Option:  Six Principles for Making 
Student Success the Only Option 10 Each $29.21 $292.10 $33.26 $332.60 $39.96 $399.60 

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Every Teacher 1 Each * $20.76 $20.76 $26.00 $26.00 

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Increasing Student 
Achievement

1 Each $20.76 $20.76 $25.00 $25.00 

Classroom Assessment for Student Learning:  
Doing it Right- Using it Well 20 Each $52.80 $1,056.00 $59.39 $1,187.80 

Better Learning Through Structured Teaching:  A 
Framework for the Gradual Release of 
Responsibility

20 Each * $19.16 $383.20 $21.56 $431.20 $24.00 $480.00 

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum order 
requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

*Items awarded to two or more vendors due to identical pricing 
and product quality. Purchasing to make determination of 
vendor of choice at time of order.

Free Shipping

Reference Quote #Q32836

Yes

20-25% off list 25%
N/A

Free shipping except on 
rush orders

Yes

$100.00 or 25 books
0%0% 45%

None

Free shipping

Yes

None

5-9%

Yes Yes

None

Call for shipping
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

And Then There Were None 90 Each
Jurassic Park 80 Each
Night 120 Each
Of Mice and Men 180 Each
Pride and Prejudice 30 Each
SAT Word Power Book 10 Each
SAT Word Power Book II 10 Each
Speak 120 Each
Tarzan 45 Each
Tess of D'urbervilles 45 Each
The Adventures of Tom Sawyer 45 Each
The Bridges of Toko-Ri 45 Each
The Crystal Cave 90 Each
The Grapes of Wrath 90 Each
The Great Gatsby 120 Each
The House on Mango Street 120 Each
The Princess Bride 90 Each
Merriam-Webster's Collegiate Dictionary 180 Each
Roget's The New Thesaurus, 3rd Ed. 150 Each
Whirligig 90 Each
In Cold Blood 70 Each
Invisible Man 70 Each
MLA Handbook for Writers of Research Papers, 
7th Edition 90 Each

Merriam Webster Thesaurus 999 Each
The Merriam- Webster Dictionary 999 Each
Merriam Webster's Dictionary and Thesaurus 999 Each
You Haven't Taught until They Have Learned:  
John Wooden's Teaching Principles and Practice 1 Each

The Wisdom of Wooden:  My Century On and Off 
the Court 1 Each

The Talent Code:  Greatness Isn't Born, It's Grown, 
Here's How 3 Each

Well- Educated Mind:   A Guide to the Classical 
Education You Never Had 1 Each

The Teaching Gap:  Best Ideas from the World's 
Teachers for Improving Education in the Classroom 1 Each

Stand Your Ground:  Building Honorable Leaders 
the West Point Way 1 Each

School Leadership That Works:  From Research to 
Results 1 Each

Outliners:  The Story of Success 1 Each
Origins of Genius:  Darwinian Perspectives on 
Creativity 1 Each

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended Price

$5.59 $503.10
$6.39 $511.20
$7.96 $955.20
$7.20 $1,296.00
$3.96 $118.80

$8.00 $960.00
$3.96 $178.20
$3.96 $178.20
$4.40 $198.00
$5.59 $251.55
$7.99 $719.10
$12.80 $1,152.00
$11.20 $1,344.00
$8.80 $1,056.00
$5.59 $503.10
$17.56 $3,160.80
$16.80 $2,520.00
$6.39 $575.10
$12.00 $840.00
$3.96 $277.20

* $17.60 $1,584.00

$4.79 $4,785.21 $3.72 $3,716.28
$5.20 $5,194.80 $4.02 $4,015.98

* $7.19 $7,182.81

* $17.60 $17.60

* $20.00 $60.00

* $23.96 $23.96

* $12.00 $12.00

$16.05 $16.05

* $22.36 $22.36

$16.65 $16.65

* $47.96 $47.96

Kamico Instructional 
Media

Knowsys Educational 
Services Learning Links Inc.Jarrett Publishing 

Co. Matthews Office Supply
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

On Common Ground:  The Power of Professional 
Learning Communities 1 Each

Mindset:  The New Psychology of Success 20 Each
Learning by Doing:  A handbook for Professional 
Learning Communities at Work, Second Edition 1 Each

Handbook for Classroom Instruction that Works 1 Each
Good to Great:  Why Some Companies Make the 
Leap… and Others Don't 1 Each

Getting Started:  Recruiting Schools to Become 
Professional Learning Communities 1 Each

Genius Explained 1 Each
Failure is Not an Option:  Six Principles for Making 
Student Success the Only Option 10 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Every Teacher 1 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Increasing Student 
Achievement

1 Each

Classroom Assessment for Student Learning:  
Doing it Right- Using it Well 20 Each

Better Learning Through Structured Teaching:  A 
Framework for the Gradual Release of 
Responsibility

20 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum order 
requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

*Items awarded to two or more vendors due to identical pricing 
and product quality. Purchasing to make determination of 
vendor of choice at time of order.

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended Price

Kamico Instructional 
Media

Knowsys Educational 
Services Learning Links Inc.Jarrett Publishing 

Co. Matthews Office Supply

* $12.80 $256.00

$25.56 $25.56

* $23.99 $23.99

$20.79 $20.79

$29.56 $295.60

* $20.76 $20.76

* $19.96 $19.96

$52.79 $1,055.80

* $19.16 $383.20

Free shipping

Yes

None

10%

Include Knowsys order 
form

Yes

0% 0% 0% 20% 5-9%
10 books per order

10% or $3.50 under 
$35.00

Yes

N/A None

None

Yes

None

Over $1000.00 free 
shipping; 5% under 

$1000.00

Yes
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

And Then There Were None 90 Each
Jurassic Park 80 Each
Night 120 Each
Of Mice and Men 180 Each
Pride and Prejudice 30 Each
SAT Word Power Book 10 Each
SAT Word Power Book II 10 Each
Speak 120 Each
Tarzan 45 Each
Tess of D'urbervilles 45 Each
The Adventures of Tom Sawyer 45 Each
The Bridges of Toko-Ri 45 Each
The Crystal Cave 90 Each
The Grapes of Wrath 90 Each
The Great Gatsby 120 Each
The House on Mango Street 120 Each
The Princess Bride 90 Each
Merriam-Webster's Collegiate Dictionary 180 Each
Roget's The New Thesaurus, 3rd Ed. 150 Each
Whirligig 90 Each
In Cold Blood 70 Each
Invisible Man 70 Each
MLA Handbook for Writers of Research Papers, 
7th Edition 90 Each

Merriam Webster Thesaurus 999 Each
The Merriam- Webster Dictionary 999 Each
Merriam Webster's Dictionary and Thesaurus 999 Each
You Haven't Taught until They Have Learned:  
John Wooden's Teaching Principles and Practice 1 Each

The Wisdom of Wooden:  My Century On and Off 
the Court 1 Each

The Talent Code:  Greatness Isn't Born, It's Grown, 
Here's How 3 Each

Well- Educated Mind:   A Guide to the Classical 
Education You Never Had 1 Each

The Teaching Gap:  Best Ideas from the World's 
Teachers for Improving Education in the Classroom 1 Each

Stand Your Ground:  Building Honorable Leaders 
the West Point Way 1 Each

School Leadership That Works:  From Research to 
Results 1 Each

Outliners:  The Story of Success 1 Each
Origins of Genius:  Darwinian Perspectives on 
Creativity 1 Each

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

$5.59 $503.10 $6.99 $629.10
$6.39 $511.20
$7.96 $955.20 $9.95 $1,194.00
$7.20 $1,296.00 $9.00 $1,620.00
$3.96 $118.80 $4.99 $149.70

$11.65 $116.50

$10.00 $1,200.00 $10.00 $1,200.00
$3.96 $178.20
$3.96 $178.20 $4.95 $222.75
$3.99 $179.55 $4.99 $224.55
$5.59 $251.55

$11.99 $1,079.10
$13.60 $1,224.00 $16.00 $1,440.00
$12.00 $1,440.00 $15.00 $1,800.00
$8.80 $1,056.00 $11.00 $1,320.00
$5.59 $503.10 $8.95 $805.50

$17.56 $3,160.80 $21.95 $3,951.00
$21.00 $3,150.00

XX XX
$12.00 $840.00
$3.96 $277.20 $15.95 $1,116.50

$22.00 $1,980.00

$4.79 $4,785.21 $5.99 $5,983.01
$5.20 $5,194.80 $6.50 $6,493.50
* 7.19 $7,182.81 $8.99 $8,981.01

$19.95 $19.95

$18.70 $18.70

* $20.00 $60.00

$26.95 $26.95

$13.50 $13.50

$19.95 $19.95

* $22.36 $22.36

$15.29 $15.29

$59.95 $59.95

McGraw Hill 
Education

Millmark Education 
Corp.

National Educational 
SystemsMTS Publications Novel Units, Inc.
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

On Common Ground:  The Power of Professional 
Learning Communities 1 Each

Mindset:  The New Psychology of Success 20 Each
Learning by Doing:  A handbook for Professional 
Learning Communities at Work, Second Edition 1 Each

Handbook for Classroom Instruction that Works 1 Each
Good to Great:  Why Some Companies Make the 
Leap… and Others Don't 1 Each

Getting Started:  Recruiting Schools to Become 
Professional Learning Communities 1 Each

Genius Explained 1 Each
Failure is Not an Option:  Six Principles for Making 
Student Success the Only Option 10 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Every Teacher 1 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Increasing Student 
Achievement

1 Each

Classroom Assessment for Student Learning:  
Doing it Right- Using it Well 20 Each

Better Learning Through Structured Teaching:  A 
Framework for the Gradual Release of 
Responsibility

20 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum order 
requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

*Items awarded to two or more vendors due to identical pricing 
and product quality. Purchasing to make determination of 
vendor of choice at time of order.

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price Unit Price Extended 
Price

McGraw Hill 
Education

Millmark Education 
Corp.

National Educational 
SystemsMTS Publications Novel Units, Inc.

$27.96 $27.96

* $12.80 $256.00

* $27.96 $27.96

$31.95 $31.95

* $23.99 $23.99

$19.96 $19.96

$25.99 $25.99

$33.25 $332.50

* $20.76 $20.76

* $19.96 $19.96

$65.99 $1,319.80

* $19.16 $383.20

0% 0% 5% on orders over 10%
None

10%

Yes

$5.00 

Call for shipping

Yes

N/A

Call for shipping

Yes

None

10% under $250.00; 
over free shipping

Yes

0%
None

Call for shipping

Yes
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

And Then There Were None 90 Each
Jurassic Park 80 Each
Night 120 Each
Of Mice and Men 180 Each
Pride and Prejudice 30 Each
SAT Word Power Book 10 Each
SAT Word Power Book II 10 Each
Speak 120 Each
Tarzan 45 Each
Tess of D'urbervilles 45 Each
The Adventures of Tom Sawyer 45 Each
The Bridges of Toko-Ri 45 Each
The Crystal Cave 90 Each
The Grapes of Wrath 90 Each
The Great Gatsby 120 Each
The House on Mango Street 120 Each
The Princess Bride 90 Each
Merriam-Webster's Collegiate Dictionary 180 Each
Roget's The New Thesaurus, 3rd Ed. 150 Each
Whirligig 90 Each
In Cold Blood 70 Each
Invisible Man 70 Each
MLA Handbook for Writers of Research Papers, 
7th Edition 90 Each

Merriam Webster Thesaurus 999 Each
The Merriam- Webster Dictionary 999 Each
Merriam Webster's Dictionary and Thesaurus 999 Each
You Haven't Taught until They Have Learned:  
John Wooden's Teaching Principles and Practice 1 Each

The Wisdom of Wooden:  My Century On and Off 
the Court 1 Each

The Talent Code:  Greatness Isn't Born, It's Grown, 
Here's How 3 Each

Well- Educated Mind:   A Guide to the Classical 
Education You Never Had 1 Each

The Teaching Gap:  Best Ideas from the World's 
Teachers for Improving Education in the Classroom 1 Each

Stand Your Ground:  Building Honorable Leaders 
the West Point Way 1 Each

School Leadership That Works:  From Research to 
Results 1 Each

Outliners:  The Story of Success 1 Each
Origins of Genius:  Darwinian Perspectives on 
Creativity 1 Each

Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

$11.20 $1,008.00 $4.54 $408.60
$12.22 $977.60 * $5.19 $415.20
$13.71 $1,645.20 * $6.47 $776.40
$12.86 $2,314.80 $5.85 $1,053.00
$9.89 $296.70 $3.21 $96.30

$15.14 $1,816.80 $6.50 $780.00
$10.52 $473.40 $3.21 $144.45
$10.52 $473.40 $3.21 $144.45
$8.25 $371.25 $3.24 $145.80
$11.46 $515.70 * $4.54 $204.30
$17.54 $1,578.60 $9.74 $876.60
$18.21 $1,638.90 $11.05 $994.50
$16.67 $2,000.40 $9.75 $1,170.00
$14.52 $1,742.40 * $7.15 $858.00
$12.12 $1,090.80 $4.54 $408.60
$21.68 $3,902.40 $19.95 $3,591.00
$11.46 $1,719.00 $19.95 $2,992.50
$12.22 $1,099.80 $5.19 $467.10
$17.58 $1,230.60 $9.75 $682.50
$10.52 $736.40 $3.21 $224.70

$23.18 $2,086.20 $24.99 $2,249.10

$10.68 $10,669.32 $5.99 $5,984.01
$11.07 $11,058.93 $6.50 $6,493.50
$12.98 $12,967.02 $8.99 $8,981.01

$16.96 $16.96

$18.70 $18.70

$21.25 $63.75

$25.46 $25.46

$12.75 $12.75

$16.96 $16.96

$23.76 $23.76

$14.44 $14.44

$50.96 $50.96

Prestwick House, Inc. Renaissance 
Learning, Inc.Peoples Education Precision Business 

Machines, Inc.Perma-Bound Books
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

On Common Ground:  The Power of Professional 
Learning Communities 1 Each

Mindset:  The New Psychology of Success 20 Each
Learning by Doing:  A handbook for Professional 
Learning Communities at Work, Second Edition 1 Each

Handbook for Classroom Instruction that Works 1 Each
Good to Great:  Why Some Companies Make the 
Leap… and Others Don't 1 Each

Getting Started:  Recruiting Schools to Become 
Professional Learning Communities 1 Each

Genius Explained 1 Each
Failure is Not an Option:  Six Principles for Making 
Student Success the Only Option 10 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Every Teacher 1 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Increasing Student 
Achievement

1 Each

Classroom Assessment for Student Learning:  
Doing it Right- Using it Well 20 Each

Better Learning Through Structured Teaching:  A 
Framework for the Gradual Release of 
Responsibility

20 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum order 
requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

*Items awarded to two or more vendors due to identical pricing 
and product quality. Purchasing to make determination of 
vendor of choice at time of order.

Unit Price Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price Extended 

Price
Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Prestwick House, Inc. Renaissance 
Learning, Inc.Peoples Education Precision Business 

Machines, Inc.Perma-Bound Books

$25.45 $25.45

$13.60 $272.00

$38.62 $38.62

$33.43 $33.43

$25.49 $25.49

$16.96 $16.96

$22.09 $22.09

$28.86 $288.60

$22.06 $22.06

$21.21 $21.21

$56.09 $1,121.80

$20.36 $407.20

Yes

0% 0%
None

Free shipping if ordered 
online (need valid free 

shipping code);  $50.00 
or less- $6.00, $50.01 to 

$799.99- 12%, $800.00 or 
greater- 10% 

Yes

Call for minimum

Call for shipping 
charges

0%
Varies by product

Free shipping

Yes

0% 0%
N/A

Free shipping

Yes

$10.00 

7%

Yes
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

And Then There Were None 90 Each
Jurassic Park 80 Each
Night 120 Each
Of Mice and Men 180 Each
Pride and Prejudice 30 Each
SAT Word Power Book 10 Each
SAT Word Power Book II 10 Each
Speak 120 Each
Tarzan 45 Each
Tess of D'urbervilles 45 Each
The Adventures of Tom Sawyer 45 Each
The Bridges of Toko-Ri 45 Each
The Crystal Cave 90 Each
The Grapes of Wrath 90 Each
The Great Gatsby 120 Each
The House on Mango Street 120 Each
The Princess Bride 90 Each
Merriam-Webster's Collegiate Dictionary 180 Each
Roget's The New Thesaurus, 3rd Ed. 150 Each
Whirligig 90 Each
In Cold Blood 70 Each
Invisible Man 70 Each
MLA Handbook for Writers of Research Papers, 
7th Edition 90 Each

Merriam Webster Thesaurus 999 Each
The Merriam- Webster Dictionary 999 Each
Merriam Webster's Dictionary and Thesaurus 999 Each
You Haven't Taught until They Have Learned:  
John Wooden's Teaching Principles and Practice 1 Each

The Wisdom of Wooden:  My Century On and Off 
the Court 1 Each

The Talent Code:  Greatness Isn't Born, It's Grown, 
Here's How 3 Each

Well- Educated Mind:   A Guide to the Classical 
Education You Never Had 1 Each

The Teaching Gap:  Best Ideas from the World's 
Teachers for Improving Education in the Classroom 1 Each

Stand Your Ground:  Building Honorable Leaders 
the West Point Way 1 Each

School Leadership That Works:  From Research to 
Results 1 Each

Outliners:  The Story of Success 1 Each
Origins of Genius:  Darwinian Perspectives on 
Creativity 1 Each

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

$6.29 $566.10
$7.19 $575.20
$8.46 $1,015.20 $7.96 $955.20
$7.65 $1,377.00 $7.20 $1,296.00
$4.46 $133.80 $3.00 $90.00

$12.95 $129.50
$12.95 $129.50

$8.50 $1,020.00 $8.00 $960.00

$4.46 $200.70 $3.50 $157.50
$4.49 $202.05 $3.50 $157.50

$12.80 $1,152.00
$11.20 $1,344.00

$9.31 $1,117.20 $8.80 $1,056.00
$7.20 $648.00
$23.50 $4,230.00 $17.56 $3,160.80

$5.85 $526.50

$5.99 $5,984.01
$8.50 $8,491.50 $5.20 $5,194.80

XX XX

Teacher's Discovery
Saddleback 
Educational 

P bli hi I

Slosson Educational 
Publications, Inc.
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Bid #12‐069
Language Arts Supplies for New High School

VENDORS

Qty Unit

On Common Ground:  The Power of Professional 
Learning Communities 1 Each

Mindset:  The New Psychology of Success 20 Each
Learning by Doing:  A handbook for Professional 
Learning Communities at Work, Second Edition 1 Each

Handbook for Classroom Instruction that Works 1 Each
Good to Great:  Why Some Companies Make the 
Leap… and Others Don't 1 Each

Getting Started:  Recruiting Schools to Become 
Professional Learning Communities 1 Each

Genius Explained 1 Each
Failure is Not an Option:  Six Principles for Making 
Student Success the Only Option 10 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Every Teacher 1 Each

Classroom Management That Works:  Research-
Based Strategies for Increasing Student 
Achievement

1 Each

Classroom Assessment for Student Learning:  
Doing it Right- Using it Well 20 Each

Better Learning Through Structured Teaching:  A 
Framework for the Gradual Release of 
Responsibility

20 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum order 
requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

*Items awarded to two or more vendors due to identical pricing 
and product quality. Purchasing to make determination of 
vendor of choice at time of order.

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Teacher's Discovery
Saddleback 
Educational 

P bli hi I

Slosson Educational 
Publications, Inc.

None
Up to $30.00- $6.90, 

$30.01-$50.00- $8.20, 
$50.01-$75.00- $9.50, 

$75.01-$100.00- 
$11.40, $100.01 & 

over- 12%
Item XX'd was not 
awareded due to 
shipping charges

Yes

None

12% or $8.00, 
whichever is greater

Yes

N/A

Call for shipping

Yes

20% 10% 0%
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