
Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price
Algebra to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each Steck 

Vaughn 669471518 $22.65 $339.75

Algebra to Go Teacher Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each Steck 

Vaughn 669480764 $28.42 $426.30

Geometry to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each Steck 

Vaughn 669481297 $22.65 $339.75

Geometry to Go Teacher’s Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each Steck 

Vaughn 669488070 $28.42 $426.30

6” Protractor EAI, Rules Tech 30 Each $2.33 $69.90 EAI  530010 $0.19 $5.70

One-Sided Unlined Boards Classroom Unit 
includes 30 Boards, 30 Erasers, 90 markers 
and storage box World Research Company, 
#UB-U30

20 Each CPW CN5501245 $61.99 $1,239.80 EAI  5318BID $73.00 $1,460.00

Folding Geometric Shapes, set/16
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN40818 15 Set CPW/ETA CN5501098 XX XX $43.46 $651.90 EAI 

Geomodel 531832 XX XX

Patty Paper
ETA/ Cuisenaire, # IN4710 15 Each CPW/ETA IN4710 $28.00 $420.00 $40.42 $606.30 EAI 532220 XX XX

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Teacher's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,         
#IN4711 

15 Each CPW/ETA IN4711 $16.75 $251.25 $25.24 $378.60 EAI 500490 $17.95 $269.25

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Student's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,          
#IN4712

15 Each CPW/ETA IN4712 $3.50 $52.50 $5.01 $75.15 EAI 500492 $4.58 $68.70

Parachute Guys
Oriental Trading Co., # 39/1168 4 Each $12.20 $48.80

Graph Paper, Ruled easel pad
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN75989 15 Each CPW/ETA CN5529259 $10.99 $164.85 $17.15 $257.25

Dry Erase Compass Safe-T
Classroom Products Warehouse, #BC-
5575662

4 Each CPW 5575662 $2.32 $9.28 EAI 531466 $2.99 $11.96

Dry Erase Protractor Safe-T
Science Kit, # 17042-04 4 Each CPW CN5575680 $2.56 $10.24 EAI 531467 $2.27 $9.08

Mira Class Set - Geometric tool has the 
reflective quality of a mirror, as well as a 
transparent quality. 30/set
EAI, Mira Math, #531265 

4 Set sold as each XX XX EAI 532981 
set/30 $55.20 $220.80

Algebra Tiles Kit- 30 Algebra Tile™ Student 
Sets 70-piece overhead set of algebra tiles, 
an instructional booklet, and a plastic storage 
tub. Grades 8-12. ETA/ Cuisenaire, 
#bd40244

7 Set $104.17 $729.19 EAI 533160 $64.00 $448.00

Dry Erase Board Graphing Set
ETA/ Cuisenaire, #bd75564 14 Set CPW CN5575599 $14.76 $206.64 $45.48 $636.72 EAI 531483 $13.95 $195.30

Complete Book and MediaClassroom Products Warehouse EAI Education
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Complete Book and MediaClassroom Products Warehouse EAI Education

Conic Sections- This set contains four cones 
cut four different ways to reveal the different 
conic sections - circle, ellipse, parabola, and 
hyperbola.
Cones measure 2-3/4" W x 4" H.. Grades 7-
12. Nasco, #TB22999T 

4 Set CPW CN5507111 $16.99 $67.96 $26.79 $107.16 EAI 532477 $15.43 $61.72

What’s My Rule, EAI, Pearson 1 Each $19.77 $19.77
Number Sense & Nonsense
EAI , Ind. Publ. Group 1 Each $16.14 $16.14

Functional Melodies Key Curriculum Press/15 
Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-55953-378-2 4 Each $17.60 $70.40

A Graphing Matter Key Curriculum/11
Nasco, # TB17353T 4 Each $11.68 $46.72 500480 $11.75 $47.00

Graphic Algebra Key Curriculum/11
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500496 4 Each $13.14 $52.56 500496 $13.50 $54.00

More Than Graphs Key Curriculum/12
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500479 4 Each $21.20 $84.80

A Visual Approach to Functions Key 
Curriculum/15 Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-
55953-537-3 

4 Each $17.54 $70.16 500253 $21.90 $87.60

The Pattern & Function Connection Key
Curriculum/15, EAI, Key Curriculum Press, 
#500707 

4 Each $18.27 $73.08 500707 $16.25 $65.00

Patty Paper Geometry Set Key Curriculum 
Press/31, Key Curriculum Press, # 978-1-
55953- 282-2 

4 Each $28.52 $114.08

Key to Geometry A&N Books 4-6 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-84-9 

4 Each $4.36 $17.44

Key to Geometry A&N Books 7 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-85-6 

4 Each $4.36 $17.44

Key to Geometry A&N Book 8 Key 
Curriculum/62 Key Curriculum Press, #978-0-
973684-86-3 

4 Each $4.36 $17.44

Algebra with Pizzazz
Wright Group, FO-88488-791-X 4 Each $87.87 $351.48

Getting Into Solids Kit Safe-T
Nasco, #TB21313T 5 Each CPW CN5501261 $23.99 $95.96 $51.19 $255.95 EAI 531266 $26.00 $130.00

Exploring Geometry with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-581-6 

4 Each

Exploring Algebra 1 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press #978-1-55953-800-8

4 Each
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Complete Book and MediaClassroom Products Warehouse EAI Education

Exploring Algebra 2 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-800-8 

4 Each

Exploring Precalculus with The Geometer's 
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-680-6 

4 Each

Exploring Calculus with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-535-0

4 Each

Compass, Bullseye, Safe-T
Science Kit, #17037-05 30 Each CPW Safe-T CN5515702 $0.59 $17.70 EAI Slide N 

Measure 533923 XX XX

Dissected Cone
Science Kit, #17175-04 4 Each CPW 

Hardwood CN5507100 $57.79 $231.16

Calculus Problems for a New Century- Vol. 2  
Barnes & Noble, #883850842 4 Each $43.33 $173.32

Problems for Student Investigation- Vol. 4
Barnes & Noble, #883850869 4 Each $43.33 $173.32

Learning by Discovery: A Lab Manual for 
Calculus Barnes & Noble, #883850834 4 Each $43.33 $173.32

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order Req

Shipping

Interlocal

Elaine Johnson - Buyer

0%
None

call for quote on orders under $100.00; free for 
orders over $100.00

Yes

15%; some products excluded
None

Free

Yes

15%
None

$7.00 on orders under $100.00; Free on orders 
over $100.00

Yes, but only to school districts

XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum 
order requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell - Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

Blank cell = No bid
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Algebra to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Algebra to Go Teacher Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go Teacher’s Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

6” Protractor EAI, Rules Tech 30 Each

One-Sided Unlined Boards Classroom Unit 
includes 30 Boards, 30 Erasers, 90 markers 
and storage box World Research Company, 
#UB-U30

20 Each

Folding Geometric Shapes, set/16
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN40818 15 Set

Patty Paper
ETA/ Cuisenaire, # IN4710 15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Teacher's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,         
#IN4711 

15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Student's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,          
#IN4712

15 Each

Parachute Guys
Oriental Trading Co., # 39/1168 4 Each

Graph Paper, Ruled easel pad
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN75989 15 Each

Dry Erase Compass Safe-T
Classroom Products Warehouse, #BC-
5575662

4 Each

Dry Erase Protractor Safe-T
Science Kit, # 17042-04 4 Each

Mira Class Set - Geometric tool has the 
reflective quality of a mirror, as well as a 
transparent quality. 30/set
EAI, Mira Math, #531265 

4 Set

Algebra Tiles Kit- 30 Algebra Tile™ Student 
Sets 70-piece overhead set of algebra tiles, 
an instructional booklet, and a plastic storage 
tub. Grades 8-12. ETA/ Cuisenaire, 
#bd40244

7 Set

Dry Erase Board Graphing Set
ETA/ Cuisenaire, #bd75564 14 Set

Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

ETA BD40546 $25.50 $382.50

ETA BD40547 $25.50 $382.50

ETA BD40818 $20.00 $300.00

ETA BD4710 $27.00 $405.00

ETA BD4711 $17.00 $255.00

ETA BD4712 $3.70 $55.50

ETA BD75989 $10.70 $160.50

ETA BD75628 $3.50 $14.00

ETA BD75629 $3.27 $13.08

ETA BD9390A $85.05 $340.20

ETA BD40244 $40.00 $280.00

ETA BD75564 $18.25 $255.50

Educator's Outlet Frog Publications, Inc.ETA/ Cuisenaire
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Conic Sections- This set contains four cones 
cut four different ways to reveal the different 
conic sections - circle, ellipse, parabola, and 
hyperbola.
Cones measure 2-3/4" W x 4" H.. Grades 7-
12. Nasco, #TB22999T 

4 Set

What’s My Rule, EAI, Pearson 1 Each
Number Sense & Nonsense
EAI , Ind. Publ. Group 1 Each

Functional Melodies Key Curriculum Press/15 
Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-55953-378-2 4 Each

A Graphing Matter Key Curriculum/11
Nasco, # TB17353T 4 Each

Graphic Algebra Key Curriculum/11
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500496 4 Each

More Than Graphs Key Curriculum/12
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500479 4 Each

A Visual Approach to Functions Key 
Curriculum/15 Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-
55953-537-3 

4 Each

The Pattern & Function Connection Key
Curriculum/15, EAI, Key Curriculum Press, 
#500707 

4 Each

Patty Paper Geometry Set Key Curriculum 
Press/31, Key Curriculum Press, # 978-1-
55953- 282-2 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 4-6 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-84-9 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 7 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-85-6 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Book 8 Key 
Curriculum/62 Key Curriculum Press, #978-0-
973684-86-3 

4 Each

Algebra with Pizzazz
Wright Group, FO-88488-791-X 4 Each

Getting Into Solids Kit Safe-T
Nasco, #TB21313T 5 Each

Exploring Geometry with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-581-6 

4 Each

Exploring Algebra 1 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press #978-1-55953-800-8

4 Each

Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Educator's Outlet Frog Publications, Inc.ETA/ Cuisenaire

ETA BD036206 $13.50 $54.00

ETA BD4710 $27.00 $108.00

ETA BD75541 $20.00 $100.00
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit

Exploring Algebra 2 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-800-8 

4 Each

Exploring Precalculus with The Geometer's 
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-680-6 

4 Each

Exploring Calculus with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-535-0

4 Each

Compass, Bullseye, Safe-T
Science Kit, #17037-05 30 Each

Dissected Cone
Science Kit, #17175-04 4 Each

Calculus Problems for a New Century- Vol. 2  
Barnes & Noble, #883850842 4 Each

Problems for Student Investigation- Vol. 4
Barnes & Noble, #883850869 4 Each

Learning by Discovery: A Lab Manual for 
Calculus Barnes & Noble, #883850834 4 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order Req

Shipping

Interlocal

Elaine Johnson - Buyer

XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum 
order requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell - Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

Blank cell = No bid

Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Educator's Outlet Frog Publications, Inc.ETA/ Cuisenaire

ETA BD42142 $57.87 $231.48

15%; some items excluded
None

Free

Yes

0%
None

$7.00 for orders under $70.00; 10% on orders 
over $70.00

Yes

20%
None

free

Yes
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Algebra to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Algebra to Go Teacher Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go Teacher’s Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

6” Protractor EAI, Rules Tech 30 Each

One-Sided Unlined Boards Classroom Unit 
includes 30 Boards, 30 Erasers, 90 markers 
and storage box World Research Company, 
#UB-U30

20 Each

Folding Geometric Shapes, set/16
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN40818 15 Set

Patty Paper
ETA/ Cuisenaire, # IN4710 15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Teacher's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,         
#IN4711 

15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Student's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,          
#IN4712

15 Each

Parachute Guys
Oriental Trading Co., # 39/1168 4 Each

Graph Paper, Ruled easel pad
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN75989 15 Each

Dry Erase Compass Safe-T
Classroom Products Warehouse, #BC-
5575662

4 Each

Dry Erase Protractor Safe-T
Science Kit, # 17042-04 4 Each

Mira Class Set - Geometric tool has the 
reflective quality of a mirror, as well as a 
transparent quality. 30/set
EAI, Mira Math, #531265 

4 Set

Algebra Tiles Kit- 30 Algebra Tile™ Student 
Sets 70-piece overhead set of algebra tiles, 
an instructional booklet, and a plastic storage 
tub. Grades 8-12. ETA/ Cuisenaire, 
#bd40244

7 Set

Dry Erase Board Graphing Set
ETA/ Cuisenaire, #bd75564 14 Set

Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Great Source w4-047151 $21.14 $317.10

Great Source w4-048076 $25.79 $386.85

Great Source w4-048129 $20.75 $311.25

Great Source w4-048807 $25.79 $386.85

Kamico Instructional Media, Inc.HMH Publishing Company Learning Services
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Conic Sections- This set contains four cones 
cut four different ways to reveal the different 
conic sections - circle, ellipse, parabola, and 
hyperbola.
Cones measure 2-3/4" W x 4" H.. Grades 7-
12. Nasco, #TB22999T 

4 Set

What’s My Rule, EAI, Pearson 1 Each
Number Sense & Nonsense
EAI , Ind. Publ. Group 1 Each

Functional Melodies Key Curriculum Press/15 
Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-55953-378-2 4 Each

A Graphing Matter Key Curriculum/11
Nasco, # TB17353T 4 Each

Graphic Algebra Key Curriculum/11
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500496 4 Each

More Than Graphs Key Curriculum/12
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500479 4 Each

A Visual Approach to Functions Key 
Curriculum/15 Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-
55953-537-3 

4 Each

The Pattern & Function Connection Key
Curriculum/15, EAI, Key Curriculum Press, 
#500707 

4 Each

Patty Paper Geometry Set Key Curriculum 
Press/31, Key Curriculum Press, # 978-1-
55953- 282-2 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 4-6 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-84-9 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 7 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-85-6 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Book 8 Key 
Curriculum/62 Key Curriculum Press, #978-0-
973684-86-3 

4 Each

Algebra with Pizzazz
Wright Group, FO-88488-791-X 4 Each

Getting Into Solids Kit Safe-T
Nasco, #TB21313T 5 Each

Exploring Geometry with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-581-6 

4 Each

Exploring Algebra 1 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press #978-1-55953-800-8

4 Each

Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Kamico Instructional Media, Inc.HMH Publishing Company Learning Services

Key Curriculum 
Press 68484 $5.90 $23.60

Key Curriculum 
Press 65485 $5.90 $23.60

Key Curriculum 
Press 68486 $5.90 $23.60

Key Curriculum 
Press 40222 $29.64 $118.56

Key Curriculum 
Press 40221 $29.64 $118.56
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit

Exploring Algebra 2 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-800-8 

4 Each

Exploring Precalculus with The Geometer's 
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-680-6 

4 Each

Exploring Calculus with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-535-0

4 Each

Compass, Bullseye, Safe-T
Science Kit, #17037-05 30 Each

Dissected Cone
Science Kit, #17175-04 4 Each

Calculus Problems for a New Century- Vol. 2  
Barnes & Noble, #883850842 4 Each

Problems for Student Investigation- Vol. 4
Barnes & Noble, #883850869 4 Each

Learning by Discovery: A Lab Manual for 
Calculus Barnes & Noble, #883850834 4 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order Req

Shipping

Interlocal

Elaine Johnson - Buyer

XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum 
order requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell - Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

Blank cell = No bid

Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Kamico Instructional Media, Inc.HMH Publishing Company Learning Services

Key Curriculum 
Press 40223 $29.64 $118.56

Key Curriculum 
Press 40224 $29.64 $118.56

Key Curriculum 
Press 40225 $29.64 $118.56

0%
None

Free

Yes

0%
None

10.5%

Yes

3% to 10%
None

Call for quote

Yes, with some limitations
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Algebra to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Algebra to Go Teacher Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go Teacher’s Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

6” Protractor EAI, Rules Tech 30 Each

One-Sided Unlined Boards Classroom Unit 
includes 30 Boards, 30 Erasers, 90 markers 
and storage box World Research Company, 
#UB-U30

20 Each

Folding Geometric Shapes, set/16
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN40818 15 Set

Patty Paper
ETA/ Cuisenaire, # IN4710 15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Teacher's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,         
#IN4711 

15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Student's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,          
#IN4712

15 Each

Parachute Guys
Oriental Trading Co., # 39/1168 4 Each

Graph Paper, Ruled easel pad
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN75989 15 Each

Dry Erase Compass Safe-T
Classroom Products Warehouse, #BC-
5575662

4 Each

Dry Erase Protractor Safe-T
Science Kit, # 17042-04 4 Each

Mira Class Set - Geometric tool has the 
reflective quality of a mirror, as well as a 
transparent quality. 30/set
EAI, Mira Math, #531265 

4 Set

Algebra Tiles Kit- 30 Algebra Tile™ Student 
Sets 70-piece overhead set of algebra tiles, 
an instructional booklet, and a plastic storage 
tub. Grades 8-12. ETA/ Cuisenaire, 
#bd40244

7 Set

Dry Erase Board Graphing Set
ETA/ Cuisenaire, #bd75564 14 Set

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price

TB02088t $0.17 $5.10

Nasco TB20267t $95.51 $1,910.20

TB23863T XX XX

TB18152T $22.99 $344.85

TB16989T $17.28 $259.20

TB16988T $4.46 $66.90

TB21409T $21.37 $320.55

TB22109T $3.35 $13.40

TB22110T $3.93 $15.72

TB14953T -
sold as 
each

XX XX

Nasco TB17249T $54.81 $383.67

McGraw-Hill Education People's EducationNasco Pitsco Education
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Conic Sections- This set contains four cones 
cut four different ways to reveal the different 
conic sections - circle, ellipse, parabola, and 
hyperbola.
Cones measure 2-3/4" W x 4" H.. Grades 7-
12. Nasco, #TB22999T 

4 Set

What’s My Rule, EAI, Pearson 1 Each
Number Sense & Nonsense
EAI , Ind. Publ. Group 1 Each

Functional Melodies Key Curriculum Press/15 
Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-55953-378-2 4 Each

A Graphing Matter Key Curriculum/11
Nasco, # TB17353T 4 Each

Graphic Algebra Key Curriculum/11
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500496 4 Each

More Than Graphs Key Curriculum/12
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500479 4 Each

A Visual Approach to Functions Key 
Curriculum/15 Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-
55953-537-3 

4 Each

The Pattern & Function Connection Key
Curriculum/15, EAI, Key Curriculum Press, 
#500707 

4 Each

Patty Paper Geometry Set Key Curriculum 
Press/31, Key Curriculum Press, # 978-1-
55953- 282-2 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 4-6 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-84-9 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 7 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-85-6 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Book 8 Key 
Curriculum/62 Key Curriculum Press, #978-0-
973684-86-3 

4 Each

Algebra with Pizzazz
Wright Group, FO-88488-791-X 4 Each

Getting Into Solids Kit Safe-T
Nasco, #TB21313T 5 Each

Exploring Geometry with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-581-6 

4 Each

Exploring Algebra 1 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press #978-1-55953-800-8

4 Each

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price

McGraw-Hill Education People's EducationNasco Pitsco Education

TB22999t $16.03 $64.12

TB17353T $10.22 $40.88

TB21313T $25.96 $129.80

TB20485T $41.62 $166.48
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit

Exploring Algebra 2 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-800-8 

4 Each

Exploring Precalculus with The Geometer's 
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-680-6 

4 Each

Exploring Calculus with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-535-0

4 Each

Compass, Bullseye, Safe-T
Science Kit, #17037-05 30 Each

Dissected Cone
Science Kit, #17175-04 4 Each

Calculus Problems for a New Century- Vol. 2  
Barnes & Noble, #883850842 4 Each

Problems for Student Investigation- Vol. 4
Barnes & Noble, #883850869 4 Each

Learning by Discovery: A Lab Manual for 
Calculus Barnes & Noble, #883850834 4 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order Req

Shipping

Interlocal

Elaine Johnson - Buyer

XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum 
order requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell - Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

Blank cell = No bid

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price

McGraw-Hill Education People's EducationNasco Pitsco Education

TB23363T $41.62 $166.48

TB22535T $41.62 $166.48

TB21980T $41.62 $166.48

TB18487T $0.79 $23.70

TB02161T $64.26 $257.04

0%

10%

Yes

0%
See Catalog

Free

Yes

15%
$50.00

Free

Yes

0%
None

See Catalog

Yes
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Algebra to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Algebra to Go Teacher Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go Teacher’s Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

6” Protractor EAI, Rules Tech 30 Each

One-Sided Unlined Boards Classroom Unit 
includes 30 Boards, 30 Erasers, 90 markers 
and storage box World Research Company, 
#UB-U30

20 Each

Folding Geometric Shapes, set/16
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN40818 15 Set

Patty Paper
ETA/ Cuisenaire, # IN4710 15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Teacher's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,         
#IN4711 

15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Student's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,          
#IN4712

15 Each

Parachute Guys
Oriental Trading Co., # 39/1168 4 Each

Graph Paper, Ruled easel pad
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN75989 15 Each

Dry Erase Compass Safe-T
Classroom Products Warehouse, #BC-
5575662

4 Each

Dry Erase Protractor Safe-T
Science Kit, # 17042-04 4 Each

Mira Class Set - Geometric tool has the 
reflective quality of a mirror, as well as a 
transparent quality. 30/set
EAI, Mira Math, #531265 

4 Set

Algebra Tiles Kit- 30 Algebra Tile™ Student 
Sets 70-piece overhead set of algebra tiles, 
an instructional booklet, and a plastic storage 
tub. Grades 8-12. ETA/ Cuisenaire, 
#bd40244

7 Set

Dry Erase Board Graphing Set
ETA/ Cuisenaire, #bd75564 14 Set

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

School 
Smart 84410 XX XX

76830 $25.35 $380.25

School 
Smart 85284 $12.47 $187.05

Precision Business Machines, 
Inc.

Saddleback Education 
Publishing, Inc. School SpecialtyRenaissance Learning, Inc.
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Conic Sections- This set contains four cones 
cut four different ways to reveal the different 
conic sections - circle, ellipse, parabola, and 
hyperbola.
Cones measure 2-3/4" W x 4" H.. Grades 7-
12. Nasco, #TB22999T 

4 Set

What’s My Rule, EAI, Pearson 1 Each
Number Sense & Nonsense
EAI , Ind. Publ. Group 1 Each

Functional Melodies Key Curriculum Press/15 
Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-55953-378-2 4 Each

A Graphing Matter Key Curriculum/11
Nasco, # TB17353T 4 Each

Graphic Algebra Key Curriculum/11
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500496 4 Each

More Than Graphs Key Curriculum/12
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500479 4 Each

A Visual Approach to Functions Key 
Curriculum/15 Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-
55953-537-3 

4 Each

The Pattern & Function Connection Key
Curriculum/15, EAI, Key Curriculum Press, 
#500707 

4 Each

Patty Paper Geometry Set Key Curriculum 
Press/31, Key Curriculum Press, # 978-1-
55953- 282-2 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 4-6 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-84-9 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 7 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-85-6 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Book 8 Key 
Curriculum/62 Key Curriculum Press, #978-0-
973684-86-3 

4 Each

Algebra with Pizzazz
Wright Group, FO-88488-791-X 4 Each

Getting Into Solids Kit Safe-T
Nasco, #TB21313T 5 Each

Exploring Geometry with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-581-6 

4 Each

Exploring Algebra 1 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press #978-1-55953-800-8

4 Each

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Precision Business Machines, 
Inc.

Saddleback Education 
Publishing, Inc. School SpecialtyRenaissance Learning, Inc.
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit

Exploring Algebra 2 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-800-8 

4 Each

Exploring Precalculus with The Geometer's 
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-680-6 

4 Each

Exploring Calculus with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-535-0

4 Each

Compass, Bullseye, Safe-T
Science Kit, #17037-05 30 Each

Dissected Cone
Science Kit, #17175-04 4 Each

Calculus Problems for a New Century- Vol. 2  
Barnes & Noble, #883850842 4 Each

Problems for Student Investigation- Vol. 4
Barnes & Noble, #883850869 4 Each

Learning by Discovery: A Lab Manual for 
Calculus Barnes & Noble, #883850834 4 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order Req

Shipping

Interlocal

Elaine Johnson - Buyer

XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum 
order requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell - Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

Blank cell = No bid

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Precision Business Machines, 
Inc.

Saddleback Education 
Publishing, Inc. School SpecialtyRenaissance Learning, Inc.

0%
None

7% of order; min $10.00

Yes

20%
None

12% or $8.00 minimum

Yes

15% to 25%
None

Call for quote

Yes

0%
Contact Company

Contact Company

Yes
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Algebra to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Algebra to Go Teacher Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go
Great Source Education 15 Each

Geometry to Go Teacher’s Resource
Great Source Education 15 Each

6” Protractor EAI, Rules Tech 30 Each

One-Sided Unlined Boards Classroom Unit 
includes 30 Boards, 30 Erasers, 90 markers 
and storage box World Research Company, 
#UB-U30

20 Each

Folding Geometric Shapes, set/16
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN40818 15 Set

Patty Paper
ETA/ Cuisenaire, # IN4710 15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Teacher's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,         
#IN4711 

15 Each

Patty Paper Geometry- Michael Serra, 
Student's edition, ETA/ Cuisenaire,          
#IN4712

15 Each

Parachute Guys
Oriental Trading Co., # 39/1168 4 Each

Graph Paper, Ruled easel pad
ETA/Cuisenaire, # IN75989 15 Each

Dry Erase Compass Safe-T
Classroom Products Warehouse, #BC-
5575662

4 Each

Dry Erase Protractor Safe-T
Science Kit, # 17042-04 4 Each

Mira Class Set - Geometric tool has the 
reflective quality of a mirror, as well as a 
transparent quality. 30/set
EAI, Mira Math, #531265 

4 Set

Algebra Tiles Kit- 30 Algebra Tile™ Student 
Sets 70-piece overhead set of algebra tiles, 
an instructional booklet, and a plastic storage 
tub. Grades 8-12. ETA/ Cuisenaire, 
#bd40244

7 Set

Dry Erase Board Graphing Set
ETA/ Cuisenaire, #bd75564 14 Set

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

World 
Research 

Co.
UB-U30 $164.45 $3,289.00

Sleek Software Corporation World Research Company
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit
Conic Sections- This set contains four cones 
cut four different ways to reveal the different 
conic sections - circle, ellipse, parabola, and 
hyperbola.
Cones measure 2-3/4" W x 4" H.. Grades 7-
12. Nasco, #TB22999T 

4 Set

What’s My Rule, EAI, Pearson 1 Each
Number Sense & Nonsense
EAI , Ind. Publ. Group 1 Each

Functional Melodies Key Curriculum Press/15 
Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-55953-378-2 4 Each

A Graphing Matter Key Curriculum/11
Nasco, # TB17353T 4 Each

Graphic Algebra Key Curriculum/11
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500496 4 Each

More Than Graphs Key Curriculum/12
EAI, Key Curriculum Press, # 500479 4 Each

A Visual Approach to Functions Key 
Curriculum/15 Key Curriculum Press, #978-1-
55953-537-3 

4 Each

The Pattern & Function Connection Key
Curriculum/15, EAI, Key Curriculum Press, 
#500707 

4 Each

Patty Paper Geometry Set Key Curriculum 
Press/31, Key Curriculum Press, # 978-1-
55953- 282-2 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 4-6 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-84-9 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Books 7 Key 
Curriculum Press/62, Key Curriculum Press, 
#978-0-913684-85-6 

4 Each

Key to Geometry A&N Book 8 Key 
Curriculum/62 Key Curriculum Press, #978-0-
973684-86-3 

4 Each

Algebra with Pizzazz
Wright Group, FO-88488-791-X 4 Each

Getting Into Solids Kit Safe-T
Nasco, #TB21313T 5 Each

Exploring Geometry with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-581-6 

4 Each

Exploring Algebra 1 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press #978-1-55953-800-8

4 Each

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Sleek Software Corporation World Research Company
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Bid #12‐065
Math Supplies for New High School

Vendors

Item Description Qty Unit

Exploring Algebra 2 with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-800-8 

4 Each

Exploring Precalculus with The Geometer's 
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-680-6 

4 Each

Exploring Calculus with The Geometer's
Sketchpad Activity Book, Key Curriculum 
Press, #978-1-55953-535-0

4 Each

Compass, Bullseye, Safe-T
Science Kit, #17037-05 30 Each

Dissected Cone
Science Kit, #17175-04 4 Each

Calculus Problems for a New Century- Vol. 2  
Barnes & Noble, #883850842 4 Each

Problems for Student Investigation- Vol. 4
Barnes & Noble, #883850869 4 Each

Learning by Discovery: A Lab Manual for 
Calculus Barnes & Noble, #883850834 4 Each

Catalog Discount
Minimum Order Req

Shipping

Interlocal

Elaine Johnson - Buyer

XX = Does not meet specs or does not meet minimum 
order requirements

Present at Opening: 
Pam Fennell - Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer

Blank cell = No bid

Brand Catalog Unit Price
Ext. 

Price Brand Catalog Unit Price Ext. Price

Sleek Software Corporation World Research Company

0% to 25%
None

none

Yes

0%
$30.00

10% or $9.95 for orders under $100.00

Yes
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