Custodial Equipment and Repair Services
Bid #12-039

Vendors Complete Supply Empire Paper
Qty [ Unit [ Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog #
Section I: Custodial Equipment
20" Automatic Scrubber w/ batteries, charger, Advance Adfinit
and pad holder- Advance BA5321D/Comac 4 EA $4,705.11 $18,820.44 20D y 56371327
Nusource NU20ASBT or equal
Alternate: 20" Automatic Scrubber w/
batteries, charger, and pad holder- Advance .
BA5321D/Comac Nusource NU20ASBT or 4 EA $5,044.89 $20,179.56 w/ gel batteries 56317328
equal
34” Automatic Scrubber w/batteries, charger, Advance Warrior
and pad holder- Advance Converta Max 34 or | 2 EA $8,715.17 $17,430.34 28D 56315546
equal
Rider Scrubber w/batteries, charger, and pad
holder- Advance Hydro-Retriever 2800 or 2 | EA | $10377.10 | $20754.20 |AAVANCe2800STY 5401605
shelf charger
equal
Alternate: Rider Scrubber w/batteries, w/ onboard
charger, and pad holder- Advance Hydro- 2 | EA | $10,672.56 $21,345.12 56601606
; charger
Retriever 2800 or equal
o ) 9060107020, qty.
atachments, Pro Team 1500 or fqual | 40 | EA | 826500 | 1060000 | o (ORI, | 111825440
' g P aty. 12+ $265.00
18" Carpet Extractors- Windsor Clipper 12 8 | EA | $250295 | 2074360 | AdvanceAqua | geoqpngq $2,146.08 | $17,168.64 | Windsor Clipper 12
Carpet Extractor or equal clean 18FLX
) 56115000, qty. 11
gﬁ‘)@g: Er”g”gafans' Advance Hydro- dry 25 | EA | $280.00 $7,000.00 Sd:j’f‘ondcre 11 $295.23, qty.
q ydrodry 12+ $280.47
20" Low Speed Buffers — 1.5 hp/175 rpm Advance
w/pad driver- Powerflite M201HD or equal 5 EA $808.75 $4,043.75 Pacesetter 20HD 01410A
28" Propane Burnisher- Clarke Dust Control
2717BCATCL, 17hp with 20lb. Tank, pad 6 | EA $4,064.32 $24,385.92 | Advance PBU27 56381409
driver and charger. Part# 08993B No
17 Gallon Wet Vac w/Front Mounted Advance
Squeegee - Alto CTV20, Nobles Typhoon w/ 14 | EA $585.00 $8,190.00 AWD320 / 24" 56109593
front mounted squeegee or equal squeegee
Advance
Rider Burnisher w/ batteries, charger, and pad Advolution 2710,
holder- Advance Advolution 27 or equal 2 EA | $12576.14 $25,152.28 shelf & wet 56422003
battery
Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries, on board
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution | 2 | EA | $12,739.20 $25,478.40 charger/ wet 56422004
27 or equal charger




Custodial Equipment and Repair Services
Bid #12-039

Vendors Complete Supply Empire Paper
Qty | Unit [ Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog #
Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries, on board
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution 2 EA | $14,276.82 $28,553.64 charger/ gel 56422185
27 or equal charger
Walk-Behind Scrubber with onboard charger Advance Warrior
option, Advance Warrior 28D. No Substitution L EA $8,862.90 $8,862.90 ST28D 56315548
No Touch Cleaning System - 500 psi with Advance All
blower- Kaivac KV2150 or equal L EA $2,215.23 $2,215.23 Cleaner 56380772
Spot Extractor, 2 gallon Tennant, Nobles 5 EA $651.14 $3.255.70 Advance Aqua 56220000
Anser or equal Spot
Advance Adgility 9060705010, 1-
Back Vacuum, NapSac, Clarke or equal 12 | EA $324.38 $3,892.56 11 $353.86, 12+
10XP
$324.38
Discount off Machines Not Specified 30% 30%
Section Il: Repair Service
Repair service per hour on-site XX
Repair service per hour off-site XX $65.50
Response time for repairs 2 days asap, after taking delivery
Turn around time to complete repairs Variable- based on parts too many variables
Pick up and delivery service? Yes, $49.50 Yes, no charge
Upcharge percentage on parts above cost 30% 40%
Can you perform warranty work? Yes Yes

Brands for warranty repairs

Blue Star, Clarke, Eagle, Kent, Kai Vac, Minuteman, Power-flite,
Pro Team, Sanitaire, Tennant/Nobles, Windsor, Advance, Tornado,
Pullman-Holt

Clarke, Tennant/ Nobles, Windsor, Advance

Minimum Order

N/A

None

Additional Information

EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid

XX = Does not meet specs.
Present at Opening:

Pam Fennell- Buyer

Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk




Custodial Equipment and Repair Services
Bid #12-039

Vendors

JanPak, Inc.

NETD, Inc.

Unit Price

Ext. Price Brand Catalog #

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Brand

Catalog #

Section I: Custodial Equipment

20" Automatic Scrubber w/ batteries, charger,
and pad holder- Advance BA5321D/Comac
Nusource NU20ASBT or equal

$3,552.00

$14,208.00 Advance 56316325

$3,897.75

$15,591.00

Nobles Speed
Scrub, 20" Disk

9002887

Alternate: 20" Automatic Scrubber w/
batteries, charger, and pad holder- Advance
BA5321D/Comac Nusource NU20ASBT or
equal

34” Automatic Scrubber w/batteries, charger,
and pad holder- Advance Converta Max 34 or
equal

$7,802.00

$15,604.00 Advance 56315810

$6,858.95

$13,717.90

Tomcat- Magnum
34" Disk

253-34TD

Rider Scrubber w/batteries, charger, and pad
holder- Advance Hydro-Retriever 2800 or
equal

$10,586.00

$21,172.00 Advance 56601617

$10,347.50

$20,695.00

Nobles- Speed
Scub Rider, 28"
Cylindrical

9001972

Alternate: Rider Scrubber wibatteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Hydro-
Retriever 2800 or equal

Vaccuum Cleaner- Single motor with
attachments. Pro Team 1500 or Equal

$270.00

$10,800.00 ProTeam 1500

$209.20

$8,368.00

Clean Max- Cadet
Series w/ QDT

CMC-QD,
05.123

18" Carpet Extractors- Windsor Clipper 12
Carpet Extractor or equal

$2,174.00

$17,392.00 Advance 56265008

$2,385.00

$19,080.00

Windsor, Clipper
12

CLP12

Carpet Drying Fans- Advance Hydro- dry
Blower or equal

$149.00

$3,725.00 Power Flite PD-500 1/2 hp

$174.00

$4,350.00

Viper- Whiptail

WT3SPD

20" Low Speed Buffers — 1.5 hp/175 rpm
w/pad driver- Powerflite M201HD or equal

$644.00

$3,220.00 Power Flite M201HD-3

$534.00

$2,670.00

Viper- Venom

VN2015

28" Propane Burnisher- Clarke Dust Control
2717BCATCL, 17hp with 20Ib. Tank, pad
driver and charger. Part# 08993B No

$3,787.00

$22,722.00 Advance 08993B

17 Gallon Wet Vac w/Front Mounted
Squeegee - Alto CTV20, Nobles Typhoon w/
front mounted squeegee or equal

$538.00

$7,532.00 Advance 56109594

$630.34

$8,824.76

Nobles-V-WD-15

9008703

Rider Burnisher w/ batteries, charger, and pad
holder- Advance Advolution 27 or equal

$11,869.00

$23,738.00 Advance 56422004

$8,422.80

$16,845.60

Tomcat VHS 27"
Rider Burnisher

255-TXL

Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution
27 or equal




Custodial Equipment and Repair Services

Bid #12-039
Vendors JanPak, Inc. NETD, Inc.

Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog #
Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution
27 or equal
Walk-Behind Scrubber with onboard charger
option, Advance Warrior 28D. No Substitution $8,121.00 $8,121.00 Advance 56315546
No Touch Cleaning System - 500 psi with .
blower- Kaivac KV2150 or equal $1,950.00 $1,950.00 Kaivac KV1250
Spot Extractor, 2 gallon Tennant, Nobles $453.15 $2,265.75 Nobles 9007502 $484.60 $2,423.00 |Nobles EX Spot-2| 9007502
Anser or equal
Back Vacuum, NapSac, Clarke or equal $295.00 $3,540.00 ProTeam 100653 $339.00 $4,068.00 Nobles V BP6 1060830
Discount off Machines Not Specified 20-30% 15-25%
Section Il: Repair Service
Repair service per hour on-site $75.00 $75.00
Repair service per hour off-site $75.00 $75.00 + $64.00 labor
Response time for repairs 1-2 days 1-2 days
Turn around time to complete repairs 1-2 days after receipt of parts 4-5 days
Pick up and delivery service? Yes, normal service call Yes, $100.00 one way
Upcharge percentage on parts above cost 20% 25%
Can you perform warranty work? Yes Yes

Brands for warranty repairs

Clarke, Eagle, Kent, Minuteman, Power-flite, Pro Team, Sanitaire,

Tennant/Nobles, Windsor, Advance

Clarke, Eagle, Kent, KaiVac, Minuteman, Power-flite, Pro Team,
Sanitaire, Tennant/Nobles, Windsor, Advance, Viper, Tomcat

Minimum Order

$150.00

No min., $100 delivery charge

Additional Information

EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid

XX = Does not meet specs.
Present at Opening:

Pam Fennell- Buyer

Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk




Custodial Equipment and Repair Services
Bid #12-039

Vendors Olmstead-Kirk Equipment & Supply Co. Pollock Paper Distributors

Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog #
Section I: Custodial Equipment
20" Automatic Scrubber w/ batteries, charger, N
and pad holder- Advance BA5321D/Comac $5,048.44 $20,193.76 | 'emnantT320 9003581 $4,088.35 | $16,353.40 | '\obles Speed 9002887

Trans Scrub20
Nusource NU20ASBT or equal
Alternate: 20" Automatic Scrubber w/
batteries, charger, and pad holder- Advance
BA5321D/Comac Nusource NU20ASBT or
equal
34” Automatic Scrubber w/batteries, charger, Nobles Speed
and pad holder- Advance Converta Max 34 or $8,004.05 $16,008.10 | Tennant 32" T5 9002576 $7,407.78 $14,815.56 Scrubs?Z 9002591
equal
Rider Scrubber w/batteries, charger, and pad Nobles Speed 26" 9000875, 32"
holder- Advance Hydro-Retriever 2800 or $10,303.44 $20,606.88 Tennant R-14 9001689 $10,418.47 | $20,836.94 >P 9000877,
Scrub Ride On
equal $11,190.34
Alternate: Rider Scrubber w/batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Hydro- $11,190.34 | $22,380.68
Retriever 2800 or equal
Vaccuum Cleaner- Single motor with .
attachments. Pro Team 1500 or Equal $328.14 $13,125.60 | Windsor Axcess 1.012-062.0 $260.45 $10,418.00 | Nobles V-SMU-14 1060829
EX-SC-1020,
18" Carpet Extractors- Windsor Clipper 12 . ’ 9007486, Push
Carpet Extractor or equal $2,146.08 $17,168.64 Windsor CLP12 1.008-025.0 $1,963.64 $15,709.12 Nobles $2260.91, EX-SC-
1020P

Carpet Drying Fans- Advance Hydro- dry $174.40 $4,360.00 | Windsor AM-3 |  1.004-015.0 $189.55 | $4.738.75 | Nobles Blower3 614277
Blower or equal Speed Air Mover
20" Low Speed Buffers — 1.5 hp/175 rpm Nobles FM-20-55
wipad driver- Powerflite M201HD or equal $545.50 $2,727.50 OK 175 AE-21E175 $597.50 $2,987.50 Heavy Duty 20" 907336
28" Propane Burnisher- Clarke Dust Control
2717BCATCL, 17hp with 20lb. Tank, pad $4,064.32 | $24,385.92 | Advance/ Clarke 56381409
driver and charger. Part# 08993B No
17 Gallon Wet Vac w/Front Mounted Tennant T w/ D
Squeegee - Alto CTV20, Nobles Typhoon w/ $583.02 $8,162.28 Vac, w/c 9008703 $833.86 $11,674.04 |Nobles W-WD-16P 9007473
front mounted squeegee or equal squeegee
Rider Burnisher w/ batteries, charger, and pad Windsor Chariot Advance
holder- Advance Advolution 27 or equal $8,590.29 $17,180.58 20" 9.840-046.0 $12,576.14 | $25,152.28 Advolution 2710 56422003
Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution
27 or equal




Custodial Equipment and Repair Services

Bid #12-039
Vendors Olmstead-Kirk Equipment & Supply Co. Pollock Paper Distributors

Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog #
Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution
27 or equal
Walk-Behind Scrubber with onboard charger Nobles Speed
option, Advance Warrior 28D. No Substitution $7,022.22 $7,022.22 Scrub 28" 9002589
No Touch Cleaning System - 500 psi with $2,970.73 $2,970.73 Windsor 1.007-056.0 | $2,778.41 | $2,778.41 | Nobles ASC-15 9007354
blower- Kaivac KV2150 or equal Compass
Spot Extractor, 2 gallon Tennant, Nobles $409.78 $2,048.90 | eMnantEX-Spoty 54754, $437.05 | $2,185.25 | Nobles Ex-Spot-2 9007502
Anser or equal 2

. Pro Team
Back Vacuum, NapSac, Clarke or equal $347.63 $4,171.56 Windsor UP-6 1.014.007.0 $312.38 $3,748.56 106573
Supercoach hcpa
Discount off Machines Not Specified TXMAS pricing.
Section Il: Repair Service
Repair service per hour on-site $55.00
Repair service per hour off-site $55.00
Response time for repairs 24 to 48 hours
Turn around time to complete repairs 5 days
Pick up and delivery service? Yes, $25.00 cord electric, $50.00 scrubber & propane
Upcharge percentage on parts above cost 25%
Can you perform warranty work? Yes
Brands f . Blue Star, Clarke, Kent, Minuteman, Power-flite, Pro Team, Sanitaire,
rands for warranty repairs Tennant/Nobles, Windsor, Advance

Minimum Order $200.00 N/A
Additional Information TXMAS pricing.
EPCNT

Blank cell = No bid

XX = Does not meet specs.
Present at Opening:

Pam Fennell- Buyer

Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk




Custodial Equipment and Repair Services
Bid #12-039

Vendors

Professional Polish

R&H Parts and Service, Inc.

Unit Price

Ext. Price Brand Catalog #

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Brand

Catalog #

Section |: Custodial Equipment

20" Automatic Scrubber w/ batteries, charger,
and pad holder- Advance BA5321D/Comac
Nusource NU20ASBT or equal

$3,544.30

Clarke Focus 11,

$20 05331A

$14,177.20

$5,140.00

$20,560.00

Advance
Adfinity 20D

56317327

Alternate: 20" Automatic Scrubber w/
batteries, charger, and pad holder- Advance
BA5321D/Comac Nusource NU20ASBT or
equal

34” Automatic Scrubber w/batteries, charger,
and pad holder- Advance Converta Max 34 or
equal

$6,890.95

Clarke Focus I,

Disc 34 05411A

$13,781.90

$9,918.75

$19,837.50

Advance
SC800 34DST

56112457

Rider Scrubber w/batteries, charger, and pad
holder- Advance Hydro-Retriever 2800 or
equal

$10,064.00

Clarke Focus 28

. 0318K242
Disc

$20,128.00

$11,415.00

$22,830.00

Advance 2800
DT

56601605

Alternate: Rider Scrubber w/batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Hydro-
Retriever 2800 or equal

Vaccuum Cleaner- Single motor with
attachments. Pro Team 1500 or Equal

$157.30

Clarke Reliavac

12 03002A

$6,292.00

$395.00

$15,800.00

Tornado CV30

10231850

18" Carpet Extractors- Windsor Clipper 12
Carpet Extractor or equal

$1,283.00

Clarke Clean

Track 12 56265230

$10,264.00

$1,973.25

$15,786.00

Advance
Aquaclean
16ST

56265003

Carpet Drying Fans- Advance Hydro- dry
Blower or equal

$213.50

$5,337.50 Clarke Carpet Fan 04130D

$170.00

$4,250.00

Viper Whiptail

WT3SPD

20" Low Speed Buffers — 1.5 hp/175 rpm
w/pad driver- Powerflite M201HD or equal

$573.00

Clarke CFP2000

Buffer 01400A

$2,865.00

$640.00

$3,200.00

Power-flite

M201HD

28" Propane Burnisher- Clarke Dust Control
2717BCATCL, 17hp with 20Ib. Tank, pad
driver and charger. Part# 08993B No

$3,576.00

Clarke Propane

Burnisher 089938

$21,456.00

17 Gallon Wet Vac w/Front Mounted
Squeegee - Alto CTV20, Nobles Typhoon w/
front mounted squeegee or equal

$478.50

Clarke Summit 20

Sq 02186A

$6,699.00

$500.00

$7,000.00

Viper Shovel
Nose

SNL18

Rider Burnisher w/ batteries, charger, and pad
holder- Advance Advolution 27 or equal

$13,833.75

$27,667.50

Advance 2710

56422003

Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution
27 or equal




Custodial Equipment and Repair Services
Bid #12-039

Vendors Professional Polish R&H Parts and Service, Inc.

Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Ext. Price Brand Catalog #
Alternate: Rider Burnisher w/ batteries,
charger, and pad holder- Advance Advolution
27 or equal
Walk-Behind Scrubber with onboard charger Clarke Focus I Advance
option, Advance Warrior 28D. No Substitution $6,608.24 $6,608.24 Disc 28 05401A $9.586.68 $9.586.68 Warrior ST28D 56315546
No Touch Cleaning System - 500 psi with $2,129.40 $2,129.40 | Clarke TFC400 | 56380773 $3902518 | $302518 |AdvanceReel | oo 48050
blower- Kaivac KV2150 or equal Cleaner
Spot Extractor, 2 gallon Tennant, Nobles $703.20 $3.516.00 Clarke B Extspot 04154A $690.00 $3.450.00 Advance
Anser or equal Deluxe Aquaspot

Clarke Comfort Pro Team

Back Vacuum, NapSac, Clarke or equal $259.50 $3,114.00 Pak 10 w/ tools 906707010 $420.00 $5,040.00 Supercoach
Discount off Machines Not Specified Varies
Section |l: Repair Service
Repair service per hour on-site XX $52.50
Repair service per hour off-site XX $52.50
Response time for repairs 1 day 2 days
Turn around time to complete repairs 1-2 days 2 days
Pick up and delivery service? Yes, $60.00 Yes, no charge
Upcharge percentage on parts above cost cost plus 20% Varies
Can you perform warranty work? Yes Yes, no charge

Brands for warranty repairs

Blue Star, Clarke, Eagle, Kent, KaiVac, Minuteman, Power-flite, Pro
Team, Sanitaire, Tennant/Nobles, Windsor, Advance

Blue Star, Clarke, Eagle, Kent, KaiVac, Minuteman, Power-flite,
Pro Team, Sanitaire, Tennant/Nobles, Windsor, Advance

Minimum Order 1 Unit None
Additional Information
EPCNT Yes

Blank cell = No bid

XX = Does not meet specs.
Present at Opening:

Pam Fennell- Buyer

Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk




