
Bid #12‐036
Copy Paper

Qty Unit Unit Price Extended Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Extended Price Brand Catalog #

Dual Purpose White Paper - 8 1/2"x11", 20 
lb, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 92 
brightness.  Do not bid Fascopy #212972

100,800 Ream $2.60 $262,080.00  Boise Multipurpose 8511BMP $2.544 $256,435.20  Hi Tec HiTec811W

VENDORS

Less than carton ‐ 16 carton price; 1 carton or more‐ 20%

None off the floor

N/A
TL‐ request 5‐7 days

Long Beach, CA; Central Dauphin, PA; Cartwright, AZ

No

Shipping Charges FOB
5‐10 days

Additional Information
Can deliver sooner if required; Firm for 90 days, 11‐1‐2011 to 01‐31‐
2012; Possible 6% max quarterly escalator, duration of contract

The stated delivery schedule will be followed

Present at Opening: 

Delivery time frame after receipt of order

Current School District Contracts

EPCNT

Northeast ISD

P.O.#, contact name, phone number, requested delivery date

Yes

Catalog Discount for all other paper items

Liberty Paper

0%

Per bid specifications

Clampitt Paper Co.

Brad Barker - Distribution

Shelley Freeman- Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer
Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk
Al Betzel - Distribution Supervisor

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs.

Special Instructions

Minimum Order
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Bid #12‐036
Copy Paper

Qty Unit

Dual Purpose White Paper - 8 1/2"x11", 20 
lb, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 92 
brightness.  Do not bid Fascopy #212972

100,800 Ream

VENDORS

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

Present at Opening: 

Delivery time frame after receipt of order

Current School District Contracts

EPCNT

Catalog Discount for all other paper items

Brad Barker - Distribution

Shelley Freeman- Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer
Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk
Al Betzel - Distribution Supervisor

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs.

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Unit Price Extended Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Extended Price Brand Catalog #

$2.77  $279,216.00  GP Spectrum 999705LA $2.637  $265,809.60  Boise X‐9 P10X9001‐CTN

Office Max, Inc.

$50.00 for No Surcharge

$5.95 if less than $50.00
Truck load paper requires several days

Need a name to direct orders to on p.o.

NoYes

None
7-10 Business days

Office Depot's response is contigent upon customer's acceptance 
of pricing, terms and conditions as set forth in the TCPN Master 

Agreement; Paper pricing will be held for 90 days from the 
effective date, and thereafter will fluctuate with market conditions.

Multiple Nationwide, Cedar Hill

Office Depot, Inc.

Discount based on TCPN contract

None

Page 2 of 5



Bid #12‐036
Copy Paper

Qty Unit

Dual Purpose White Paper - 8 1/2"x11", 20 
lb, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 92 
brightness.  Do not bid Fascopy #212972

100,800 Ream

VENDORS

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

Present at Opening: 

Delivery time frame after receipt of order

Current School District Contracts

EPCNT

Catalog Discount for all other paper items

Brad Barker - Distribution

Shelley Freeman- Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer
Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk
Al Betzel - Distribution Supervisor

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs.

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Unit Price Extended Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price Extended Price Brand Catalog #

$2.65 $267,120.00
Boise White 
Xerographic 
Copy Paper

$2.819 $284,155.20  CS140502

Yes

Price quoted is firm for the truck deliveries stated in bid.

Yes

5-7 Days

Prices firm through 12/31/2011, thereafter, only a manfacturer's 
increase will apply; full truck loads only.  840 cases per truck.

N/A
10 Business days

Dallas, Plano, El Paso

Min. $250.00 prepaid or $20.00 delivery for less than or will-call.

Belton, Temple, Kelleen, Coppuras Cove

Perry Office Plus

N/A

Olmsted-Kirk Paper Co.

15% off except for Section F

Full cartons only Truckload
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Bid #12‐036
Copy Paper

Qty Unit

Dual Purpose White Paper - 8 1/2"x11", 20 
lb, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 92 
brightness.  Do not bid Fascopy #212972

100,800 Ream

VENDORS

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

Present at Opening: 

Delivery time frame after receipt of order

Current School District Contracts

EPCNT

Catalog Discount for all other paper items

Brad Barker - Distribution

Shelley Freeman- Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer
Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk
Al Betzel - Distribution Supervisor

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs.

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Unit Price Extended 
Price

Brand Catalog # Unit Price Extended Price Brand Catalog # Unit Price

No Bid $2.655  $267,624.00  Econosource U50202 $2.625

Unisource Worldwide, Inc.

10% Shelf pricing

Copy paper full truckload (840 cartons); catalog orders min. $500.00

Catalog orders below $500.00- full freight charge
Stock items 3-10 ARO

McKinney, De

Yes

Region 7, Houston, San Antonio, Windham, Midland

Attention: Carol Kelsay (on all p.o.'s)

Yes

Include Quill Bid #11-17809 on all P.O.'s

Tailgate
1-2 Business Days

N/A

Quill Corp.

15% Column Discounts (see bid for exceptions)

10 Day ad
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Bid #12‐036
Copy Paper

Qty Unit

Dual Purpose White Paper - 8 1/2"x11", 20 
lb, long grain, 500 sheets per ream, 92 
brightness.  Do not bid Fascopy #212972

100,800 Ream

VENDORS

Shipping Charges

Additional Information

Present at Opening: 

Delivery time frame after receipt of order

Current School District Contracts

EPCNT

Catalog Discount for all other paper items

Brad Barker - Distribution

Shelley Freeman- Purchasing Director
Pam Fennell- Buyer
Heather Cox - Buyer
Shernita McMillan- Purchasing Clerk
Al Betzel - Distribution Supervisor

Blank cell = No bid
XX = Does not meet specs.

Special Instructions

Minimum Order

Extended Price Brand Catalog #

$264,600.00 Domtar 2750

10%

None

None
10 Days for truckloads

enton, Ft. Worth, Plano, Allen, Mesquite, Lewisville, 
Coppell, Northwest, Dallas

Western- BRW Paper Co.

vance notice for direct shipments of copy paper

Yes
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