Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

Amsan

Central Poly Corp.

Qty.

Unit

Unit Cost

Extended Cost

Brand

Catalog
Number

Unit Cost

Extended
Cost

Brand

Catalog
Number

Single-Ply Sheet, jumbo rolls, SCA Product
TJ912A or equal, must fit SCA dispenser,
twelve (12) rolls per case, 3.55” X 2000

900

Case

$27.88

$25,092.00

Bay West

2001

$23.19

$20,871.00

Atlas

A710

Two-Ply Sheet, SCA Product TJ922A or
equal, must fit SCA dispenser, twelve (12)
rolls per case, 3.55”x 1000’

1100

Case

$22.60

$24,860.00

Bay West

10020

$23.29

$25,619.00

Atlas

A700

Roll Towel, Natural,SCA Product RK80OE or
equal, 7.857 wide maximum, 800’ roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

2220

Case

$17.90

$39,738.00

Bay West

45800

$21.99

$48,817.80

Von Drehie

VD880ON

Roll Towel, bleached, SCA Product RB800 or
equal. 7.857 wide maximum, 800-foot roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

20

Case

$28.00

$560.00

Bay West

31400

$26.10

$522.00

Von Drehie

vD880B

Multi-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, 1-ply, SCA Product MB540A or equal,
sixteen (16) packages per case, 250 each per
package, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
9.5”

370

Case

$18.20

$6,734.00

Bay West

48190

$15.99

$5,916.30

Kruger

1920

Single-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, SCA Product SB1840A or equal, 250
towels per package, sixteen (16) packages
per case, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
10.25”

170

Case

$19.00

$3,230.00

Bay West

47300

XX

XX

Putney

P600B

Seat Covers, Discreet Seat™, #DS5000 ONLY.
Half-fold, disposable paper toilet seat
covers, twenty (20) per package, 250
packages per case, 5000 covers per case

100

Case

Page 1 0of 14




Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>> Amsan Central Poly Corp.
Catalo Extended Catalo
Qty. Unit | Unit Cost| Extended Cost Brand & Unit Cost Brand &

Number Cost Number

Catalog Discount 25% 5%

Provide Dispensers? Did not answer No

Interlocal Agreement? Yes Yes

Minimums Yes $100.00

Freight None $8.00 per case if order less than $100.00

Hot Shot Services

Yes, no charge listed, order must be placed before
10:00 a.m.

Yes, $250.

Blank Cell under "Unit Cost" = No Bid
"XX" under "Unit Cost" = Item does not meet bid

Note: Xpedex and Empire Paper Company were not
awarded roll towel, bleached due to minimim order
requirements.

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer
Don Roth, Voss Lighting
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

CleanCare, Inc.

Diversified Chemical and Supply, Inc.

Qty.

Unit

Unit Cost

Extended
Cost

Brand

Catalog
Number

Unit Cost

Catalog

Brand
ran Number

Extended Cost

Single-Ply Sheet, jumbo rolls, SCA Product
TJ912A or equal, must fit SCA dispenser,
twelve (12) rolls per case, 3.55” X 2000

900

Case

$25.00

$22,500.00

CT Commercial

JRT

$26.72

$24,048.00 SCA TI912A

Two-Ply Sheet, SCA Product TJ922A or
equal, must fit SCA dispenser, twelve (12)
rolls per case, 3.55”x 1000’

1100

Case

$20.23

$22,253.00

CT Commercial

JRT 3810

$23.67

$26,037.00 SCA TJ922A

Roll Towel, Natural,SCA Product RK80OE or
equal, 7.857 wide maximum, 800’ roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

2220

Case

$18.75

$41,625.00

CT Commercial

RTK 800

$18.02

$40,004.40 SCA RK800E

Roll Towel, bleached, SCA Product RB800 or
equal. 7.857 wide maximum, 800-foot roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

20

Case

$20.85

$417.00

CT Commercial

RTW 800'
White

$22.17

$443.40 SCA RB800

Multi-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, 1-ply, SCA Product MB540A or equal,
sixteen (16) packages per case, 250 each per
package, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
9.5”

370

Case

$17.39

$6,434.30

CT Commercial

MFW 4000

$16.91

$6,256.70 SCA MB540A

Single-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, SCA Product SB1840A or equal, 250
towels per package, sixteen (16) packages
per case, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
10.25”

170

Case

$18.40

$3,128.00 SCA SB1840A

Seat Covers, Discreet Seat™, #DS5000 ONLY.
Half-fold, disposable paper toilet seat
covers, twenty (20) per package, 250
packages per case, 5000 covers per case

100

Case

$29.95

$2,995.00

Total Products

Gold Max GM
2100-1

$26.60

$2,660.00 Hospeco DS-5000

Page 3 of 14




Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>> CleanCare, Inc. Diversified Chemical and Supply, Inc.
Extended Catalo Catalo
Qty. Unit | Unit Cost Brand & Unit Cost| Extended Cost Brand &
Cost Number Number

Catalog Discount 30%

Provide Dispensers? No Not answered

Interlocal Agreement? Yes Yes

Minimums None $300.00

Freight $5.00 per order Not answered

Hot Shot Services

rates.

Yes. "Hot Shot" services will be charged standard FedEx

Yes, cost will be best price depending on quantity of
product to be delivered.

Blank Cell under "Unit Cost" = No Bid
"XX" under "Unit Cost" = Item does not meet bid

Note: Xpedex and Empire Paper Company were not
awarded roll towel, bleached due to minimim order
requirements.

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer
Don Roth, Voss Lighting
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>> Empire Paper Company Express Image Paper Company

Catalo Catalo
& Unit Cost | Extended Cost Brand &

ty. | Unit |Unit Cost| Extended Cost Brand
Qty ni nit Cost| Extended Cos ran Number Number

Single-Ply Sheet, jumbo rolls, SCA Product
TJ912A or equal, must fit SCA dispenser, 900 Case | $24.84 $22,356.00 SCA TJ0912A $19.75 $17,775.00 SCA TI912A
twelve (12) rolls per case, 3.55” X 2000

Two-Ply Sheet, SCA Product TJ922A or
equal, must fit SCA dispenser, twelve (12) 1100 | Case | $22.20 $24,420.00 SCA TJ0922A $19.49 $21,439.00 SCA TJ922A
rolls per case, 3.55”x 1000’

Roll Towel, Natural,SCA Product RK80OE or
equal, 7.857 wide maximum, 800’ roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

2220 | Case | $16.90 $37,518.00 SCA RK80OE $16.33 $36,252.60 SCA RK800E

Roll Towel, bleached, SCA Product RB800 or
equal. 7.857 wide maximum, 800-foot roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

20 Case | $21.00 $420.00 SCA RB800 $21.32 $426.40 SCA RB800

Multi-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, 1-ply, SCA Product MB540A or equal,
sixteen (16) packages per case, 250 each per| 370 Case | $16.01 $5,923.70 SCA MB540A $15.90 $5,883.00 SCA MB540A
package, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
9.5”

Single-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, SCA Product SB1840A or equal, 250
towels per package, sixteen (16) packages 170 | Case | $17.42 $2,961.40 SCA SB1840A $17.47 $2,969.90 SCA SB1840A
per case, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
10.25"

Seat Covers, Discreet Seat™, #DS5000 ONLY.
Half-fold, disposable paper toilet seat Discreet
100 Case | $35.70 $3,570.00 Hospeco DS5000 $38.88 $3,888.00 DS-5000
covers, twenty (20) per package, 250 Seat

packages per case, 5000 covers per case
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>> Empire Paper Company Express Image Paper Company
Catalo Catalo
Qty. Unit |Unit Cost| Extended Cost Brand & Unit Cost | Extended Cost Brand &

Number Number

Catalog Discount 40%

Provide Dispensers? Yes Not answered

Interlocal Agreement? Yes Yes

Minimums $1,000.00 None

Freight None Free

Hot Shot Services No No

Blank Cell under "Unit Cost" = No Bid
"XX" under "Unit Cost" = Item does not meet bid

Note: Xpedex and Empire Paper Company were not
awarded roll towel, bleached due to minimim order
requirements.

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer
Don Roth, Voss Lighting
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

Gulf Coast Paper

Jan Pak Solutions - DFW

Qty.

Unit

Unit Cost

Extended Cost

Brand

Catalog
Number

Unit Cost

Extended Cost

Brand

Catalog
Number

Single-Ply Sheet, jumbo rolls, SCA Product
TJ912A or equal, must fit SCA dispenser,
twelve (12) rolls per case, 3.55” X 2000

900

Case

$32.97

$29,673.00

SCA

TI912A

$24.85

$22,365.00

SCA

TI912A

Two-Ply Sheet, SCA Product TJ922A or
equal, must fit SCA dispenser, twelve (12)
rolls per case, 3.55”x 1000’

1100

Case

$25.88

$28,468.00

SCA

TJ922A

$22.00

$24,200.00

SCA

TJ922A

Roll Towel, Natural,SCA Product RK80OE or
equal, 7.857 wide maximum, 800’ roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

2220

Case

$20.71

$45,976.20

SCA

RK800E

$16.75

$37,185.00

SCA

RK800E

Roll Towel, bleached, SCA Product RB800 or
equal. 7.857 wide maximum, 800-foot roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

20

Case

$24.41

$488.20

SCA

RB80O

Multi-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, 1-ply, SCA Product MB540A or equal,
sixteen (16) packages per case, 250 each per
package, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
9.5”

370

Case

$18.53

$6,856.10

SCA

MB540A

$15.75

$5,827.50

SCA

MB540A

Single-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, SCA Product SB1840A or equal, 250
towels per package, sixteen (16) packages
per case, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
10.25”

170

Case

$23.00

$3,910.00

SCA

SB1840A

$17.10

$2,907.00

SCA

SB1840A

Seat Covers, Discreet Seat™, #DS5000 ONLY.
Half-fold, disposable paper toilet seat
covers, twenty (20) per package, 250
packages per case, 5000 covers per case

100

Case

$25.25

$2,525.00

Discreet
Seat
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>> Gulf Coast Paper Jan Pak Solutions - DFW
Catalo Catalo
Qty. Unit |Unit Cost| Extended Cost| Brand & Unit Cost | Extended Cost Brand &

Number Number

Catalog Discount 25% 25%

Provide Dispensers? Yes Yes

Interlocal Agreement? Yes Yes

Minimums $100.00 $150.00

Freight $2.80 fuel charge per purchase order None

Hot Shot Services

No

Yes, no additional cost.

Blank Cell under "Unit Cost" = No Bid
"XX" under "Unit Cost" = Item does not meet bid

Note: Xpedex and Empire Paper Company were not
awarded roll towel, bleached due to minimim order
requirements.

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer
Don Roth, Voss Lighting
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

Olmsted-Kirk Equipment and Supply Company

Pollock Paper Distributors

Qty.

Unit

Catalog

Unit Cost | Extended Cost| Brand
Number

Unit Cost

Extended Cost| Brand

Catalog
Number

Single-Ply Sheet, jumbo rolls, SCA Product
TJ912A or equal, must fit SCA dispenser,
twelve (12) rolls per case, 3.55” X 2000

900

Case

$26.78 $24,102.00 SCA TJ0912A

$25.43

$22,887.00 SCA

TIO912A

Two-Ply Sheet, SCA Product TJ922A or
equal, must fit SCA dispenser, twelve (12)
rolls per case, 3.55”x 1000’

1100

Case

$23.73 $26,103.00 SCA TJ0922A

$22.52

$24,772.00 SCA

TJ0922A

Roll Towel, Natural,SCA Product RK80OE or
equal, 7.857 wide maximum, 800’ roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

2220

Case

$18.06 $40,093.20 SCA RK80OE

$17.23

$38,250.60 SCA

RK800E

Roll Towel, bleached, SCA Product RB800 or
equal. 7.857 wide maximum, 800-foot roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

20

Case

$22.23 $444.60 SCA RB80O

$21.10

$422.00 SCA

RB800

Multi-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, 1-ply, SCA Product MB540A or equal,
sixteen (16) packages per case, 250 each per
package, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
9.5”

370

Case

$16.95 $6,271.50 SCA MB540A

$16.24

$6,008.80 SCA

MB540A

Single-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, SCA Product SB1840A or equal, 250
towels per package, sixteen (16) packages
per case, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
10.25"

170

Case

$18.45 $3,136.50 SCA SB1840A

$17.60

$2,992.00 SCA

SB1840A

Seat Covers, Discreet Seat™, #DS5000 ONLY.
Half-fold, disposable paper toilet seat
covers, twenty (20) per package, 250
packages per case, 5000 covers per case

100

Case

$46.55 $4,655.00 SCA DS5000
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

Olmsted-Kirk Equipment and Supply Company

Pollock Paper Distributors

Qty.

Unit

Catalog

Unit Cost | Extended Cost| Brand
Number

Catalog

Unit Cost | Extended Cost| Brand
Number

Catalog Discount

10%

35-55%

Provide Dispensers?

Not answered

Not answered

Interlocal Agreement? Yes Yes
Minimums $200.00 None
Freight None None

Hot Shot Services

Yes, price depends on place and amount of
delivery.

Yes, all shipping/delivery charges are added to
invoice for order.

Blank Cell under "Unit Cost" = No Bid

"XX" under "Unit Cost" = Item does not meet bid

Note: Xpedex and Empire Paper Company were not
awarded roll towel, bleached due to minimim order

requirements.

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer
Don Roth, Voss Lighting
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

Pyramid School Products

Quill Corporation

Qty.

Unit

Unit Cost

Extended Cost Brand

Catalog
Number

Unit Cost

Extended Cost

Brand

Catalog
Number

Single-Ply Sheet, jumbo rolls, SCA Product
TJ912A or equal, must fit SCA dispenser,
twelve (12) rolls per case, 3.55” X 2000

900

Case

Two-Ply Sheet, SCA Product TJ922A or
equal, must fit SCA dispenser, twelve (12)
rolls per case, 3.55”x 1000’

1100

Case

Roll Towel, Natural,SCA Product RK80OE or
equal, 7.857 wide maximum, 800’ roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

2220

Case

Roll Towel, bleached, SCA Product RB800 or
equal. 7.857 wide maximum, 800-foot roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

20

Case

Multi-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, 1-ply, SCA Product MB540A or equal,
sixteen (16) packages per case, 250 each per
package, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
9.5”

370

Case

$19.13

$7,078.10

Quill

BID7MFTB4000

Single-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, SCA Product SB1840A or equal, 250
towels per package, sixteen (16) packages
per case, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
10.25”

170

Case

$24.82

$4,219.40

Envision

BID20904Q

Seat Covers, Discreet Seat™, #DS5000 ONLY.
Half-fold, disposable paper toilet seat
covers, twenty (20) per package, 250
packages per case, 5000 covers per case

100

Case

$32.98

Hospeco
$3,298.00 Discreet
Seat

DS5000
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>> Pyramid School Products Quill Corporation
Catalo Catalo
Qty. Unit | Unit Cost | Extended Cost Brand & Unit Cost | Extended Cost| Brand &

Number Number

Catalog Discount 15% 15%

Provide Dispensers? Yes No

Interlocal Agreement? Yes Yes

Minimums $95.00 None

Freight Under $95.00 - $10.00 charge None

Hot Shot Services No No

Blank Cell under "Unit Cost" = No Bid
"XX" under "Unit Cost" = Item does not meet bid

Note: Xpedex and Empire Paper Company were not
awarded roll towel, bleached due to minimim order
requirements.

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer
Don Roth, Voss Lighting
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

Xpedx

Qty.

Unit

Unit Cost

Extended Cost| Brand

Catalog
Number

Single-Ply Sheet, jumbo rolls, SCA Product
TJ912A or equal, must fit SCA dispenser,
twelve (12) rolls per case, 3.55” X 2000

900

Case

$25.10

$22,590.00

SCA

TJ0912A

Two-Ply Sheet, SCA Product TJ922A or
equal, must fit SCA dispenser, twelve (12)
rolls per case, 3.55”x 1000’

1100

Case

$22.23

$24,453.00

SCA

TJ0922A

Roll Towel, Natural,SCA Product RK80OE or
equal, 7.857 wide maximum, 800’ roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

2220

Case

$16.92

$37,562.40

SCA

RK80OE

Roll Towel, bleached, SCA Product RB800 or
equal. 7.857 wide maximum, 800-foot roll
minimum, must fit SCA dispenser, six (6)
rolls per case

20

Case

$20.83

$416.60

SCA

RB80O

Multi-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, 1-ply, SCA Product MB540A or equal,
sixteen (16) packages per case, 250 each per
package, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
9.5”

370

Case

$15.88

$5,875.60

SCA

MB540A

Single-fold Towel, bleached, wet-strength
type, SCA Product SB1840A or equal, 250
towels per package, sixteen (16) packages
per case, 4000 towels per case, 9.125” X
10.25”

170

Case

$17.29

$2,939.30

SCA

SB1840A

Seat Covers, Discreet Seat™, #DS5000 ONLY.
Half-fold, disposable paper toilet seat
covers, twenty (20) per package, 250
packages per case, 5000 covers per case

100

Case

$25.26

$2,526.00

SCA

DS5000
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Bid Number 11-050
Custodial Papers

VENDOR NAME >>>

Xpedx

Qty.

Unit

Catalog

Unit Cost| Extended Cost| Brand
Number

Catalog Discount

Provide Dispensers?

Not answered

Interlocal Agreement? Yes
Minimums $500.00
Freight None

Hot Shot Services

Yes, depends on order. Freight will be quoted.

Blank Cell under "Unit Cost" = No Bid
"XX" under "Unit Cost" = Item does not meet bid

Note: Xpedex and Empire Paper Company were not
awarded roll towel, bleached due to minimim order
requirements.

Present at Opening:
Dottie Morrow, Buyer
Don Roth, Voss Lighting
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